
Board Meeting Agenda

Date: November 4, 2020 - 4:00 PM

Location: Administration Building
Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

A. CALL TO ORDER 

B. ROLL CALL 

C. STATEMENT    Compliance with the Open Public Meetings Act 

D. THE PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE AND PRAYER 

E. PROCLAMATIONS 

1. Proclaiming Tuesday, November 13, 2020 as "Certified Home Health Aide Day" in 
Ocean County and formally recognizing Barbara Curran Guarino as the "Ocean 
County Certified Home Health Aide of the Year". 

2. Proclaiming November 2020 as "National Family Caregiver Month" in Ocean 
County. 

F. RESOLUTION - PUBLIC HEARING 

1. Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory 
Committee to accept the donation of property identified as Block 2507, Lots 9 & 15-
17 and Block 3802, Lots 20-22, 24 & 25 totaling approximately 0.92 acres located on 
West Fish Road and Broadway Road in the Township of Jackson. 
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2. Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory 
Committee related to the acquisition of property identified as Block 59, Lot 734.01 in 
the Township of Toms River totaling approximately 9.68 acres located on Whitesville 
Road, in an amount not to exceed $750,000.00 plus up to $1,400.00 for property tax 
adjustments. 

G. AUTHORIZING THE PAYMENT OF BILLS IN BILL COMMITTEE REPORT NO. 21. 

H. AUTHORIZING ENGINEERING PAYMENTS TO CONTRACTORS AS LISTED 
BELOW: 

1. EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Brick 
Boulevard and Hooper Avenue, Brick and Toms River Townships - Partial Estimate 
#2, $665,916.95. (B2020-100E) 

2. MIDLANTIC CONSTRUCTION, LLC - Construction of Barnegat Branch Trail 
Phase VII from South Street to the Cedar Creek, Lacey and Berkeley Townships - 
Final Estimate #6, $109,575.18. (B2018-143E) 

3. MIDLANTIC CONSTRUCTION, LLC - Replacement of Ridgeway Boulevard 
Bridge (Structure No. 1518-002), Ridgeway Boulevard over the Ridgeway Branch of 
the Toms River, Manchester Township - Partial Estimate #8, $243,313.46. (B2019-
127E) 

4. P&A CONSTRUCTION, INC. - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Central Avenue 
between 23rd and 28th Street, Borough of Ship Bottom - Partial Estimate #3, 
$55,527.98. (B2019-59E) 

5. A.E. STONE, INC. - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County 
Roads, Contract 2018B - Partial Estimate #1, $767,309.29. (B2020-50E) 

I. RESOLUTIONS 

1. Authorizing the Personnel Resolution. 

2. Authorizing transfers between current account balances. 

3. Authorizing an amendment to the 2020 Budget for the program entitled Center for 
Tech and Civic Life COVID-19 Response Grant - County Clerk, in the amount of 
$150,135.00. 

4. Authorizing an amendment to the 2020 Budget for the program entitled Center for 
Tech and Civic Life COVID-19 Response Grant - Election Board, in the amount of 
$300,269.00. 

5. Authorizing an amendment to the 2020 Budget for the program entitled Area Plan III 
E State FY20, in the amount of $26.00. 

6. Authorizing an amendment to the 2020 Budget for the program entitled Ocean 
County Area Plan Grant FY20, in the amount of $103,681.00. 

7. Authorizing an amendment to the 2020 Budget for the program entitled Ocean Area 
Plan State FY20, in the amount of $4,351.00. 
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8. Authorizing an amendment to the 2020 Budget for the program entitled USDA FY20, 
in the amount of $516.00. 

9. Authorizing an amendment to the 2020 Budget for the program entitled Operation 
Helping Hand FY19/20, in the amount of $62,500.00. 

10. Authorizing the execution of sixteen (16) Memorandums of Agreement with Forensic 
Nurse Examiners for the OC Prosecutor's Office Sexual Assault Response Team / 
Forensic Nurse Examiner (S.A.R.T./F.N.E.) program, for the period of 10/1/2020 
through 12/31/2020. 

11. Authorizing the execution of sixteen (16) Memorandums of Agreement with Forensic 
Nurse Examiners for the OC Prosecutor's Office Sexual Assault Response Team / 
Forensic Nurse Examiner (S.A.R.T./F.N.E.) program, for the period of 1/1/2021 
through 12/31/2021. 

12. Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the Ocean County Vocational-
Technical School to provide Schedule "C" Vehicle Services Department services, in 
an amount not to exceed $70,000.00, pending adoption of the 2021 Temporary 
Budget, for the period of 1/01/2021 through 12/31/2021. 

13. Authorizing the execution of the 2021 Area Plan Contract with the New Jersey 
Department of Human Services, Division of Aging Services, for the period of 
1/1/2021 through 12/31/2021. 

14. Authorizing the execution of a Letter of Agreement to participate in the FY2021 
Alliance to Prevent Alcoholism and Drug Abuse Grant, in the amount of $215,940.00, 
for the period of 10/1/2020 through 6/30/2021. 

15. Authorizing the decrease in funding for the Opioid Recovery Employment Program 
FY20 Grant, in the amount of $100,000.00. 

16. Authorizing the reduction in funding of the Grant entitled Ocean Area 
Comprehensive FY20, due to decreased funding by the State of New Jersey, 
Department of Human Services, Division of Aging Services, in the amount of 
$3,804.00. 

17. Authorizing the reduction in funding of the Grant entitled Area Plan III-E Admin 
FY20, due to decreased funding by the State of New Jersey, Department of Human 
Services, Division of Aging Services, in the amount of $931.00. 

18. Authorizing a modification to the First-Time Homebuyer Program, to include new 
participants, as recommended by the OC Planning Director. (CC2018-54) 

19. Authorizing the Sale of a Canine from the Ocean County Sheriff's K-9 Unit, no 
longer needed for County purposes, to Suzanne Fitch. 

20. Establishing the 2021 Meeting Schedule for the "Ocean County Board of 
Commissioners." 

21. Supporting the Borough of Point Pleasant Beach's submission of an application for 
New Jersey Department of Transportation - Transportation Set-Aside Alternatives 
Grant Program funding to make infrastructure improvements that will enhance the 
revitalization, safety and aesthetic qualities of the Channel Drive Revitalization 
Project that may impact Broadway (County Road 635) and Baltimore Avenue 
(County Road 71) within the Borough of Point Pleasant Beach. 
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22. Authorizing the execution of a Grant application/agreement with the New Jersey 
Department of Transportation for the project entitled Replacement of Duck Farm 
Bridge (Structure No. 1506-013), Hooper Avenue (C.R. 631) over Cedar Bridge 
Branch of the Metedeconk River, Brick Township. 

23. Authorizing the execution of a Cost Reimbursement Agreement with the New Jersey 
Department of Transportation for the project entitled Garden State Parkway 
Interchange 83 Improvements, Toms River Township, County of Ocean, Federal 
Project No. STBGP-0571(301), Agreement No. 2020-DT-BLA-305. 

24. Authorizing the execution of Agreement Modification No. 2 with the New Jersey 
Department of Transportation for the project entitled Construction of Horizontal 
Curve High Friction Surface Treatment, Berkeley, Lacey, Ocean and Plumsted 
Townships, Ocean County, Federal Project No. STP-D00S (200), Agreement No. 
2018-DT-BLA-316. 

25. Authorizing the execution of an Agreement with CBRC Holdings, LLC for the 
roadway improvements and traffic signal modifications along the frontage of Lot 
1.04, Block 961.02, Cedar Bridge Avenue and Avenue of the States, Lakewood 
Township. 

26. Authorizing the execution of a Shared Services Agreement with the Township of 
Brick for the paving of a portion of Laurel Avenue, Township of Brick. 

J. MOTIONS 

1. Authorizing the Clerk of the Board to accept and/or record legal instruments. 

2. Approving the Pre-Board Meeting Minutes of 8/26/2020. 

3. Approving the Board Meeting Minutes of 10/7/2020. 

4. Authorizing the distribution of Requests for Proposals and/or Requests for 
Qualifications as follows: 1.) Auditing Services; 2.) Bond Counsel; 3.) Municipal 
Advisor Consulting Services; and 4.) Auctioneering Services for Sale of Various 
Types of Real Property. 

5. Approving the Master Payroll paid on 10/28/2020 for the payroll period of 10/1/2020 
through 10/14/2020 and for the payroll period of 10/15/2020 through 10/28/2020, in 
the amount of $6,236,008.12. 

6. Approving the 2021 Holiday Schedule. 

7. Approving the plans and specifications and authorizing the County Engineer to 
advertise for the receipt of bids for the project entitled Demolition of Residential 
Properties, 2 Maple Street, Jackson Township; 7 Freehold Road, Jackson Township; 
and 108 N. Green Street, Tuckerton Borough. 

8. Authorizing the acquisition of Right-of-Way and/or Easement(s) by gift, purchase, 
exchange or condemnation for the Sea Avenue Pumping Station, Point Pleasant 
Beach Borough. (3 parcels) 

K. TRAFFIC SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS 
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1. Authorizing the revision of the Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #27 
(Route 571/Ridgeway Road) and County Road #8 (Commonwealth Boulevard) 
(MAN-7), Township of Manchester. 

2. Authorizing the revision of the Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #5 
(Route 528 New Egypt-Lakewood-Mantoloking Road) and County Road #61 (Route 
640 Hawkin Road) (PLSD-5), Township of Plumsted. 

3. Authorizing the revision of the Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #63 
(Route 632 Bridge Avenue) and County Road #16 (River Avenue) (PP-1), Borough of 
Point Pleasant. 

4. Authorizing the revision of the Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #63 
(Route 632 Bridge Avenue) and Northstream Parkway (PP-3), Borough of Point 
Pleasant. 

5. Authorizing the revision of the Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #63 
(Route 632 Bridge Avenue) and Riverwood Avenue (PP-4), Borough of Point 
Pleasant. 

6. Authorizing the revision of the Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #63 
(Route 632 Bridge Avenue) and Community Park Pedestrian Crossing (PP-5), 
Borough of Point Pleasant. 

L. BID AWARDS 

1. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS 
DEPARTMENTS to Bob's Uniform Shop, Inc.; Zak's Monogramming, Inc.; and 
Keyport Army Navy, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2020-141) 

2. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MONITORING OF THE 
OCEAN COUNTY JAIL'S HEALTH CARE SERVICES to Herrera Correctional 
Management Systems, LLC, the lowest qualified bidder. (B2020-143) 

3. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of REFURBISHED STORAGE 
CONTAINERS to TRS Containers, LLC, the sole qualified bidder. (B2020-145) 

4. Awarding a Contract for the PROPOSED INTERIOR RENOVATIONS AT OCEAN 
COUNTY JAIL (4th FLOOR), 114 HOOPER AVENUE, TOMS RIVER, NJ 08753 
to Wallace Bros., Inc., the lowest qualified bidder, in an amount not to exceed 
$896,000.00 (which includes an allowance in the amount of $25,000.00) plus 
Alternate No. 1 in the amount of $177,000.00, and Alternate No. 2 in the amount of 
$76,000.00. (B2020-147A) 

5. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of TIRES to F&S Tire Corp.; 
Custom Bandag, Inc.; Edward's Tire Co., Inc.; Service Tire Truck Centers, Inc.; and 
Barnwell House of Tires Co., Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. (B2020-148) 

6. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of VEHICLE LIFTING 
SYSTEM to First Choice Automotive Equipment and Liftnow Automotive 
Equipment Corp., the lowest qualified bidders.  Recommendation is made to reject 
Item Nos. 1, 1a, 1b, 1c, 1d and 1e as unresponsive. All rejected items will be rebid. 
(B2020-149) 

7. Awarding a Contract for the FURNISHING AND INSTALLATION OF VINYL 
TRAILER WRAPS to Turbo Images, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder. (B2020-150) 
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8. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of CULVERT AND CART PATH 
REPAIR AT ATLANTIS GOLF COURSE to Ocean Construction, LLC, the lowest 
qualified bidder, in an amount not to exceed $127,295.45. (B2020-152CE) 

9. Awarding contracts for the furnishing and delivery of PARTS AND ACCESSORIES 
FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT 15,000 GVWR OR GREATER NO. II To 
Mid-Atlantic Truck Centre Inc.; Jasper Engines; Wolfington Body Company; Trius, 
Inc.; C&M Auto Parts, Inc.; H.A. Dehart & Son, Inc.; Lacal Equipment; Dejana 
Truck of Greater Philadelphia; THC Enterprises dba Mid-Atlantic Waste Systems; 
Granturk Equipment Co., Inc.; Campbell Freightliner, LLC; Genuine Parts Company; 
Van Wickle Auto Supply, Inc.; D&W Diesel, Inc., and Greelco, Inc., the lowest 
qualified bidders.  No bids were received for Item Nos. 17, 22, 25, 30, 45, 52, 56, 57, 
58, 65, 68, 69, 75, 85, 90, 92, 93, 95, 97, 103, 106, 107, 101, 129, 130, 153, 156, 158, 
159, 163, 166, 167, 168, 169, 171, 174, 184, 183, 185, 188, 189, 190, 191, 192, 194, 
195, 196, 199, 200, 201, 202, 203, 204, 205, 207, 212, 213, 216, 218, 225, 229, 230, 
231, 232, 233, 234, 235, 236, 237, 238, 239, 240, 241, 242, 243, 244, 245, 246, 251, 
252, 254 and 261.  Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 35, 39, 47, 61, 62, 
81, 91, 114, 118, 124, 141, 144, 148, 149, 150, 198, 211, 217 and 220 as 
unresponsive.  It is requested that the Purchasing Agent be given the authority to 
enter into a negotiated contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-5(3) for Item Nos. 22, 
45, 52, 58, 65, 85, 90, 92, 93, 95, 101, 106, 118, 153, 156, 158, 159, 163, 166, 168, 
169, 171, 174, 183, 184, 185, 188, 189, 192, 194, 195, 196, 198, 199, 200, 201, 202, 
203, 204, 205, 207, 213, 216, 218, 220, 225, 229, 230, 231, 232, 233, 234, 235, 236, 
240, 241, 242, 243, 244, 245, 246, 251 as no responsive bids were received for a 
second time. No bid and rejected Item Nos. 17, 25, 30, 35, 39, 47, 56, 57, 61, 62, 68, 
69, 75, 81, 91, 97, 103, 107, 114, 124, 129, 130, 141, 144, 148, 149, 150, 167, 190, 
191, 211, 212, 217, 237, 238, 239, 252, 254, and 261 will not be awarded or rebid as 
they were previously awarded. (B2020-136) 

10. Authorizing a one (1) year contract extension for the furnishing and delivery of 
IGLOO RECYCLING CONTAINERS to The Fibrex Group, Inc., for the period of 
11/6/2020 through 11/5/2021. (B2019-168) 

11. Rejecting the sole bid received for the furnishing and delivery of LUMBER AND 
LUMBER SUPPLIES NO. II as unresponsive. No bids were received on Item Nos. 
14, 42, 67, 83, 85, 88, 90 and 188. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 50, 
51, 52, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61 and 62.  Authorizing the County Purchasing 
Agent to enter into a negotiated contract in accordance with N.J.S.A. Chapter 40A:11
-5(3) for all no bid and rejected items. 

M. CONTRACTS 

1. Awarding an Extraordinary, Unspecifiable Services Contract to Robert J. Pandina, 
Ph.D. to provide Expert Consultation and Reporting for the Prosecutor's Office, in an 
amount not to exceed $3,500.00. (P2020-84) 

2. Accepting the qualifications of Auction Liquidation Services to provide On-line 
Auction Services for Vehicles and Equipment, for the period of one (1) year. (QP2020
-109) 
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3. Accepting the qualifications of eighteen (18) firms to provide Engineering Design 
Services, on a project specific basis, for the period of 10/16/2020 through 
10/15/2021, as follows: T&M Associates; Van Cleef Engineering Associates, LLC; 
Mott MacDonald, LLC; H2M Associates, Inc.; Johnson Mirmiran & Thompson, Inc.; 
Remington & Vernick Engineers; French & Parrello Associates, PA; CME 
Associates; Pennoni Associates Inc.; Suburban Consulting Engineers, Inc.; Concord 
Engineering Group, Inc.; WJH Engineering; ACT Engineers, Inc.; Alaimo Group; 
Environmental Resolutions, Inc.; KS Engineers, P.C.; Whitman; and Maser 
Consulting, Inc. (QP2020-110) 

4. Awarding a Purchase Order to Alaimo Group to provide Construction Project 
Management for Building and Site Development associated with the Renovations of 
the Northern Resource Center in Lakewood, in an amount not to exceed $95,000.00. 
(QP2020-74) 

5. Awarding a Purchase Order to T&M Associates to provide Environmental Consulting 
Services to the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Program, in an amount not to exceed 
$3,425.00. (QP2020-96) 

6. Awarding a Purchase Order to Maser Consulting, Inc. to provide Environmental 
Consulting Services to the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Program, in an amount not 
to exceed $3,850.00. (QP2020-96) 

7. Awarding a Purchase Order to Mott MacDonald to provide Environmental Consulting 
Services to the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Program, in an amount not to exceed 
$2,800.00. (QP2020-96) 

8. Awarding a Purchase Order to Adams, Rehmann & Heggan Associates, Inc. to 
provide Land Surveying Services to the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Program, in an 
amount not to exceed $49,210.00. (QP2020-57) 

9. Awarding an emergency Purchase Order to Packetalk, in accordance with the 
Proclamation of Emergency in response to the Coronavirus, to provide Thermal 
Imaging Systems in various Ocean County VoTech facilities, in an amount not to 
exceed $110,500.00. 

10. Amending a Resolution adopted on 10/7/2020 awarding a Purchase Order to CME 
Associates, to reflect the revised contract number and project title. (QP2019-165) 

11. Awarding a Purchase Order to Maser Consulting, Inc. to provide Construction Project 
Management services for the project entitled Stormwater Management Contract 
2020A, Various Townships, in an amount not to exceed $138,430.10. (QP2019-139) 

12. Awarding a Purchase Order to Dewberry Engineers, Inc. to provide Construction 
Project Management services for the project entitled Stormwater Management 
Contract 2020B, Various Townships, in an amount not to exceed $107,363.28. 
(QP2019-139) 

13. Awarding a Purchase Order to KMA Consulting Engineers, Inc. to provide Small 
Road and Bridge Design Services for the project entitled Reconstruction of South 
Hope Chapel Road (C.R. 547) and Whitesville Road (C.R. 527) Signalized 
Intersection, Jackson Township, in an amount not to exceed $14,702.24. (QP2019-
165) 
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14. Amending the award of a Purchase Order to Keegan Technology and Testing 
Associates, Inc. dba Key Tech to provide additional Consultant Material Sampling, 
Inspection and Testing Services for the project entitled Replacement of Morris 
Boulevard Bridge (Structure No. 1530009), Morris Boulevard over Fox Island Creek, 
Stafford Township, an increase to the contract in an amount not to exceed $480.00. 
(QP2019-82) 

15. Amending the award of a Purchase Order to French & Parrello Associates to provide 
additional Consultant Material Sampling, Inspection and Testing Services for the 
project entitled Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, 
Contract 2019A, an increase to the contract in an amount not to exceed $1,804.73. 
(QP2019-82) 

N. APPOINTMENTS AND REAPPOINTMENTS 

1. Reappointing Alison Amelchenko, Manasquan; Roberta F. Krantz, Manasquan; and 
Lori A. Pepenella, Barnegat, as members, for a term of five (5) years, term to expire 
11/14/2025; and reappointing Kelly A. Fliller, Toms River as an alternate member, 
for a term of two (2) years, term to expire 11/14/2022, all to the OC CULTURAL 
AND HERITAGE COMMISSION. 

2. Reappointing Ronald J. Klebacher, D.O. to the position of Assistant County Medical 
Examiner for a term of one (1) year, term to expire 11/19/2021. 

O. RECEIVED ITEMS 

P. RESOLUTIONS FROM GOVERNING BODIES 

1. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 271(20) accepting the State FY2021 Governor's 
Council on Alcoholism and Drug Abuse (GCADA) Alliance to prevent Alcoholism 
and Drug Abuse Program Grant. 

2. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 279(20) proclaiming November 2020 as 
"American Diabetes Month". 

3. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 280(20) proclaiming November 19, 2020 as the 
"Great American Smokeout". 

4. Township of Eagleswood, Resolution No. 2020-106 supporting High Speed Internet 
Accessibility. 

Q. MINUTES AND MEETING NOTICES 

1. OC Board of Health Meeting Minutes of 9/23/2020. 

2. OC Mental Health Board Meeting Minutes of 9/14/2020. 

3. OC Planning Board Meeting Minutes of 10/7/2020. 

4. OC Utilities Authority Meeting Minutes of 9/24/2020. 

5. OC Human Services Advisory Council Meeting Minutes of 7/23/2020. 
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6. OC Board of Social Services Meeting Minutes of 9/22/2020. 

R. APPROVALS 

1. Division of Local Government Services approval of seven (7) items of revenue. 

S. REPORTS 

1. OC Treasurer's Report, July 2020. 

T. CORRESPONDENCE 

1. Notice of Filing and Notice of Public Hearings, Notice to Public Service Electric and 
Gas Company Gas Customers in the matter of the petition of Public Service Electric 
and Gas Company for approval of the next phase of the Gas System Modernization 
Program and associated cost recovery mechanism ("GSMP II") (December 2019 
GSMP II Rate Filing), Docket No. GR19120002. 

2. New Jersey Turnpike Authority, letter dated 10/27/2020 regarding E-Z Pass discounts 
for Garden State Parkway and New Jersey Turnpike commuters. 

U. FREEHOLDER COMMENTS 

V. PUBLIC COMMENTS - "Comments from members of the audience are invited at this time 
with a limit of five (5) minutes per speaker." 

W. ADJOURNMENT 
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	Supporting the Borough of Point Pleasant Beach's submission of an application for New Jersey Department of Transportation - Transportation Set-Aside Alternatives Grant Program funding to make infrastructure improvements that will enhance the revitalization, safety and aesthetic qualities of the Channel Drive Revitalization Project that may impact Broadway (County Road 635) and Baltimore Avenue (County Road 71) within the Borough of Point Pleasant Beach.
	Authorizing the execution of a Grant application/agreement with the New Jersey Department of Transportation for the project entitled Replacement of Duck Farm Bridge (Structure No. 1506-013), Hooper Avenue (C.R. 631) over Cedar Bridge Branch of the Metedeconk River, Brick Township.
	Authorizing the execution of a Cost Reimbursement Agreement with the New Jersey Department of Transportation for the project entitled Garden State Parkway Interchange 83 Improvements, Toms River Township, County of Ocean, Federal Project No. STBGP-0571(301), Agreement No. 2020-DT-BLA-305.
	Authorizing the execution of Agreement Modification No. 2 with the New Jersey Department of Transportation for the project entitled Construction of Horizontal Curve High Friction Surface Treatment, Berkeley, Lacey, Ocean and Plumsted Townships, Ocean County, Federal Project No. STP-D00S (200), Agreement No. 2018-DT-BLA-316.
	Authorizing the execution of an Agreement with CBRC Holdings, LLC for the roadway improvements and traffic signal modifications along the frontage of Lot 1.04, Block 961.02, Cedar Bridge Avenue and Avenue of the States, Lakewood Township.
	Authorizing the execution of a Shared Services Agreement with the Township of Brick for the paving of a portion of Laurel Avenue, Township of Brick.

	MOTIONS
	Authorizing the Clerk of the Board to accept and/or record legal instruments.
	Approving the Pre-Board Meeting Minutes of 8/26/2020.
	Approving the Board Meeting Minutes of 10/7/2020.
	Authorizing the distribution of Requests for Proposals and/or Requests for Qualifications as follows: 1.) Auditing Services; 2.) Bond Counsel; 3.) Municipal Advisor Consulting Services; and 4.) Auctioneering Services for Sale of Various Types of Real Property.
	Approving the Master Payroll paid on 10/28/2020 for the payroll period of 10/1/2020 through 10/14/2020 and for the payroll period of 10/15/2020 through 10/28/2020, in the amount of $6,236,008.12.
	Approving the 2021 Holiday Schedule.
	Approving the plans and specifications and authorizing the County Engineer to advertise for the receipt of bids for the project entitled Demolition of Residential Properties, 2 Maple Street, Jackson Township; 7 Freehold Road, Jackson Township; and 108 N. Green Street, Tuckerton Borough.
	Authorizing the acquisition of Right-of-Way and/or Easement(s) by gift, purchase, exchange or condemnation for the Sea Avenue Pumping Station, Point Pleasant Beach Borough. (3 parcels)

	TRAFFIC SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS
	Authorizing the revision of the Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #27 (Route 571/Ridgeway Road) and County Road #8 (Commonwealth Boulevard) (MAN-7), Township of Manchester.
	Authorizing the revision of the Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #5 (Route 528 New Egypt-Lakewood-Mantoloking Road) and County Road #61 (Route 640 Hawkin Road) (PLSD-5), Township of Plumsted.
	Authorizing the revision of the Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #63 (Route 632 Bridge Avenue) and County Road #16 (River Avenue) (PP-1), Borough of Point Pleasant.
	Authorizing the revision of the Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #63 (Route 632 Bridge Avenue) and Northstream Parkway (PP-3), Borough of Point Pleasant.
	Authorizing the revision of the Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #63 (Route 632 Bridge Avenue) and Riverwood Avenue (PP-4), Borough of Point Pleasant.
	Authorizing the revision of the Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #63 (Route 632 Bridge Avenue) and Community Park Pedestrian Crossing (PP-5), Borough of Point Pleasant.

	BID AWARDS
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS to Bob's Uniform Shop, Inc.; Zak's Monogramming, Inc.; and Keyport Army Navy, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2020-141)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MONITORING OF THE OCEAN COUNTY JAIL'S HEALTH CARE SERVICES to Herrera Correctional Management Systems, LLC, the lowest qualified bidder. (B2020-143)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of REFURBISHED STORAGE CONTAINERS to TRS Containers, LLC, the sole qualified bidder. (B2020-145)
	Awarding a Contract for the PROPOSED INTERIOR RENOVATIONS AT OCEAN COUNTY JAIL (4th FLOOR), 114 HOOPER AVENUE, TOMS RIVER, NJ 08753 to Wallace Bros., Inc., the lowest qualified bidder, in an amount not to exceed $896,000.00 (which includes an allowance in the amount of $25,000.00) plus Alternate No. 1 in the amount of $177,000.00, and Alternate No. 2 in the amount of $76,000.00. (B2020-147A)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of TIRES to F&S Tire Corp.; Custom Bandag, Inc.; Edward's Tire Co., Inc.; Service Tire Truck Centers, Inc.; and Barnwell House of Tires Co., Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. (B2020-148)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of VEHICLE LIFTING SYSTEM to First Choice Automotive Equipment and Liftnow Automotive Equipment Corp., the lowest qualified bidders.€ Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 1, 1a, 1b, 1c, 1d and 1e as unresponsive. All rejected items will be rebid. (B2020-149)
	Awarding a Contract for the FURNISHING AND INSTALLATION OF VINYL TRAILER WRAPS to Turbo Images, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder. (B2020-150)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of CULVERT AND CART PATH REPAIR AT ATLANTIS GOLF COURSE to Ocean Construction, LLC, the lowest qualified bidder, in an amount not to exceed $127,295.45. (B2020-152CE)
	Awarding contracts for the furnishing and delivery of PARTS AND ACCESSORIES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT 15,000 GVWR OR GREATER NO. II To Mid-Atlantic Truck Centre Inc.; Jasper Engines; Wolfington Body Company; Trius, Inc.; C&M Auto Parts, Inc.; H.A. Dehart & Son, Inc.; Lacal Equipment; Dejana Truck of Greater Philadelphia; THC Enterprises dba Mid-Atlantic Waste Systems; Granturk Equipment Co., Inc.; Campbell Freightliner, LLC; Genuine Parts Company; Van Wickle Auto Supply, Inc.; D&W Diesel, Inc., and Greelco, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. €No bids were received for Item Nos. 17, 22, 25, 30, 45, 52, 56, 57, 58, 65, 68, 69, 75, 85, 90, 92, 93, 95, 97, 103, 106, 107, 101, 129, 130, 153, 156, 158, 159, 163, 166, 167, 168, 169, 171, 174, 184, 183, 185, 188, 189, 190, 191, 192, 194, 195, 196, 199, 200, 201, 202, 203, 204, 205, 207, 212, 213, 216, 218, 225, 229, 230, 231, 232, 233, 234, 235, 236, 237, 238, 239, 240, 241, 242, 243, 244, 245, 246, 251, 252, 254 and 261.€ Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 35, 39, 47, 61, 62, 81, 91, 114, 118, 124, 141, 144, 148, 149, 150, 198, 211, 217 and 220 as unresponsive. €It is requested that the Purchasing Agent be given the authority to enter into a negotiated contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-5(3) for Item Nos. 22, 45, 52, 58, 65, 85, 90, 92, 93, 95, 101, 106, 118, 153, 156, 158, 159, 163, 166, 168, 169, 171, 174, 183, 184, 185, 188, 189, 192, 194, 195, 196, 198, 199, 200, 201, 202, 203, 204, 205, 207, 213, 216, 218, 220, 225, 229, 230, 231, 232, 233, 234, 235, 236, 240, 241, 242, 243, 244, 245, 246, 251 as no responsive bids were received for a second time. No bid and rejected Item Nos. 17, 25, 30, 35, 39, 47, 56, 57, 61, 62, 68, 69, 75, 81, 91, 97, 103, 107, 114, 124, 129, 130, 141, 144, 148, 149, 150, 167, 190, 191, 211, 212, 217, 237, 238, 239, 252, 254, and 261 will not be awarded or rebid as they were previously awarded. (B2020-136)
	Authorizing a one (1) year contract extension for the furnishing and delivery€of IGLOO RECYCLING CONTAINERS to The Fibrex Group, Inc., for the period of 11/6/2020 through 11/5/2021. (B2019-168)
	Rejecting the sole bid received for the furnishing and delivery of LUMBER AND LUMBER SUPPLIES NO. II as unresponsive.€No bids were received on Item Nos. 14, 42, 67, 83, 85, 88, 90 and 188. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 50, 51, 52, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61 and 62.€ Authorizing the County Purchasing Agent to enter into a negotiated contract in accordance with N.J.S.A. Chapter 40A:11-5(3) for all no bid and rejected items.

	CONTRACTS
	Awarding an Extraordinary, Unspecifiable Services Contract to Robert J. Pandina, Ph.D. to provide Expert Consultation and Reporting for the Prosecutor's Office, in an amount not to exceed $3,500.00. (P2020-84)
	Accepting the qualifications of Auction Liquidation Services to provide On-line Auction Services for Vehicles and Equipment, for the period of one (1) year. (QP2020-109)
	Accepting the qualifications of eighteen (18) firms to provide Engineering Design Services, on a project specific basis, for the period of 10/16/2020 through 10/15/2021, as follows: T&M Associates; Van Cleef Engineering Associates, LLC; Mott MacDonald, LLC; H2M Associates, Inc.; Johnson Mirmiran & Thompson, Inc.; Remington & Vernick Engineers; French & Parrello Associates, PA; CME Associates; Pennoni Associates Inc.; Suburban Consulting Engineers, Inc.; Concord Engineering Group, Inc.; WJH Engineering; ACT Engineers, Inc.; Alaimo Group; Environmental Resolutions, Inc.; KS Engineers, P.C.; Whitman; and Maser Consulting, Inc. (QP2020-110)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to Alaimo Group to provide Construction Project Management for Building and Site Development associated with the Renovations of the Northern Resource Center in Lakewood, in an amount not to exceed $95,000.00. (QP2020-74)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to T&M Associates to provide Environmental Consulting Services to the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Program, in an amount not to exceed $3,425.00. (QP2020-96)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to Maser Consulting, Inc. to provide Environmental Consulting Services to the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Program, in an amount not to exceed $3,850.00. (QP2020-96)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to Mott MacDonald to provide Environmental Consulting Services to the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Program, in an amount not to exceed $2,800.00. (QP2020-96)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to€Adams, Rehmann & Heggan Associates, Inc.€to provide Land Surveying Services to the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Program, in an amount not to exceed $49,210.00. (QP2020-57)
	Awarding an emergency Purchase Order to Packetalk, in accordance with the Proclamation of Emergency in response to the Coronavirus, to provide Thermal Imaging Systems in various Ocean County VoTech facilities, in an amount not to exceed $110,500.00.
	Amending a Resolution adopted on 10/7/2020 awarding a Purchase Order to CME Associates, to reflect the€revised€contract number and project title. (QP2019-165)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to€Maser Consulting, Inc. to provide Construction Project Management services for the project entitled Stormwater Management Contract 2020A, Various Townships, in an amount not to exceed $138,430.10. (QP2019-139)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to Dewberry Engineers, Inc. to provide Construction Project Management services for the project entitled Stormwater Management Contract 2020B, Various Townships, in an amount not to exceed $107,363.28. (QP2019-139)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to KMA Consulting Engineers, Inc. to provide Small Road and Bridge€Design Services for the project entitled Reconstruction of South Hope Chapel Road (C.R. 547) and Whitesville Road (C.R. 527) Signalized Intersection, Jackson Township, in an amount not to exceed $14,702.24. (QP2019-165)
	Amending the award€of a Purchase Order to Keegan Technology and Testing Associates, Inc. dba Key Tech to provide additional Consultant Material Sampling, Inspection and Testing Services for the project entitled Replacement of Morris Boulevard Bridge (Structure No. 1530009), Morris Boulevard over Fox Island Creek, Stafford Township, an increase to the contract in an amount not to exceed $480.00. (QP2019-82)
	Amending the award of a Purchase Order to French & Parrello Associates to provide additional Consultant Material Sampling, Inspection and Testing Services for the project entitled Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 2019A, an increase to the contract in an amount not to exceed $1,804.73. (QP2019-82)

	APPOINTMENTS AND REAPPOINTMENTS
	Reappointing Alison Amelchenko, Manasquan; Roberta F. Krantz, Manasquan; and Lori A. Pepenella, Barnegat, as members, for a term of five (5) years, term to expire 11/14/2025; and reappointing Kelly A. Fliller, Toms River as an alternate member, for a term of two (2) years, term to expire 11/14/2022, all to the OC CULTURAL AND HERITAGE COMMISSION.
	Reappointing Ronald J. Klebacher, D.O. to the position of Assistant County Medical Examiner for a term of one (1) year, term to expire 11/19/2021.

	RECEIVED ITEMS
	RESOLUTIONS FROM GOVERNING BODIES
	OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 271(20) accepting the State FY2021 Governor's Council on Alcoholism and Drug Abuse (GCADA) Alliance to prevent Alcoholism and Drug Abuse Program Grant.
	OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 279(20) proclaiming November 2020 as "American Diabetes Month".
	OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 280(20) proclaiming November 19, 2020 as the "Great American Smokeout".
	Township of Eagleswood, Resolution No. 2020-106 supporting High Speed Internet Accessibility.

	MINUTES AND MEETING NOTICES
	OC Board of Health Meeting Minutes of 9/23/2020.
	OC Mental Health Board Meeting Minutes of 9/14/2020.
	OC Planning Board Meeting Minutes of 10/7/2020.
	OC Utilities Authority Meeting Minutes of 9/24/2020.
	OC Human Services Advisory Council Meeting Minutes of 7/23/2020.
	OC Board of Social Services Meeting Minutes of 9/22/2020.

	APPROVALS
	Division of Local Government Services approval of seven (7) items of revenue.

	REPORTS
	OC Treasurer's Report, July 2020.

	CORRESPONDENCE
	Notice of Filing and Notice of Public Hearings, Notice to Public Service Electric and Gas Company Gas Customers in the matter of the petition of Public Service Electric and Gas Company for approval of the next phase of the Gas System Modernization Program and associated cost recovery mechanism ("GSMP II") (December 2019 GSMP II Rate Filing),€Docket No. GR19120002.
	New Jersey Turnpike Authority, letter dated 10/27/2020 regarding E-Z Pass discounts for Garden State Parkway and New Jersey Turnpike€commuters.

	FREEHOLDER COMMENTS
	PUBLIC COMMENTS - "Comments from members of the audience are invited at this time with a limit of five (5) minutes per speaker."
	ADJOURNMENT


