
Board Meeting Agenda

Date: February 5, 2014 - 4:00 PM

Location: Administration Building
Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

A. STATEMENT        Compliance with the Open Public Meetings Act. 

1. Call to order. 

2. Roll Call. 

3. The Pledge of Allegiance and Prayer. 

B. RESOLUTION - PUBLIC HEARING 

1. Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory 
Committee to participate in the acquisition of Block 8, Lot 4, South Toms River 
Borough, in an amount not to exceed $35,000.00. 

2. Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory 
Committee to participate in the acquisition of Block 8, Lots 5 & 6, South Toms River 
Borough, in an amount not to exceed $97,000.00. 

C. Authorizing Payment of Bills in Bill Committee Report No. 3. 

D. Authorizing Engineering Payments to Contractors as listed below. 

1. MARBRO, INC. - Replacement of Radio Road Bridge (Atlantis Bridge) (Structure 
No. 1516-006), Little Egg Harbor Township - Change Order #2, E-$147,259.84, R-
$429,184.88. 

2. JAMES R. IENTILE, INC. - Ocean County College Infrastructure Improvements, 
Phase II, Toms River Township - Partial Estimate #6 - $53,287.01. 
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E. RESOLUTIONS 

1. Authorizing the County Personnel Resolution. 

2. Urging the Governor and the State Legislature to enact Legislation that would 
permanently extend the 2% Cap on Interest Arbitration Awards. 

3. Authorizing transfers between Appropriation Account Reserves. 

4. Authorizing transfers between Appropriation Account Reserve and the Snow 
Removal Reserve. 

5. Authorizing the execution of twelve (12) Agreements with the Sexual Assault Nurse's 
Examiner Grant FY13/14, for the contract period of  1/1/2014 through 12/31/2014. 

6. Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC Board of Social Services 
through the Emergency Food & Shelter FY14 Social Services for the Homeless, in an 
amount not to exceed $321,506.00. 

7. Authorizing the execution of Deferred Loan Agreements under the CDBG Housing 
Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the Planning Director. 

8. Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Modification Agreement under the 
HOME Housing Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the Planning Director. 

9. Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Modification Agreement under the 
CDBG Housing Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the Planning Director. 

10. Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Modification Agreement under the 
HOME Housing Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the Planning Director. 

11. Authorizing a one (1) year extension of contract B2013-31 with Pharmcare USA 
Edison for Pharmacy Services. 

12. Amending a Resolution adopted on 6/20/2012 with Johnson & Towers to extend 
contract prices to the "County Cooperative Contract Purchasing System Participants".

13. Authorizing the submission and execution of a Grant Application/Contract with the 
NJ Department of Transportation for the Replacement of Barnegat Bridge (Structure 
No. 1533-00), East Bay Avenue over Double Creek, Barnegat Township. 

14. Authorizing an Amendment to a Resolution adopted on 12/5/2012 which provided 
funding for Superstorm Sandy related services. 

15. Accepting the qualifications of Gannett Satellite Information Network for Legal 
Advertising Services for Ocean County. 

16. Accepting the qualifications of Gannett Satellite Information Network and The 
Sentinel Publishing Co., Inc. for General Advertising and Subscription Services for 
Ocean County. 

17. Authorizing and directing the Award of an Emergency Contract for the purchase and 
delivery of Deicing Salt upon certification of the Ocean County Road Supervisor that 
such an emergency exists. 
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18. Authorizing the Release of Bonds for Road Opening Permits. 

F. MOTIONS 

1. Authorizing the Clerk of the Board to record and/or accept Legal Instruments. 

2. Approving the Minutes of the Board Meeting of 12/18/2013. 

3. Approving the Minutes of the Pre-Board Meeting of 12/11/2013. 

4. Approving the Plans and Specifications and authorizing the County Engineer to 
advertise for the receipt of bids for Stormwater Management Contract 2014A, 
Reconstruction of Cross Street Drainage, Lakewood Township. 

5. Approving the Plans and Specifications and authorizing the County Engineer to 
advertise for the receipt of bids for the Reconstruction of Traffic Signals, Contract 
2014A, Borough of Seaside Heights. 

6. Approving the OC Master Payroll paid on 1/29/2014 for the period 1/2/2014 through 
1/15/2014 and for the payroll period of 1/16/2014 through 1/29/2014, in the amount 
of $4,900,617.91. 

7. Approving Miscellaneous Bills. 

8. Approving the Distribution of Requests for Proposals and/or Requests for 
Qualifications for:  1)Voting Machine Transportation Services  2) Performing Energy 
Audits for Ocean County Facilities in connection with the NJ Board of Public 
Utilities' Local Government Audit Program 

G. TRAFFIC SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS 

1. Authorizing a Revision for the Establishment of Speed Limits along C.R. #4 (Station 
Drive-Lakeside Drive North-Deerhead Lake Drive), Lacey Township. 

H. BID AWARDS 

1. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of TIRE RETREADING 
SERVICES NO. II to Custom Bandag, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder. 

2. Awarding  Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of AGRICULTURAL 
SUPPLIES to Jonathan Green & Sons, Inc.; Turf Trade; John Deere Landscapes; 
Seeton Turf Warehouse, LLC; Fertl-Soil Turf Supply, Inc.; Agrium Advanced 
Technologies (US), Inc.; Reed and Perrine Sales, Inc.; Fisher & Son Company, Inc.; 
Synatek and Pennington Seed, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders.  No bids were 
received for Items No. 12, 61, 66, 69, 70, 71, 76 and 85.  Recommendation is made to 
reject Items No. 1 and 6.  All no bid and rejected bid items will be rebid. 

3. Rescinding Item No. 2a for the furnishing and delivery of GOLF COURSE AND 
LANDSCAPING EQUIPMENT from Rodio Tractor Sales, Inc. as vendor cannot 
provide item.  Recommendation is made to enter into an Amendatory Contract with 
Ocean County Equipment, Inc. d/b/a Ace Outdoor Power Equipment for Item No. 2a, 
the next lowest qualified bidder. 
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4. Rejecting the sole bid for the furnishing and delivery of EQUIPMENT PARTS, 
REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR THE ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT 
NO. II for the second time for eighteen (18) items.  No bids were received for seventy 
four (74) items for the second time.  In accordance with N.J.S.A. Chapter 40A:11-5
(3) the Purchasing Agent is given the authority to enter into a negotiated contract for 
all no bid and rejected bid items. 

5. Awarding a Contract for the CONSTRUCTION OF RAISED PAVEMENT 
MARKERS, VARIOUS LOCATIONS, 2013A to Zone Striping, Inc., in an amount 
not to exceed $68,333.77. 

I. CONTRACTS 

1. Awarding a Professional Services Agreement with Hatch Mott MacDonald for 
Professional Engineering Services to support Recycling, Composting and Solid 
Waste Programs, in an amount not to exceed $279,000.00. 

2. Awarding a Professional Services Agreement with Hatch Mott MacDonald for 
Professional Engineering Services for Remedial Action Services at the Lakewood, 
Jackson, Ship Bottom Garages and the Robert J. Miller Airpark, in an amount not to 
exceed $110,000.00. 

J. APPOINTMENTS AND REAPPOINTMENTS 

1. Appointing Joseph LaManna, Toms River as an alternate member of the OC SHADE 
TREE COMMISSION to fill the unexpired term of George Stryker, term to expire 
1/1/2015. 

2. Appointing Devan Sheridan, 21 Plus, Inc., Toms River as a member of the OC 
TRANSPORTATION ADVISORY COMMITTEE FOR SENIOR AND PERSONS 
WITH DISABILITIES to fill the unexired term of Katy Bevaart, term to expire 
10/23/2016. 

3. Appointing Shira Lieberman, Lakewood and Carol Lee Myron, Brick and 
reappointing Regina Ferris, Toms River; Bert Kormann, Brick; Dorothy McDowell, 
Toms River; and Jeanine Niemira, Brick all to the OC COMMISSION FOR 
INDIVIDUALS WITH DISABILITIES for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 
2/16/2017. 

K. RECEIVED ITEMS 

L. RESOLUTIONS FROM GOVERNING BODIES 

1. Ocean Township recognizing the month of December as "3-D National Drunk and 
Drugged Driving Prevention Month". 

2. Cape May County opposing S-2601 and A-3891 which would permit fifth and sixth 
class counties to assume control and responsibility for operation and maintenance of 
beaches bordering on the Atlantic Ocean. 

3. Berkeley Township concerning Homeowner Flood Insurance Affordability Act. 
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4. Morris County urging legislation be adopted extending the "cap" for police and fire 
contract disputes. 

5. Monmouth County supporting A-1269 and 4507 to establish a Physician Loan 
Redemption Program to address the current and worsening physician shortage in the 
State. 

6. Surf City Borough authorizing a Schedule "C" Agreement with Ocean County. 

7. Bay Head Borough supporting the petition of The Bay Head Property Owners to 
correct the flooding caused by Twilight Lake and Scow Ditch. 

M. MINUTES AND MEETING NOTICES 

1. OC Health Department Meeting Minutes of 12/11/2013. 

2. OC Insurance Committee Meeting Minutes of 12/19/2013. 

3. OC Mosquito Extermination Commission Meeting Minutes of 12/16/2013. 

4. OC Planning Board Meeting Minutes of 1/15/2014. 

5. OC Utilities Authority Meeting Minutes of 12/19/2013. 

6. OC Board of Social Services Meeting Minutes of 12/17/2013. 

N. CORRESPONDENCE 

1. NJ American Water Company Notice of Public Hearing concerning 
increases/decreases. 

O. REPORTS 

1. 2013 County of Ocean Annual Debt Statement. 

2. 2013 County of Ocean Annual Financial Statement. 

P. FREEHOLDER COMMENTS 

Q. PUBLIC COMMENTS - Comments from members of the audience are invited at this time 
with a limit of five (5) minutes per speaker. 

R. ADJOURNMENT 

Page 5 of 5








































































































































































































































































































































	Meeting Agenda for Feb 05, 2014_Board Meeting Agenda
	STATEMENT€€€€€€€€Compliance with the Open Public Meetings Act.
	Call to order.
	Roll Call.
	The Pledge of Allegiance and Prayer.

	RESOLUTION - PUBLIC HEARING
	Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory Committee to participate in the acquisition of Block 8, Lot 4, South Toms River Borough, in an amount not to exceed $35,000.00.
	Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory Committee to participate in the acquisition of Block 8, Lots 5 & 6, South Toms River Borough, in an amount not to exceed $97,000.00.

	Authorizing Payment of Bills in Bill Committee Report No. 3.
	Authorizing Engineering Payments to Contractors as listed below.
	MARBRO, INC. - Replacement of Radio Road Bridge (Atlantis Bridge) (Structure No. 1516-006), Little Egg Harbor Township - Change Order #2, E-$147,259.84, R-$429,184.88.
	JAMES R. IENTILE, INC. - Ocean County College Infrastructure Improvements, Phase II, Toms River Township - Partial Estimate #6 - $53,287.01.

	RESOLUTIONS
	Authorizing the County Personnel Resolution.
	Urging the Governor and the State Legislature to enact Legislation that would permanently extend the 2% Cap on Interest Arbitration Awards.
	Authorizing transfers between Appropriation Account Reserves.
	Authorizing transfers between Appropriation Account Reserve and the Snow Removal Reserve.
	Authorizing the execution of twelve (12) Agreements with the Sexual Assault Nurse's Examiner Grant FY13/14, for the contract period of€ 1/1/2014 through 12/31/2014.
	Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC Board of Social Services through the Emergency Food & Shelter FY14 Social Services for the Homeless, in an amount not to exceed $321,506.00.
	Authorizing the execution of Deferred Loan Agreements under the CDBG Housing Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the Planning Director.
	Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Modification Agreement under the HOME Housing Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the Planning Director.
	Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Modification Agreement under the CDBG Housing Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the Planning Director.
	Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Modification Agreement under the HOME Housing Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the Planning Director.
	Authorizing a one (1) year extension of contract B2013-31 with Pharmcare USA Edison for Pharmacy Services.
	Amending a Resolution adopted on 6/20/2012 with Johnson & Towers to extend contract prices to the "County Cooperative Contract Purchasing System Participants".
	Authorizing the submission and execution of a Grant Application/Contract with the NJ Department of Transportation for the Replacement of Barnegat Bridge (Structure No. 1533-00), East Bay Avenue over Double Creek, Barnegat Township.
	Authorizing an Amendment to a Resolution adopted on 12/5/2012 which provided funding for Superstorm Sandy related services.
	Accepting the qualifications of Gannett Satellite Information Network for Legal Advertising Services for Ocean County.
	Accepting the qualifications of Gannett Satellite Information Network and The Sentinel Publishing Co., Inc. for General Advertising and Subscription Services for Ocean County.
	Authorizing and directing the Award of an Emergency Contract for the purchase and delivery of Deicing Salt upon certification of the Ocean County Road Supervisor that such an emergency exists.
	Authorizing the Release of Bonds for Road Opening Permits.

	MOTIONS
	Authorizing the Clerk of the Board to record and/or accept Legal Instruments.
	Approving the Minutes of the Board Meeting of 12/18/2013.
	Approving the Minutes of the Pre-Board Meeting of 12/11/2013.
	Approving the Plans and Specifications and authorizing the County Engineer to advertise for the receipt of bids for Stormwater Management Contract 2014A, Reconstruction of Cross Street Drainage, Lakewood Township.
	Approving the Plans and Specifications and authorizing the County Engineer to advertise for the receipt of bids for the Reconstruction of Traffic Signals, Contract 2014A, Borough of Seaside Heights.
	Approving the OC Master Payroll paid on 1/29/2014 for the period 1/2/2014 through 1/15/2014 and for the payroll period of 1/16/2014 through 1/29/2014, in the amount of $4,900,617.91.
	Approving Miscellaneous Bills.
	Approving the Distribution of Requests for Proposals and/or Requests for Qualifications for:€ 1)Voting Machine Transportation Services€ 2) Performing Energy Audits for Ocean County Facilities in connection with the NJ Board of Public Utilities' Local Government Audit Program

	TRAFFIC SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS
	Authorizing a Revision for the Establishment of Speed Limits along C.R. #4 (Station Drive-Lakeside Drive North-Deerhead Lake Drive), Lacey Township.

	BID AWARDS
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of TIRE RETREADING SERVICES NO. II to Custom Bandag, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder.
	Awarding€ Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of AGRICULTURAL SUPPLIES to Jonathan Green & Sons, Inc.; Turf Trade; John Deere Landscapes; Seeton Turf Warehouse, LLC; Fertl-Soil Turf Supply, Inc.; Agrium Advanced Technologies (US), Inc.; Reed and Perrine Sales, Inc.; Fisher & Son Company, Inc.; Synatek and Pennington Seed, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders.€ No bids were received for Items No. 12, 61, 66, 69, 70, 71, 76 and 85.€ Recommendation is made to reject Items No. 1 and 6.€ All no bid and rejected bid items will be rebid.
	Rescinding Item No. 2a for the furnishing and delivery of GOLF COURSE AND LANDSCAPING EQUIPMENT from Rodio Tractor Sales, Inc. as vendor cannot provide item.€ Recommendation is made to enter into an Amendatory Contract with Ocean County Equipment, Inc. d/b/a Ace Outdoor Power Equipment for Item No. 2a, the next lowest qualified bidder.
	Rejecting the sole bid for the furnishing and delivery of EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR THE ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT NO. II for the second time for eighteen (18) items.€ No bids were received for seventy four (74) items for the second time.€ In accordance with N.J.S.A. Chapter 40A:11-5(3) the Purchasing Agent is given the authority to enter into a negotiated contract for all no bid and rejected bid items.
	Awarding a Contract for the CONSTRUCTION OF RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS, VARIOUS LOCATIONS, 2013A to Zone Striping, Inc., in an amount not to exceed $68,333.77.

	CONTRACTS
	Awarding a Professional Services Agreement with Hatch Mott MacDonald for Professional Engineering Services to support Recycling, Composting and Solid Waste Programs, in an amount not to exceed $279,000.00.
	Awarding a Professional Services Agreement with Hatch Mott MacDonald for Professional Engineering Services for Remedial Action Services at the Lakewood, Jackson, Ship Bottom Garages and the Robert J. Miller Airpark, in an amount not to exceed $110,000.00.

	APPOINTMENTS AND REAPPOINTMENTS
	Appointing Joseph LaManna, Toms River as an alternate member of the OC SHADE TREE COMMISSION to fill the unexpired term of George Stryker, term to expire 1/1/2015.
	Appointing Devan Sheridan, 21 Plus, Inc., Toms River as a member of the OC TRANSPORTATION ADVISORY COMMITTEE FOR SENIOR AND PERSONS WITH DISABILITIES to fill the unexired term of Katy Bevaart, term to expire 10/23/2016.
	Appointing Shira Lieberman, Lakewood and Carol Lee Myron, Brick and reappointing Regina Ferris, Toms River; Bert Kormann, Brick; Dorothy McDowell, Toms River; and Jeanine Niemira, Brick all to the OC COMMISSION FOR INDIVIDUALS WITH DISABILITIES for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 2/16/2017.

	RECEIVED ITEMS
	RESOLUTIONS FROM GOVERNING BODIES
	Ocean Township recognizing the month of December as "3-D National Drunk and Drugged Driving Prevention Month".
	Cape May County opposing S-2601 and A-3891 which would permit fifth and sixth class counties to assume control and responsibility for operation and maintenance of beaches bordering on the Atlantic Ocean.
	Berkeley Township concerning Homeowner Flood Insurance Affordability Act.
	Morris County urging legislation be adopted extending the "cap" for police and fire contract disputes.
	Monmouth County supporting A-1269 and 4507 to establish a Physician Loan Redemption Program to address the current and worsening physician shortage in the State.
	Surf City Borough authorizing a Schedule "C" Agreement with Ocean County.
	Bay Head Borough supporting the petition of The Bay Head Property Owners to correct the flooding caused by Twilight Lake and Scow Ditch.

	MINUTES AND MEETING NOTICES
	OC Health Department Meeting Minutes of 12/11/2013.
	OC Insurance Committee Meeting Minutes of 12/19/2013.
	OC Mosquito Extermination Commission Meeting Minutes of 12/16/2013.
	OC Planning Board Meeting Minutes of 1/15/2014.
	OC Utilities Authority Meeting Minutes of 12/19/2013.
	OC Board of Social Services Meeting Minutes of 12/17/2013.

	CORRESPONDENCE
	NJ American Water Company Notice of Public Hearing concerning increases/decreases.

	REPORTS
	2013 County of Ocean Annual Debt Statement.
	2013 County of Ocean Annual Financial Statement.

	FREEHOLDER COMMENTS
	PUBLIC COMMENTS - Comments from members of the audience are invited at this time with a limit of five (5) minutes per speaker.
	ADJOURNMENT


