
Board Meeting Agenda

Date: December 19, 2018 - 4:00 PM

Location: Administration Building
Room 119
101 Hooper Ave
Toms River, NJ 08754

A. CALL TO ORDER 

B. ROLL CALL 

C. STATEMENT    Compliance with the Open Public Meetings Act 

D. THE PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE AND PRAYER 

E. MOMENT OF SILENCE in Honor of Freeholder John C. Bartlett, Jr. 

F. PRESENTATION 

1. To the Board by OC Utilities Authority Chairman John C. Parker. 

G. RESOLUTION - PUBLIC HEARING 

1. Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory 
Committee to participate in the acquisition of property identified as Block 40, Lots 2, 
767, 768 and 1291-1313 in the Township of Toms River totaling approximately 6.99 
acres located on Cleveland Street, in a total amount not to exceed $155,000.00 plus 
up to $1,270.00 for property tax adjustments. 
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2. Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory 
Committee to participate in the acquisition of property identified as Block 40, Lots 
756 and 766 in the Township of Toms River totaling approximately 4.98 acres 
located on Sayreville Street, in a total amount not to exceed $110,000.00 plus up to 
$467.00 for property tax adjustments. 

3. Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory 
Committee to participate in the acquisition of property identified as Block 413, Lot 8 
in the Township of Toms River totaling approximately 15.40 acres located on North 
Bay Avenue, in a total amount not to exceed $2,000,000.00 plus up to $6,304.00 for 
property tax adjustments. 

H. AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF BILLS IN BILL COMMITTEE REPORT NO. 24. 

I. AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF BILLS IN BILL COMMITTEE REPORT NO. E-5. 

J. AUTHORIZING ENGINEERING PAYMENTS TO CONTRACTORS AS LISTED 
BELOW: 

1. EDWARD H. CRAY, INC. - Construction of Long Beach Boulevard Traffic Signal 
Upgrades Phase B, Group 1, Long Beach Boulevard, Long Beach Township - Partial 
Estimate #2, $38,347.89. (B2018-29E) 

2. EDWARD H. CRAY, INC. - Construction of Long Beach Boulevard Traffic Signal 
Upgrades Phase B, Group 2, Long Beach Boulevard, Long Beach Township - Partial 
Estimate #1, $43,737.40. (B2018-30E) 

3. EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Stormwater Management Contract 2017B, 
Various Townships - Change Order #2, E-$19,927.73, R-$4,180.00. (B2018-06E) 

4. ARAWAK PAVING CO., INC. - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of 
Certain County Roads, Contract 2017A - Final Estimate #5, $132,357.59. (B2017-
108E) 

5. BLACK ROCK ENTERPRISES, LLC - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions 
of Certain County Roads, Contract 2017D - Partial Estimate #5, $67,338.89. (B2018-
70E) 

K. RESOLUTIONS 

1. Authorizing the Personnel Resolution. 

2. Honoring Ernest J. Kuhlwein, Jr. as he retires from 30 years of dedicated service to 
the Ocean County Department of Solid Waste Management. 

3. Honoring John T. (Tom) Curcio as he retires from 11 years of dedicated service to 
the Ocean County Road Department. 

4. Authorizing the transfer of 2017 Encumbrances to Accounts Payable. 

5. Authorizing the cancellation of current account balances that are no longer needed. 
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6. Amending a contract dated July 3, 2018 related to Tax Block 608, portions of Lots 
16.1, 16.2, 18 and 19; and the entirety of Block 597, Lots 16, 20-32 and 35-38 in the 
Township of Toms River. 

7. Authorizing the execution of a new Drainage Easement for the benefit of Ocean 
County on Block 41, Lot 32.05 in Ocean Township and the Vacation of the Drainage 
Easement previously recorded in the OC Clerk's Office in Book 3926, Page 335. 

8. Authorizing Certified Training Instructors for the OC Police Academy, for the period 
of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. 

9. Adopting the Title VI Affirmative Action Plan for calendar year 2019. 

10. Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC Board of Social Services 
for participation in the OC Self-Insured Workers' Compensation Program, for the 
period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. 

11. Authorizing a sixty (60) day extension to the existing Shared Services Agreement 
with Cumberland County to house an adjudicated juvenile on a short term 
commitment status. 

12. Authorizing a Memorandum of Understanding with Ocean Air Support Squadron for 
Aviation Services supporting the OC Sheriff's Department, in an amount not to 
exceed $15,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. 

13. Authorizing the execution of two (2) Agreements for the OC Disability Awareness 
Through Education Program (O.C.D.A.T.E.), in an amount not to exceed $17,400.00, 
for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (C2018-164) 

14. Authorizing a Shared Services Agreement with the Toms River Board of Fire 
Commissioners District #1 and District #2 for cost sharing of the installation and 
operation of optically controlled Emergency Pre-Emptive Traffic Signal Equipment. 

15. Authorizing the execution of a Settlement and Release Agreement in the matter 
entitled "The County of Ocean vs. Roof Management, Inc." 

16. Authorizing the execution of a Contract of Sale with the Township of Toms River for 
Tax Block 171, Lots 23 and 23Q and Tax Block 171, Lot 42, all in the Township of 
Toms River. 

L. MOTIONS 

1. Authorizing the Clerk of the Board to accept and/or record legal instruments. 

2. Approving the Minutes of the Pre-Board Meeting of 10/10/2018. 

3. Approving the Minutes of the Pre-Board Meeting of 10/31/2018. 

4. Authorizing the Master Payroll paid on 12/12/2018 for the payroll period of 
11/15/2018 through 11/28/2018 and for the payroll period of 11/29/2018 through 
12/12/2018, in the amount of $5,323,859.00. 
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5. Approving the Distribution of Requests for Proposal and Requests for Qualifications 
for: 1) Professional Engineering Services - Solid Waste Management, Recycling and 
Underground Storage Tanks; 2) Arbitrage Rebate Consulting Services; 3) Consultant 
Services for the Establishment and Implementation of the Annual Indirect Cost 
Allocation Plan; 4) Special Labor Counsel; 5) Land Surveying Services for Various 
Projects in Ocean County, Where and As Directed by Various Departments of Ocean 
County; 6) Title Binder and Commitment/Insurance and Search Services for Various 
Projects in Ocean County, Where and As Directed by Various Departments in Ocean 
County; 7) On-Call Traffic Engineering Professional Services, Where and As 
Directed by the Ocean County Engineer. 

6. Approving the plans and specifications and authorizing the County Engineer to 
advertise for the receipt of bids for Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of 
Certain County Roads, Contract 2018D. 

7. Approving Miscellaneous Bills. 

M. BID AWARDS 

1. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of BEAM GUIDE RAIL AND 
TANGENT GUIDE RAIL ELEMENTS to Chemung Supply Corp. and Road Safety 
Systems, LLC, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2018-142) 

2. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of EQUIPMENT PARTS, 
REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR THE SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT 
DEPARTMENT to H.A. DeHart & Son, Inc.; Eagle Truck Equipment, Inc.; 
Campbell Freightliner, LLC; Houpert Fleet Services; Gerhart Scale Corporation; 
Aquatech Hotsy DBA Aquatech-USA and Advance Scale Co., Inc., the lowest 
qualified bidders.  No bids were received on one hundred and thirty-seven (137) 
items.  Recommendation is made to reject items 23a, 23b, 23c and 23d as 
unresponsive.  All no bid and rejected items will be rebid, with the exception of items 
19a, 19b, 19c and 19d, as they are no longer needed.  Awarded items 8a, 8b, 8c, 8d, 
31b, 33a, 33b, 33c, 33d, 40a, 40b, 40c and 40d will be rebid to obtain additional 
vendors. (B2018-144) 

3. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of GOLF COURSE AND 
LANDSCAPING EQUIPMENT to Turf Equipment and Supply Co., Inc.; Blossom 
Lawn Center, Inc.; Central Jersey Equipment, LLC; Ocean County Equipment, Inc. 
DBA Ace Outdoor Power; W.W. Grainger, Inc. and Steve Green Enterprises, Inc., 
the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were received for items 2, 4g, 4i, 38, 42 and 
42a. Recommendation is made to not award item 34 and 34a as they are no longer 
needed.. Recommendation is made to reject items 11 and 15. No bid items 4g and 4i 
will not be rebid as they are no longer needed.  Rejected items 11 and 15 as well as 
no bid items 2, 38, 42 and 42a will be rebid. (B2018-145) 

4. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of MISCELLANEOUS 
GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS, AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES to Mivila Foods; 
Schmidt Baking Co., Inc. and Shore Restaurant & Party Supply, the lowest qualified 
bidders. (B2018-146) 

5. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of RIPRAP to Stavola 
Construction Materials, Inc. and Trap Rock Industries, LLC, the lowest qualified 
bidders. (B2018-147) 
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6. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of AGRICULTURAL SUPPLIES 
to Andre & Son, Inc.; Plant Food Company, Inc.; Seeton Turf Warehouse, LLC; 
SiteOne Landscape Supply; Grass Roots Turf Products, Inc.; Bohonyi Corporation; 
Nutrien Ag Solutions, Inc. and Harrell's LLC, the lowest qualified bidders.  No bids 
were received for items 1, 4, 7, 10, 29, 55, 65, 66, 78, 88, 93, 94, 95, 98, 106, 112 and 
115.  All no bid items will be rebid. (B2018-148) 

7. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of EQUIPMENT PARTS, 
REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS to Mid-
Atlantic Truck Centre; Turf Equipment and Supply Co., Inc.; Blossom Lawn Center, 
Inc.; Houpert Fleet Services; GLS, Inc. T/A Van Sant Equipment and Ocean County 
Equipment, Inc. DBA Ace Outdoor Power, the lowest qualified bidders.  No bids 
were received on three hundred and seventy-four (374) items. All no bid items will be 
rebid.  One hundred and twenty-three (123) awarded items will be rebid to obtain 
additional vendors. (B2018-149) 

8. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of INTEGRATED PEST 
MANAGEMENT to Meticulous Landscaping, Inc., the lowest qualified 
bidder. (B2018-150) 

9. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of SECURITY SYSTEMS 
INSTALLATION, MAINTENANCE, SERVICE, AND REPAIR to Absolute 
Protective Systems, Inc., the sole qualified bidder. (B2018-152) 

10. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: NEW 
LOW FLOOR MINI VANS to Rohrer Enterprises, Inc. DBA/Rohrer Bus Sales, the 
lowest qualified bidder. (B2018-164) 

11. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO 
AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. II to W.B. Hunt Co., Inc. and 
Adorama, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders.  No bids were received for items 21 and 
82.  Recommendation is made to reject item 49 as unresponsive. No bids were 
received for a second time for items 21 and 82. In accordance with N.J.S.A. 40A:11-5
(3) the County Purchasing Agent is given authority to enter into a negotiated contract 
for all no bid and rejected items. (B2018-169) 

12. Authorizing a one (1) year Contract Extension for the furnishing and delivery of 
HEATING, VENTILATING & AIR CONDITIONING MAINTENANCE, 
SERVICE AND ALTERATION, to Falasca Mechanical, Inc., for the period of 
1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (B2018-01) 

13. Rejecting all bids for the FURNISHING AND INSTALLATION OF FOUR (4) PRE-
CAST VAULT TOILET RESTROOM BUILDINGS AT VARIOUS COUNTY 
PARKS as unresponsive and over budget. It will be rebid. 

14. Rejecting the sole bid for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLE: NEW 
DEPLOYMENT VEHICLE as over budget.  It will not be rebid at this time. 

15. Awarding a Contract for TRAFFIC SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS AT THE 
INTERSECTION OF COUNTY ROUTE 528 AND OBERLIN AVENUE, 
LAKEWOOD TOWNSHIP to Jersey Construction, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder, 
in the amount of $1,156,846.80. (B2018-179E) 

N. CHANGE ORDERS 
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1. Authorizing Change Order No. 1 to Benjamin Harvey Construction, Inc. for the 
project entitled Manchester Garage Building Improvements, a net decrease to the 
Contract in the amount of $1,377.22. (B2018-27CE) 

2. Authorizing Change Order No. 2 to Gary Kubiak & Son Electric, Inc. for the project 
entitled Ocean County Justice Complex Electric Service Consolidation and Plaza 
Rehabilitation, a no net increase to the contract. (B2017-174CE) 

O. CONTRACTS 

1. Awarding a Contract to Electronic Recyclers International, Inc. for the Collection, 
Transport and Recycling of Electronic Equipment, in an amount not to exceed 
$17,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (C2018-165) 

2. Awarding a Contract to New Jersey Imaging Network Toms River East to provide the 
OC Medical Examiner's Office with Virtual Autopsy Services, in an amount not to 
exceed $40,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-138) 

3. Awarding a Contract to Community Medical Center, Inc. to provide the Medical 
Examiner Autopsy Services, in an amount not to exceed $225,000.00, for the period 
of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-139) 

4. Awarding a Contract to Preferred Behavioral Health of NJ, Inc. to provide an 
Employee Assistance Program, in an amount not to exceed $36,075.00, for the period 
of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019 with an option to extend the term for an additional 
year. (CP2018-144) 

5. Awarding a Contract to National Vision Administrators, LLC, to provide a Vision 
Service Plan, in an amount not to exceed $100,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 
through 12/31/2019 with an option to extend the term for an additional year. (PP2018
-145) 

6. Awarding a Contract to Remington & Vernick Engineers for Voter District Mapping 
Services, in an amount not to exceed $15,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 
12/31/2019. (QP2018-163) 

7. Awarding a Contract to Dominion Voting Systems, Inc. for the Purchase of Voting 
Machines and Related Software Licensing and Maintenance Service, in an amount 
not to exceed $173,500.00 annually, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2020. 
(QP2018-166) 

8. Awarding a Contract to Advanced Computer Concepts, Inc. T/A TREC for Printing, 
Labeling, Binding and Mailing Services, in an amount not to exceed $475,000.00 
annually, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2020. (QP2018-167) 

9. Awarding Professional Services Contracts to Gerard Breton, M.D.; Ian Hood, M.D.; 
Ramesh C. Mahapatro, M.D.; Lyla Perez, M.D.; Dante Ragasa, M.D.; and Charles F. 
Siebert, Jr., M.D. to provide Forensic Pathology Services, in an amount not to exceed 
$600,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-140) 

10. Awarding Professional Services Contracts to Kedz Funeral Home; Wood Funeral 
Home; Colonial Funeral Home; and Tilghman Funeral Home to provide Funeral 
Home Services, in an amount not to exceed $360,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 
through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-141) 
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11. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to NMS Labs to provide Postmortem 
Toxicology Laboratory Services, in an amount not to exceed $150,000.00, for the 
period of 12/1/2018 through 11/30/2019. (QP2018-142) 

12. Awarding a Professional Services Contracts to DT Service, LLC to provide Drug and 
Alcohol Testing, in an amount not to exceed $22,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 
through 12/31/2019 with an option to extend the term for an additional year. (PP2018
-143) 

13. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to James W. Holzapfel, Esq. as a Labor 
Relations Consultant to negotiate Collective Bargaining Agreements on behalf of the 
Board of Chosen Freeholders and to act as an Administrative Hearing Officer, in an 
amount not to exceed $50,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. 
(QP2018-146) 

14. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Frank B. Holman, III to provide 
Auditing Services for the Department of Employee Relations Division of Risk 
Management and Department of Senior Services, in an amount not to exceed 
$45,500.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-147) 

15. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Monmouth Medical Center Southern 
Campus to provide Behavioral Health Services, in an amount not to exceed 
$367,845.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-148) 

16. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Ocean Mental Health Services, Inc. to 
provide Behavioral Health Services, in an amount not to exceed $1,070,075.06, for 
the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-149) 

17. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Preferred Behavioral Health of New 
Jersey to provide Behavioral Health Services, in an amount not to exceed 
$534,869.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-150) 

18. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Saint Francis Community Center 
LBICC to provide Behavioral Health Services, in an amount not to exceed 
$100,636.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-151) 

19. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Waters & Sims Employment Services, 
Inc. to provide Disability Services for Children and Adults, in an amount not to 
exceed $69,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (PP2018-153) 

20. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to LADACIN Network, Inc. to provide 
Disability Services for Children and Adults, in an amount not to exceed $43,600.00, 
for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (PP2018-154) 

21. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to The Special Children's Center to 
provide Disability Services for Children and Adults, in an amount not to exceed 
$60,750.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (PP2018-155) 

22. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Vetgroup, Inc. to provide Consultant 
Services Assistance to Ocean County Veterans, in an amount not to exceed 
$197,400.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (PP2018-168) 

23. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Shore Forensic Psychology, LLC to 
provide Pre-Employment Psychological Evaluations, in an amount not to exceed 
$17,400.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (P2018-169) 
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24. Awarding a Competitive Contract for Physician and Medical Services to Alpha 
Medical Services, Inc., for the period of three (3) years, in an amount not to exceed 
$35,100.00 for 2019, $35,808.00 for 2020, and $36,504.00 for 2021, with an option 
to extend the term for two (2) additional years. (CC2018-152) 

25. Awarding a Competitive Contract for Year One, Older Americans Act, Title III Area 
Plan Contracts to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to provide Social 
Support Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed 
$40,589.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (CC2018-156) 

26. Awarding a Competitive Contract for Year One, Older Americans Act, Title III Area 
Plan Contracts to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to provide Home 
Delivered Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed 
$37,804.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (CC2018-157) 

27. Awarding a Competitive Contract for Year One, Older Americans Act, Title III Area 
Plan Contracts to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to provide Home 
Delivered Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed 
$152,593.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (CC2018-158) 

28. Awarding a Competitive Contract for Year One, Older Americans Act, Title III Area 
Plan Contracts to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to provide Home 
Delivered Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed 
$1,484,223.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (CC2018-159) 

29. Awarding a Competitive Contract for Year One, Older Americans Act, Title III Area 
Plan Contracts to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to provide Congregate 
Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed 
$782,173.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (CC2018-160) 

30. Awarding a Competitive Contract for Year One, Older Americans Act, Title III Area 
Plan Contracts to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to provide Social 
Support Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed 
$478,749.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (CC2018-161) 

31. Awarding a Competitive Contract for Year One, Older Americans Act, Title III Area 
Plan Contracts to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to provide 
Weekend/Holiday Home Delivered Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in 
an amount not to exceed $122,405.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. 
(CC2018-162) 

32. Authorizing a five (5) year extension of time to the Competitive Contract Award with 
Atlantic Coast Fibers, LLC for the OC Recyclable Materials Processing Facility 
Operation and Maintenance Contract, for the period of 1/1/2022 through 12/31/2026. 
(CC2016-127) 

33. Authorizing a one (1) year extension of time to the Professional Services Contract 
Award to RWJ Barnabas Health Corporate Care to provide Professional Medical 
Services, in an amount not to exceed $35,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 
12/31/2019. (PP2017-130) 

34. Authorizing a one (1) year extension of time to the Professional Services Contract 
Award to Robert Wood Johnson Jr. Lifestyle Institute, Inc. dba JFK Advanced 
Medical Imaging of Toms River to provide Radiology and Other Medical Imaging 
Services, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (PP2017-151) 
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35. Amending a Competitive Contract with Ocean Mental Health Services, Inc. to 
provide In Home Counseling Services for the Youth Services Commission, an 
increase in the amount of $10,000.00. (CC2017-142) 

36. Amending a Competitive Contract with Youth Advocate Programs, Inc. to provide 
Family Court Diversion Services for the Youth Services Commission, an increase in 
the amount of $2,600.00. (CC2017-139) 

37. Amending a Competitive Contract with Youth Advocate Programs, Inc. to provide 
Mentoring Services for the Youth Services Commission, an increase in the amount of 
$15,325.00. (CC2017-140) 

38. Amending a Contract with Ocean Mental Health Services to provide Mental Health 
Services for the Prosecutor's Office, for the revised amount of $5,820.00. (PP2016-
144) 

39. Awarding a Purchase Order to Owen, Little & Associates for Land Surveying 
Services for the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund, in an amount not to exceed $1,023.00. 
(PP2018-61) 

40. Awarding a Purchase Order to French & Parrello Associates for Engineering Design 
Services for Site Preparation of office facilities on Block 608, Lot 19.01 in the 
Township of Toms River, in an amount not to exceed $154,245.00. (PP2018-118) 

41. Awarding a Purchase Order to Brinkerhoff Environmental Services, Inc. for On-Call 
Environmental Engineering Professional Services for a Phase 1 Environmental Site 
Assessment associated with the acquisition of Block 597, Lot(s) 16, 19-32, 35-38 in 
the Township of Toms River, in an amount not to exceed $4,175.00. (PP2018-101) 

42. Awarding a Purchase Order to Brinkerhoff Environmental Services, Inc. for On-Call 
Environmental Engineering Professional Services for a Phase 1 Environmental Site 
Assessment associated with the acquisition of Block 961.02, Lot(s) 3, 4 in the 
Township of Lakewood, in an amount not to exceed $2,475.00. (PP2018-101) 

43. Awarding a Purchase Order to SHI International (State Contract No. 89851) to 
provide an upgrade for Kronos and Telestaff for the timekeeping and scheduling 
systems, in an amount not to exceed $154,337.78. 

44. Qualifying firms to provide Small Road and Bridge Design Services, Various 
Locations throughout Ocean County, Where and As Directed by the County Engineer 
as follows: Bridge Design Services - twenty (20) firms: Cherry, Weber & Associates, 
P.C.; Mott MacDonald, LLC; Johnson, Mirmiran & Thompson, Inc.; Dewberry 
Engineers, Inc.; AmerCom Corporation; Keller & Kirkpatrick, Inc.; T & M 
Associates; French & Parrello Associates, PA; NV5, Inc.; Maser Consulting, PA; 
KMA Consulting Engineers, Inc.; Buchart Horn, Inc.; CME Associates; IH 
Engineers, PC; Urban Engineers, Inc.; Churchill Consulting Engineers, LLC; 
Pickering, Corts & Summerson, Inc.; Taylor, Wiseman & Taylor; Paulus, Sokolowski 
and Sartor, LLC; and W.J. Castle, P.E. & Associates, P.C. Road Design Services -
 twenty-one (21) firms: Michael Baker International, Inc.; Owen, Little & Associates, 
Inc.; Mott MacDonald, LLC; KMA Consulting Engineers, Inc.; Cherry, Weber & 
Associates, P.C.; Stantec Consulting Services, Inc.; T & M Associates; Greenman-
Pedersen, Inc.; Remington & Vernick Engineers; Van Cleef Engineering Associates, 
LLC; DW Smith Associates, LLC; ATANE Engineers, Architects and Land 
Surveyors, PC; Environmental Resolution, Inc.; Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc.; 
French & Parrello Associates, PA; Suburban Consulting Engineers, Inc.; Alaimo 
Group, Inc.; Paulus, Sokolowski and Sartor, LLC; BANC3, Inc.; CME Associates; 
and WJH Engineering, LLC, for the period of 12/19/2018 through 12/18/2019. 
(QP2018-170) 
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45. Awarding a Purchase Order to MBO Engineering, LLC to provide On-Call Traffic 
Engineering Professional Services for As Directed Traffic Intersection Evaluations, 
Various Locations in Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed $30,000.00. (PP2018
-60) 

P. APPOINTMENTS AND REAPPOINTMENTS 

1. Reappointing Martin Lynch, Manchester and Kathleen Sucharski, Plumsted 
Township to the OC AGRICULTURE DEVELOPMENT BOARD for a term of four 
(4) years, term to expire 12/31/2022. 

2. Reappointing Anthony M. Agliata, OC Planning Director and Keith J. Goetting, 
Director of OC Employee Relations to the COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT 
BLOCK GRANT COMMITTEE for a term of one (1) year, term to expire 
12/31/2019. 

3. Reappointing Anthony M. Agliata, OC Planning Department; Linda Murtagh, OC 
Board of Social Services; Marshall J. Kern, Representative, Banking/Financial; Tracy 
Maksel, OC Dept. of Human Services; Faith Liguori, Ocean Housing Alliance, Inc.; 
Carol Wolfe, Homes Now, Inc.; Channell Wilkins, O.C.E.A.N., Inc.; Representative, 
Governing Body of Brick Township; Representative, Governing Body of Jackson 
Township; Representative, Governing Body of Lakewood Township; Representative, 
Governing Body of Toms River Township; Representative, Berkeley Housing 
Authority; Representative, Brick Housing Authority; and Representative, Lakewood 
Housing Authority to the COUNTY HOUSING ADVISORY COMMITTEE 
(CHAC) for a term of one (1) year, term to expire 12/31/2019. 

4. Reappointing Daniel P. Mulligan to the position of Ocean County Fire Marshal for a 
term of three (3) years, term to expire 1/14/2022; and reappointing the following 
Assistant Fire Marshals for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 1/14/2022: Full 
Time – Dennis M. Allen, Robert D. Cook, Edward Hazelton, William Hollingsworth, 
Robert J. Ketchersid, Michael R. Marks, Thomas G. McAndrew, Brian C. Mount, 
John P. Pasola, Harry G. Roon and Raymond L. VanMarter; Part Time – Kenneth 
Balfrey, Arthur Bloomer, Brent Cunningham, Michael Gomez, David Hansen, Joseph 
Howell, Jr., Shane Leaming, Kevin D. Simon, Carl Schubauer and Leonard 
Sonnenfeld. 

5. Reappointing Heather Richards-Barone, Toms River to the OC LIBRARY 
COMMISSION for a term of five (5) years, term to expire 12/31/2023. 

6. Reappointing Ronald S. Dancer, New Egypt; John P. Dorrity, Toms River; Robert 
Rowe, Toms River; John Tritto, III, Toms River; and Lisset Wells, Manchester to the 
OC OFFICE OF SENIOR SERVICES ADVISORY COUNCIL for a term of three 
(3) years, term to expire 12/31/2021. 

7. Reappointing George Stryker, Brick as a member for a term of five (5) years, term to 
expire 1/1/2024 and John Reiser, Stafford Township as Alternate Member No. 1 for a 
term of two (2) years, term to expire 1/1/2021; both to the OC SHADE TREE 
ADVISORY COMMISSION. 

8. Reappointing Ronald S. Dancer, New Egypt and Peter M. Hartney, Jr., Surf City to 
the OC BOARD OF SOCIAL SERVICES for a term of five (5) years, term to expire 
12/31/2023. 
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9. Reappointing Angela Contillo Andersen, Long Beach Township; Robert Zeitler, 
Stafford Township; Theresa Lettman, Manchester; and Marc R. Rudman, Lakewood 
to the OC SOLID WASTE ADVISORY COUNCIL for a term of three (3) years, 
term to expire 12/31/2021. 

10. Reappointing Dr. Mary Ellen T. Carr, Brick; Jill Houston, Toms River; Norvella 
Lightbody, Toms River; and Dr. Kathleen McCormick, Bayville to the OC 
ADVISORY COMMISSION ON THE STATUS OF WOMEN for a term of three (3) 
years, term to expire 12/31/2021. 

Q. RECEIVED ITEMS 

R. RESOLUTIONS FROM GOVERNING BODIES 

1. Borough of Ocean Gate approving acquisition of Block 17, Lots 1, 1.01 and 21 by the 
OC Natural Lands Trust Fund. 

2. Township of Berkeley Ordinance No. 2018-58-OAB authorizing the donation of 
Block 796, Lots 29 & 30 and Block 797, Lots 17 & 18 to the County of Ocean, in 
accordance with N.J.S.A. 40A:12-13(b)(1). 

S. MINUTES AND MEETING NOTICES 

1. OC Commission on Child Safety and Awareness Meeting Minutes of 9/26/2018. 

2. OC Planning Board Meeting Minutes of 11/20/2018. 

3. OC Transportation Advisory Committee for Senior Citizens and Persons with 
Disabilities Meeting Minutes of 11/29/2018. 

4. OC Department of Human Services 2019 Calendar of Regularly Scheduled Meetings.

5. Commission for Individuals with Disabilities Meeting Minutes of 3/16/2018. 

6. Commission for Individuals with Disabilities Meeting Minutes of 6/1/2018. 

7. Workforce Development Board Full Board Meeting Minutes of 9/18/2018. 

8. OC Library Commission Meeting Minutes of 11/13/2018. 

9. OC Library Commission 2019 Meeting Schedule. 

T. APPROVALS 

1. Division of Local Government Services approval of three (3) items of revenue. 

U. REPORTS 

1. OC Treasurer's Report for the month of October, 2018. 
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V. FREEHOLDER COMMENTS 

W. PUBLIC COMMENTS - "Comments from members of the audience are invited at this time 
with a limit of five (5) minutes per speaker." 

X. ADJOURNMENT 
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	Meeting Agenda for Dec 19, 2018_Board Meeting Agenda
	CALL TO ORDER
	ROLL CALL
	STATEMENT€€€€Compliance with the Open Public Meetings Act
	THE PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE AND PRAYER
	MOMENT OF SILENCE in Honor of Freeholder John C. Bartlett, Jr.
	PRESENTATION
	To the Board by OC Utilities Authority Chairman John C.€Parker.

	RESOLUTION - PUBLIC HEARING
	Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory Committee to participate in the acquisition of property identified as Block 40, Lots 2, 767, 768 and 1291-1313 in the Township of Toms River totaling approximately 6.99 acres located on Cleveland Street, in a total amount not to exceed $155,000.00 plus up to $1,270.00 for property tax adjustments.
	Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory Committee to participate in the acquisition of property identified as Block 40, Lots 756 and 766 in the Township of Toms River totaling approximately 4.98 acres located on Sayreville Street, in a total amount not to exceed $110,000.00 plus up to $467.00 for property tax adjustments.
	Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory Committee to participate in the acquisition of property identified as Block 413, Lot 8 in the Township of Toms River totaling approximately 15.40 acres located on North Bay Avenue, in a total amount not to exceed $2,000,000.00 plus up to $6,304.00 for property tax adjustments.

	AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF BILLS IN BILL COMMITTEE REPORT NO. 24.
	AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF BILLS IN BILL COMMITTEE REPORT NO. E-5.
	AUTHORIZING ENGINEERING PAYMENTS TO CONTRACTORS AS LISTED BELOW:
	EDWARD H. CRAY, INC. - Construction of Long Beach Boulevard Traffic Signal Upgrades Phase B, Group 1, Long Beach Boulevard, Long Beach Township - Partial Estimate #2, $38,347.89. (B2018-29E)
	EDWARD H. CRAY, INC. - Construction of Long Beach Boulevard Traffic Signal Upgrades Phase B, Group 2, Long Beach Boulevard, Long Beach Township - Partial Estimate #1, $43,737.40. (B2018-30E)
	EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Stormwater Management Contract 2017B, Various Townships - Change Order #2, E-$19,927.73, R-$4,180.00. (B2018-06E)
	ARAWAK PAVING CO., INC. - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 2017A - Final Estimate #5, $132,357.59. (B2017-108E)
	BLACK ROCK ENTERPRISES, LLC - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 2017D - Partial Estimate #5, $67,338.89. (B2018-70E)

	RESOLUTIONS
	Authorizing the Personnel Resolution.
	Honoring Ernest J. Kuhlwein, Jr. as he retires from 30 years of dedicated service to the Ocean County Department of Solid Waste Management.
	Honoring John T. (Tom) Curcio as he retires from 11 years of dedicated service to the Ocean County Road Department.
	Authorizing the transfer of 2017 Encumbrances to Accounts Payable.
	Authorizing the cancellation of current account balances that are no longer needed.
	Amending a contract dated July 3, 2018 related to€Tax Block 608, portions of Lots 16.1, 16.2, 18 and 19; and the entirety of Block€597, Lots 16, 20-32 and 35-38 in the Township of Toms River.
	Authorizing the execution of a new Drainage Easement for the benefit of Ocean County on Block 41, Lot 32.05 in Ocean Township€and the Vacation of the Drainage Easement previously recorded in the OC Clerk's Office in Book 3926, Page 335.
	Authorizing Certified Training Instructors for the OC Police Academy, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019.
	Adopting the Title VI Affirmative Action Plan for calendar year 2019.
	Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC Board of Social Services for participation in the OC Self-Insured Workers' Compensation Program, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019.
	Authorizing a sixty (60) day€extension to the existing€Shared Services Agreement with Cumberland County to house an adjudicated juvenile on a short term commitment status.
	Authorizing a Memorandum of Understanding with Ocean Air Support Squadron for Aviation Services supporting the OC Sheriff's Department, in an amount not to exceed $15,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019.
	Authorizing the execution of two (2) Agreements for the OC Disability Awareness Through Education Program (O.C.D.A.T.E.), in an amount not to exceed $17,400.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019.€(C2018-164)
	Authorizing a Shared Services Agreement with the Toms River Board of Fire Commissioners District #1 and District #2 for cost sharing of the installation and operation of optically controlled Emergency Pre-Emptive Traffic Signal Equipment.
	Authorizing the execution of a Settlement and Release Agreement€in the matter entitled "The County of Ocean vs. Roof Management, Inc."
	Authorizing the execution of a Contract of Sale with the Township of Toms River for Tax Block 171, Lots 23 and 23Q and Tax Block 171, Lot 42, all in the Township of Toms River.

	MOTIONS
	Authorizing the Clerk of the Board to accept and/or record legal instruments.
	Approving the Minutes of the Pre-Board Meeting of 10/10/2018.
	Approving the Minutes of the Pre-Board Meeting of 10/31/2018.
	Authorizing the Master Payroll paid on 12/12/2018 for the payroll period of 11/15/2018 through 11/28/2018 and for the payroll period of 11/29/2018 through 12/12/2018, in the amount of $5,323,859.00.
	Approving the Distribution of Requests for Proposal and Requests for Qualifications for: 1) Professional Engineering Services - Solid Waste Management, Recycling and Underground Storage Tanks; 2) Arbitrage Rebate Consulting Services; 3) Consultant Services for the Establishment and Implementation of the Annual Indirect Cost Allocation Plan; 4) Special Labor Counsel; 5) Land Surveying Services for Various Projects in Ocean County, Where and As Directed by Various Departments of Ocean County; 6)€Title Binder and Commitment/Insurance and Search Services for Various Projects in Ocean County, Where and As Directed by Various Departments in Ocean County; 7)€On-Call Traffic Engineering Professional Services, Where and As Directed by the Ocean County Engineer.
	Approving the plans and specifications and authorizing the County Engineer to advertise for the receipt of bids for Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 2018D.
	Approving Miscellaneous Bills.

	BID AWARDS
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of BEAM GUIDE RAIL AND TANGENT GUIDE RAIL ELEMENTS to Chemung Supply Corp. and Road Safety Systems, LLC, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2018-142)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR THE SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT DEPARTMENT to H.A. DeHart & Son, Inc.; Eagle Truck Equipment, Inc.; Campbell Freightliner, LLC; Houpert Fleet Services; Gerhart Scale Corporation; Aquatech Hotsy DBA Aquatech-USA and Advance Scale Co., Inc., the lowest qualified bidders.€ No bids were received on one hundred and thirty-seven (137) items.€ Recommendation is made to reject items 23a, 23b, 23c and 23d as unresponsive.€ All no bid and rejected items will be rebid, with the exception of items 19a, 19b, 19c and 19d, as they are no longer needed.€ Awarded items 8a, 8b, 8c, 8d, 31b, 33a, 33b, 33c, 33d, 40a, 40b, 40c and 40d will be rebid to obtain additional vendors. (B2018-144)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of GOLF COURSE AND LANDSCAPING EQUIPMENT to Turf Equipment and Supply Co., Inc.; Blossom Lawn Center, Inc.; Central Jersey Equipment, LLC; Ocean County Equipment, Inc. DBA Ace Outdoor Power; W.W. Grainger, Inc. and Steve Green Enterprises, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were received for items 2, 4g, 4i, 38, 42 and 42a. Recommendation is made to not award item 34 and 34a as they are no longer needed.. Recommendation is made to reject items 11 and 15. No bid items 4g and€4i will not be rebid as they are no longer needed.€ Rejected items 11 and 15 as well as no bid items 2, 38, 42 and 42a will be rebid. (B2018-145)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS, AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES to Mivila Foods; Schmidt Baking Co., Inc. and Shore Restaurant & Party Supply, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2018-146)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of RIPRAP to Stavola Construction Materials, Inc. and Trap Rock Industries, LLC, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2018-147)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of AGRICULTURAL SUPPLIES to Andre & Son, Inc.; Plant Food Company, Inc.; Seeton Turf Warehouse, LLC; SiteOne Landscape Supply; Grass Roots Turf Products, Inc.; Bohonyi Corporation; Nutrien Ag Solutions, Inc. and Harrell's LLC, the lowest qualified bidders.€ No bids were received for items 1, 4, 7, 10, 29, 55, 65, 66, 78, 88, 93, 94, 95, 98, 106, 112 and 115.€ All no bid items will be rebid. (B2018-148)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS to Mid-Atlantic Truck Centre; Turf Equipment and Supply Co., Inc.; Blossom Lawn Center, Inc.; Houpert Fleet Services; GLS, Inc. T/A Van Sant Equipment and Ocean County Equipment, Inc. DBA Ace Outdoor Power, the lowest qualified bidders.€ No bids were received on three hundred and seventy-four (374) items. All no bid items will be rebid.€ One hundred and twenty-three (123) awarded items will be rebid to obtain additional vendors. (B2018-149)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of INTEGRATED PEST MANAGEMENT to Meticulous Landscaping, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder.€(B2018-150)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of SECURITY SYSTEMS INSTALLATION, MAINTENANCE, SERVICE, AND REPAIR to Absolute Protective Systems, Inc., the sole qualified bidder.€(B2018-152)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: NEW LOW FLOOR MINI VANS to Rohrer Enterprises, Inc. DBA/Rohrer Bus Sales, the lowest qualified bidder. (B2018-164)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. II to W.B. Hunt Co., Inc. and Adorama, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders.€ No bids were received for items 21 and 82.€ Recommendation is made to reject item 49 as unresponsive. No bids were received for a second time for items 21 and 82. In accordance with N.J.S.A. 40A:11-5(3) the County Purchasing Agent is given authority to enter into a negotiated contract for all no bid and rejected items. (B2018-169)
	Authorizing a one (1) year€Contract Extension for the furnishing and delivery of HEATING, VENTILATING & AIR CONDITIONING MAINTENANCE, SERVICE AND ALTERATION,€to Falasca Mechanical, Inc., for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (B2018-01)
	Rejecting all bids for the FURNISHING AND INSTALLATION OF FOUR (4) PRE-CAST VAULT TOILET RESTROOM BUILDINGS AT VARIOUS COUNTY PARKS as unresponsive and over budget. It will be rebid.
	Rejecting the sole€bid for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLE: NEW DEPLOYMENT VEHICLE as over budget.€ It will not be rebid at this time.
	Awarding a Contract for TRAFFIC SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS AT THE INTERSECTION OF COUNTY ROUTE 528 AND OBERLIN AVENUE, LAKEWOOD TOWNSHIP to Jersey Construction, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder, in the amount of $1,156,846.80. (B2018-179E)

	CHANGE ORDERS
	Authorizing Change Order No. 1 to Benjamin Harvey Construction, Inc. for the project entitled Manchester Garage€Building Improvements, a net decrease to the Contract in the amount of $1,377.22. (B2018-27CE)
	Authorizing Change Order No. 2 to Gary Kubiak & Son Electric, Inc. for the project entitled Ocean County Justice Complex Electric Service Consolidation and Plaza Rehabilitation, a no net increase to the contract. (B2017-174CE)

	CONTRACTS
	Awarding a Contract to Electronic Recyclers International, Inc. for the Collection, Transport and Recycling of Electronic Equipment, in an amount not to exceed $17,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (C2018-165)
	Awarding a Contract to New Jersey Imaging Network Toms River€East to provide the OC Medical Examiner's Office with Virtual Autopsy Services, in an amount not to exceed $40,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-138)
	Awarding a Contract to Community Medical Center, Inc. to provide the Medical Examiner€Autopsy Services, in an amount not to exceed $225,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-139)
	Awarding a Contract to Preferred Behavioral Health of NJ, Inc. to provide an Employee Assistance Program, in an amount not to exceed $36,075.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019 with an option to extend the term for an additional year. (CP2018-144)
	Awarding a Contract to National Vision Administrators, LLC, to provide a Vision Service Plan, in an amount not to exceed $100,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019 with an€option to extend the term for an additional year. (PP2018-145)
	Awarding a Contract to Remington & Vernick Engineers for Voter District Mapping Services, in an amount not to exceed $15,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-163)
	Awarding a Contract to Dominion Voting Systems, Inc.€for the Purchase of Voting Machines and Related Software Licensing and Maintenance Service, in an amount not to exceed $173,500.00 annually, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2020. (QP2018-166)
	Awarding a Contract to Advanced Computer Concepts, Inc. T/A TREC for Printing, Labeling, Binding and Mailing Services, in€an amount not to exceed $475,000.00 annually, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2020. (QP2018-167)
	Awarding Professional Services Contracts to Gerard Breton, M.D.; Ian Hood, M.D.; Ramesh C. Mahapatro, M.D.; Lyla Perez, M.D.; Dante Ragasa, M.D.; and Charles F. Siebert, Jr., M.D. to provide Forensic Pathology Services, in an amount not to exceed $600,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-140)
	Awarding Professional Services Contracts to Kedz Funeral Home; Wood Funeral Home; Colonial Funeral Home; and Tilghman Funeral Home to provide Funeral Home Services, in an amount not to exceed $360,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-141)
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to NMS Labs to provide Postmortem Toxicology Laboratory Services, in an amount not to exceed $150,000.00, for the period of 12/1/2018 through 11/30/2019. (QP2018-142)
	Awarding a Professional Services Contracts to DT Service, LLC to provide Drug and Alcohol Testing, in an amount not to exceed $22,000.00,€for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019 with an option to extend€the term for an additional year. (PP2018-143)
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to James W. Holzapfel, Esq. as a Labor Relations Consultant to negotiate Collective Bargaining Agreements on behalf of the Board of Chosen Freeholders and to act as an Administrative Hearing€Officer, in an amount not to exceed $50,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-146)
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Frank B. Holman, III to provide Auditing Services for the Department of Employee Relations Division of Risk Management and Department of Senior Services, in an amount not to exceed $45,500.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-147)
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Monmouth Medical Center Southern Campus to provide Behavioral Health Services, in an amount not to exceed $367,845.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-148)
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Ocean Mental Health Services, Inc. to provide Behavioral Health Services, in an amount not to exceed $1,070,075.06, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-149)
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Preferred Behavioral Health of New Jersey to provide Behavioral Health Services, in an amount not to exceed $534,869.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-150)
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Saint Francis Community Center LBICC to provide Behavioral Health Services, in an amount not to exceed $100,636.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (QP2018-151)
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Waters & Sims Employment Services, Inc. to provide Disability Services for Children and Adults, in an amount not to exceed $69,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (PP2018-153)
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to LADACIN Network, Inc. to provide Disability Services for Children and Adults, in an amount not to exceed $43,600.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (PP2018-154)
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to€The Special Children's Center€to provide Disability Services for Children and Adults, in an amount not to exceed $60,750.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (PP2018-155)
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Vetgroup, Inc. to provide Consultant Services Assistance to Ocean County Veterans, in an amount not to exceed $197,400.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (PP2018-168)
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Shore Forensic Psychology, LLC to provide Pre-Employment Psychological Evaluations, in an amount not to exceed $17,400.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (P2018-169)
	Awarding a Competitive Contract for Physician and Medical Services to Alpha Medical Services, Inc., for the period of three (3)€years,€in an amount not to exceed $35,100.00 for 2019, $35,808.00 for 2020, and $36,504.00 for 2021, with an option to extend the term for two (2) additional years. (CC2018-152)
	Awarding a Competitive Contract for Year One, Older Americans Act, Title III Area Plan Contracts to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County€to provide Social Support Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed $40,589.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (CC2018-156)
	Awarding a Competitive Contract for Year One, Older Americans Act, Title III Area Plan Contracts to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County€to provide Home Delivered Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed $37,804.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (CC2018-157)
	Awarding a Competitive Contract for Year One, Older Americans Act, Title III Area Plan Contracts to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County€to provide Home Delivered Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed $152,593.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (CC2018-158)
	Awarding a Competitive Contract for Year One, Older Americans Act, Title III Area Plan Contracts to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County€to provide Home Delivered Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed $1,484,223.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (CC2018-159)
	Awarding a Competitive Contract for Year One, Older Americans Act, Title III Area Plan Contracts to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County€to provide Congregate Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed $782,173.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (CC2018-160)
	Awarding a Competitive Contract for Year One, Older Americans Act, Title III Area Plan Contracts to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County€to provide Social Support Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed $478,749.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (CC2018-161)
	Awarding a Competitive Contract for Year One, Older Americans Act, Title III Area Plan Contracts to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County€to provide Weekend/Holiday Home Delivered Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed $122,405.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (CC2018-162)
	Authorizing a five (5) year extension of time to the Competitive Contract Award with Atlantic Coast Fibers, LLC for the OC Recyclable Materials Processing Facility Operation and Maintenance Contract, for the period of 1/1/2022 through 12/31/2026. (CC2016-127)
	Authorizing a one (1) year extension of time to the Professional Services Contract Award to€RWJ Barnabas Health Corporate Care to provide Professional Medical Services, in an amount not to exceed $35,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (PP2017-130)
	Authorizing a one (1) year extension of time to the Professional Services Contract Award to€Robert Wood Johnson Jr. Lifestyle Institute, Inc. dba JFK Advanced Medical Imaging of Toms River to provide Radiology and Other Medical Imaging Services, for the period of 1/1/2019 through 12/31/2019. (PP2017-151)
	Amending a Competitive Contract with Ocean Mental Health Services, Inc. to provide In Home Counseling Services for the Youth Services Commission, an increase in the amount of $10,000.00. (CC2017-142)
	Amending a Competitive Contract with Youth Advocate Programs, Inc. to provide Family Court Diversion Services for the Youth Services Commission,€an increase in the amount of $2,600.00. (CC2017-139)
	Amending a Competitive Contract with Youth Advocate Programs, Inc. to provide Mentoring€Services for the Youth Services Commission,€an increase in the amount of $15,325.00. (CC2017-140)
	Amending a Contract with Ocean Mental Health Services to provide Mental Health Services for the Prosecutor's Office, for the revised amount of $5,820.00. (PP2016-144)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to Owen, Little & Associates for Land Surveying Services for the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund, in an amount not to exceed $1,023.00. (PP2018-61)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to French & Parrello Associates for Engineering Design Services for Site Preparation€of€office€facilities on Block 608, Lot 19.01 in the Township of Toms River, in an amount not to exceed $154,245.00. (PP2018-118)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to Brinkerhoff Environmental Services, Inc. for On-Call Environmental Engineering Professional€Services for a Phase 1 Environmental Site Assessment associated with the acquisition of Block 597, Lot(s) 16, 19-32, 35-38€in the Township of Toms River, in an amount not to exceed $4,175.00. (PP2018-101)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to Brinkerhoff Environmental Services, Inc. for On-Call Environmental Engineering Professional€Services for a Phase 1 Environmental Site Assessment associated with the acquisition of Block 961.02, Lot(s) 3, 4€in the Township of Lakewood, in an amount not to exceed $2,475.00. (PP2018-101)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to SHI International (State Contract No. 89851) to provide an upgrade€for€Kronos and Telestaff for the timekeeping and scheduling systems, in an amount not to exceed $154,337.78.
	Qualifying firms to provide Small Road and Bridge Design Services, Various Locations throughout Ocean County, Where and As Directed by the County Engineer as follows: Bridge Design Services - twenty (20) firms: Cherry, Weber & Associates, P.C.; Mott MacDonald, LLC; Johnson, Mirmiran & Thompson, Inc.; Dewberry Engineers, Inc.; AmerCom Corporation; Keller & Kirkpatrick, Inc.; T & M Associates; French & Parrello Associates, PA; NV5, Inc.; Maser Consulting, PA; KMA Consulting Engineers, Inc.; Buchart Horn, Inc.; CME Associates; IH Engineers, PC; Urban Engineers, Inc.; Churchill Consulting Engineers, LLC; Pickering, Corts & Summerson, Inc.; Taylor, Wiseman & Taylor; Paulus, Sokolowski and Sartor, LLC; and W.J. Castle, P.E. & Associates, P.C. Road Design Services -€twenty-one (21) firms: Michael Baker International, Inc.; Owen, Little & Associates, Inc.; Mott MacDonald, LLC; KMA Consulting Engineers, Inc.; Cherry, Weber & Associates, P.C.; Stantec Consulting Services, Inc.; T & M Associates; Greenman-Pedersen, Inc.; Remington & Vernick Engineers; Van Cleef Engineering Associates, LLC; DW Smith Associates, LLC; ATANE Engineers, Architects and Land Surveyors, PC; Environmental Resolution, Inc.; Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc.; French & Parrello Associates, PA; Suburban Consulting Engineers, Inc.; Alaimo Group, Inc.; Paulus, Sokolowski and Sartor, LLC; BANC3, Inc.; CME Associates; and WJH Engineering, LLC, for the period of 12/19/2018 through 12/18/2019. (QP2018-170)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to MBO Engineering, LLC to provide On-Call Traffic Engineering Professional Services for As Directed Traffic Intersection Evaluations, Various Locations in Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed $30,000.00. (PP2018-60)

	APPOINTMENTS AND REAPPOINTMENTS
	Reappointing Martin Lynch, Manchester and Kathleen Sucharski, Plumsted Township to the OC AGRICULTURE DEVELOPMENT BOARD for a term of four (4) years, term to expire 12/31/2022.
	Reappointing Anthony M. Agliata, OC Planning Director and Keith J. Goetting, Director of OC Employee Relations to the COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT COMMITTEE for a term of one (1) year, term to expire 12/31/2019.
	Reappointing Anthony M. Agliata, OC Planning Department; Linda Murtagh, OC Board of Social Services; Marshall J. Kern, Representative, Banking/Financial; Tracy Maksel, OC Dept. of Human Services; Faith Liguori, Ocean Housing Alliance, Inc.; Carol Wolfe, Homes Now, Inc.; Channell Wilkins, O.C.E.A.N., Inc.; Representative, Governing Body of Brick Township; Representative, Governing Body of Jackson Township; Representative, Governing Body of Lakewood Township; Representative, Governing Body of Toms River Township; Representative, Berkeley Housing Authority; Representative, Brick Housing Authority; and Representative, Lakewood Housing Authority to the COUNTY HOUSING ADVISORY COMMITTEE (CHAC) for a term of one (1) year, term to expire 12/31/2019.
	Reappointing Daniel P. Mulligan to the position of Ocean County Fire Marshal for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 1/14/2022; and reappointing the following Assistant Fire Marshals for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 1/14/2022: Full Time – Dennis M. Allen, Robert D. Cook, Edward Hazelton, William Hollingsworth, Robert J. Ketchersid, Michael R. Marks, Thomas G. McAndrew, Brian C. Mount, John P. Pasola, Harry G. Roon and Raymond L. VanMarter; Part Time – Kenneth Balfrey, Arthur Bloomer, Brent Cunningham, Michael Gomez, David Hansen, Joseph Howell, Jr., Shane Leaming, Kevin D. Simon, Carl Schubauer and Leonard Sonnenfeld.
	Reappointing Heather Richards-Barone, Toms River to the OC LIBRARY COMMISSION for a term of five (5) years, term to expire 12/31/2023.
	Reappointing Ronald S. Dancer, New Egypt; John P. Dorrity, Toms River; Robert Rowe, Toms River; John Tritto, III, Toms River; and Lisset Wells, Manchester to the OC OFFICE OF SENIOR SERVICES ADVISORY COUNCIL for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 12/31/2021.
	Reappointing George Stryker, Brick as a member for a term of five (5) years, term to expire 1/1/2024 and John Reiser, Stafford Township as Alternate Member No. 1 for a term of two (2) years, term to expire 1/1/2021; both to the OC SHADE TREE ADVISORY COMMISSION.
	Reappointing Ronald S. Dancer, New Egypt and Peter M. Hartney, Jr., Surf City to the OC BOARD OF SOCIAL SERVICES for a term of five (5) years, term to expire 12/31/2023.
	Reappointing Angela Contillo Andersen, Long Beach Township; Robert Zeitler, Stafford Township; Theresa Lettman, Manchester; and Marc R. Rudman, Lakewood to the OC SOLID WASTE ADVISORY COUNCIL for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 12/31/2021.
	Reappointing Dr. Mary Ellen T. Carr, Brick; Jill Houston, Toms River; Norvella Lightbody, Toms River; and Dr. Kathleen McCormick, Bayville to the OC ADVISORY COMMISSION ON THE STATUS OF WOMEN for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 12/31/2021.

	RECEIVED ITEMS
	RESOLUTIONS FROM GOVERNING BODIES
	Borough of Ocean Gate approving acquisition of Block 17, Lots 1, 1.01 and 21 by the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund.
	Township of Berkeley€Ordinance No. 2018-58-OAB authorizing the donation of Block 796, Lots 29 & 30 and Block 797, Lots 17 & 18 to the County of Ocean, in accordance with N.J.S.A. 40A:12-13(b)(1).

	MINUTES AND MEETING NOTICES
	OC Commission on Child Safety and Awareness Meeting Minutes of 9/26/2018.
	OC Planning Board Meeting Minutes of 11/20/2018.
	OC Transportation Advisory Committee for Senior Citizens and Persons with Disabilities Meeting Minutes of 11/29/2018.
	OC Department of Human Services 2019 Calendar of Regularly Scheduled Meetings.
	Commission for Individuals with Disabilities Meeting Minutes of 3/16/2018.
	Commission for Individuals with Disabilities Meeting Minutes of 6/1/2018.
	Workforce Development Board Full Board Meeting Minutes of 9/18/2018.
	OC Library Commission Meeting Minutes of 11/13/2018.
	OC Library Commission 2019 Meeting Schedule.

	APPROVALS
	Division of Local Government Services approval of three (3) items of revenue.

	REPORTS
	OC Treasurer's Report for the month of€October, 2018.

	FREEHOLDER COMMENTS
	PUBLIC COMMENTS - "Comments from members of the audience are invited at this time with a limit of five (5) minutes per speaker."
	ADJOURNMENT


