
Board Meeting Agenda

Date: April 15, 2020 - 4:00 PM

Location: Administration Building
Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

A. CALL TO ORDER 

B. ROLL CALL 

C. STATEMENT    Compliance with the Open Public Meetings Act 

D. THE PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE AND PRAYER 

E. PROCLAMATIONS 

1. Proclaiming April 2020 as "Autism Awareness Month" in Ocean County. 

2. Proclaiming April 2020 as "Child Abuse Prevention Month" in Ocean County. 

3. Proclaiming April 2020 as "National Prevention of Cruelty to Animals Month" in 
Ocean County. 

4. Proclaiming the week of April 19-25, 2020 as "National Library Week" and formally 
recognizing April 21, 2020 as "National Library Workers Day" in Ocean County. 

F. ORDINANCE - PUBLIC HEARING 

1. ORDINANCE #2020-7 - An Ordinance authorizing the Reconstruction and 
Resurfacing of Various Roads all located in the County of Ocean, State of New 
Jersey, and appropriating $12,772,128.00 therefor and authorizing the Issuance of 
$12,772,128.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to 
finance the same. 
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2. ORDINANCE #2020-8 - An Ordinance authorizing the Installation of New and 
Upgraded Traffic Control Devices at Various Locations, all in the County of Ocean, 
State of New Jersey, and appropriating $1,500,000.00 therefor and authorizing the 
Issuance of $1,425,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of 
Ocean to finance the same. 

3. ORDINANCE #2020-9 - An Ordinance authorizing a Project consisting of the 
Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Certain County Roads, all located in the County 
of Ocean, State of New Jersey, and appropriating $1,500,000.00 therefor and 
authorizing the Issuance of $1,425,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of 
the County of Ocean to finance the same. 

4. ORDINANCE #2020-10 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $2,000,000.00 
from the Capital Improvement Fund for the Acquisition of Title, Rights-of-Way 
and/or Easements of Certain Parcels of Land (or parts thereof) for Road and/or 
Bridge Improvements along County Roads, all in the County of Ocean, State of New 
Jersey. 

5. ORDINANCE #2020-11 - An Ordinance authorizing the Replacement of Colonial 
Drive South Bridge, Structure No. 1518-018, Manchester Township and Colonial 
Drive North Bridge, Structure No. 1518-017, Manchester Township, all in the County 
of Ocean, State of New Jersey, and appropriating $5,000,000.00 therefor and 
authorizing the Issuance of $4,750,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of 
the County of Ocean to finance the same. 

6. ORDINANCE #2020-12 - An Ordinance authorizing the Reconstruction of Cedar 
Swamp Road (CR527), Freehold Road to Pheasant Grove Road, Phase II, located in 
the Township of Jackson, in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey and 
appropriating $2,000,000.00 therefor and authorizing the Issuance of $1,900,000.00 
in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance the same. 

7. ORDINANCE #2020-13 - An Ordinance authorizing Traffic Safety Improvements 
along County Route 528, Cedar Bridge Avenue, from Dr. Martin Luther King Drive 
to Vine Avenue, located in the Township of Lakewood, in the County of Ocean, State 
of New Jersey and appropriating $2,200,000.00 therefor and authorizing the Issuance 
of $2,090,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to 
finance the same. 

8. ORDINANCE #2020-14 - An Ordinance authorizing the Replacement of the Lake 
Shenandoah Spillway and Bridge, Structure No. 1514-012, located in the Township 
of Lakewood, in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey and appropriating 
$3,500,000.00 therefor and authorizing the Issuance of $3,325,000.00 in Bonds or 
Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance the same. 

G. AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF BILLS IN BILL COMMITTEE REPORT NO. 8. 

H. AUTHORIZING ENGINEERING PAYMENTS TO CONTRACTORS AS LISTED 
BELOW: 

1. JERSEY CONSTRUCTION, INC. - Traffic Safety Improvements at the Intersection 
of County Route 528 and Oberlin Avenue, Lakewood Township - Change Order #1, 
E-$0.00, R-$0.00. (B2018-179E) 
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2. KARKA CONSTRUCTION, INC. - Reconstruction of the Ridge Avenue and New 
Hampshire Avenue Signalized Intersection, Lakewood Township, No. II - Change 
Order #2, E-$83,861.90, R-$60,859.51. (B2018-155E) 

3. MIDLANTIC CONSTRUCTION, LLC - Replacement of Ridgeway Boulevard 
Bridge (Structure No. 1518-002), Ridgeway Boulevard over the Ridgeway Branch of 
the Toms River, Manchester Township - Partial Estimate #3, $55,723.01. (B2019-
127E) 

4. C.J. HESSE, INC. - Reconstruction of Ridgeway Boulevard from Ridgeway Branch 
Bridge to C.R. 571, Manchester Township - Change Order #1, E-$70,168.27, R-
$136,383.98. (B2019-24E) 

5. MIDLANTIC CONSTRUCTION, LLC - Replacement of Morris Boulevard Bridge 
(Structure No. 1530009), Morris Boulevard over Fox Island 
Creek, Stafford Township - Partial Estimate #5, $131,577.74. (B2019-110E) 

6. EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of 
Certain County Roads, Contract 2019A, Ocean County - Partial Estimate #8, 
$27,346.27. (B2019-43E) 

I. RESOLUTIONS 

1. Authorizing the Personnel Resolution. 

2. Authorizing the submission of a Grant Application to the New Jersey Department of 
Community Affairs, Division of Local Government Services for a County 
Coordinator Fellowship Grant, in the amount of $50,000.00 through the Local 
Efficiency Achievement Program (LEAP). 

3. Authorizing the execution of a Revised Shared Services Agreement with the Borough 
of Surf City for fire inspection services. 

4. Authorizing the Release of Bonds for Road Opening Permits. 

J. MOTIONS 

1. Authorizing the Clerk of the Board to accept and/or record legal instruments. 

2. Approving the Board Meeting Minutes of 3/18/2020. 

3. Authorizing the distribution of Requests for Proposals and/or Requests for 
Qualifications as follows: 1) Court Facility Architectural Design Services and 2)
Professional Engineering Services for Local Preliminary Engineering Study, Garden 
State Parkway Interchange 83, Toms River Township. 

4. Approving the Master Payroll paid on 4/15/2020 for the payroll period of 3/19/2020 
through 4/1/2020 and for the payroll period of 4/2/2020 through 4/15/2020, in the 
amount of $5,173,602.96. 

K. BID AWARDS 
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1. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of TRANSPORTATION OF 
RECYCLABLE MATERIALS TO R&B Debris, LLC, the lowest qualified bidder. 
(B2020-43) 

2. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of REPAIR SERVICES FOR 
VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS OR GREATER to 
Beyer Bros. Corp.; Mid-Atlantic Truck Centre, Inc.; Robert H. Hoover & Sons, Inc.; 
Johnson & Towers, Inc.; Campbell Freightliner, LLC; Cherry Valley Tractor Sales; 
Granturk Equipment Co., Inc.; H. A. DeHart & Son, Inc.; Bellmawr Truck Repair 
Co., Inc.; Houpert Fleet Services dba Houpert Truck Service; R&H Spring & Truck 
Repair, Inc.; Bergey’s Trucks, Inc. dba Bergey’s Truck Center; W.E. Timmerman 
Co., Inc.; Aquatech Hotsy, Inc. dba Aquatech-USA.com; D&W Diesel, Inc.; Jerry’s 
Towing & Diesel Repair and On-Site Fleet Service, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. 
 No bids were received for Item Nos. 3, 12, 15, 17, 18, 22, 23, 25, 27, 29, 32, 35, 36, 
37, 39, 42, 43, 47, 49 and 50.  Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 9 and 45 
as nonresponsive. All no bid and rejected items will be rebid. Item Nos. 1, 2, 4, 5, 6, 
7, 8, 10, 11, 14, 16, 19, 20, 21, 24, 26, 28, 30, 31, 33, 34, 38, 40, 41, 44, 45, 46, 48, 
51, 55, 57, 60, 61, 63, 64, 65, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74, 75, 76, 77, 78, 79, 80, 81, 82, 
83, 84 and 85 will be rebid to obtain additional vendors. (B2020-44) 

3. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS ALUMINUM 
BULKHEAD MATERIALS FOR THE RECONSTRUCTION OF BULKHEAD 
AND DRAINAGE OUTFALLS to CMI Limited Co., the sole qualified bidder.  
(B2020-51) 

4. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of STATIONERY AND OFFICE 
SUPPLIES to Office Basics, Inc. and Office Penny, LLC, the lowest qualified 
bidders. (B2020-56) 

5. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of STEEL CHANNEL POSTS 
AND TIMBER FOR SIGN POSTS to Garden State Highway Products, Inc. and 
Traffic Safety Service, LLC, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2020-57) 

6. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of WORK CLOTHES FOR 
VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS NO. II to O.D. Taragin & Bros., LLC; Keyport Army 
and Navy; and Bob Barker Company, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders.  No bids 
were received on Item No. 59.  Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 60a, 
60b, 61a, 61b, 125, 126, 127, 128, 129, 130, 131, 132, 133, 134, 135, 136, 137 and 
138 as unresponsive.  The County Purchasing Agent is given the authority to enter 
into a negotiated contract for all no bid and rejected items in accordance with 
N.J.S.A. 40A:11-5(3). (B2020-58) 

7. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of FIRST AID SUPPLIES to 
Bound Tree Medical; The Olympic Glove & Safety Co., Inc.; JML Medical, Inc.; and 
Performance Health Supply, Inc. Dba Medco Supply, Masune & Surgical Supply 
Services, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2020-53) 

8. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of CORRUGATED 
POLYETHYLENE DRAINAGE PIPE to Chemung Supply Corp. and Bridgestate 
Foundry, the lowest qualified bidders.  In the event of tie bids pursuant to N.J.S.A. 
40A:11-6.1(d), bids are awarded to the bidder(s) in closest distance to the Ocean 
County Administration Building, 101 Hooper Avenue, Toms River, NJ, using the 
address indicated on their bid documentation. (B2020-46) 

9. Authorizing a one (1) year contract extension for the furnishing and delivery of 
PLUMBING SERVICES to Timothy Peters Plumbing & Heating Co., Inc., for the 
period of 5/1/2020 through 4/30/2021. (B2019-63) 
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10. Rejecting all bids received for the furnishing and delivery of FIELD NETTING 
REPLACEMENT FOR BEAVER DAM COUNTY PARK pursuant to N.J.S.A. 
40A:11-13.2(d).  It will be rebid at a later date with revised specifications. 

11. Awarding a Contract for the REPLACEMENT OF CURB AND SIDEWALK AT 
VARIOUS LOCATIONS IN OCEAN COUNTY, CONTRACT 2020, to A. Takton 
Concrete Corp., the lowest qualified bidder,  in the amount of $783,375.00. (B2020-
64E) 

L. CHANGE ORDERS 

1. Authorizing Change Order No. 1 to Epic Mechanical, Inc. for the project 
entitled Ocean County Health Department Animal Shelter HVAC Equipment 
Replacement, a no net increase to the contract amount. (B2019-177CE) 

M. CONTRACTS 

1. Awarding a Purchase Order to Suburban Consulting Engineers, Inc. to provide 
Engineering Design Services to locate, construct and maintain three (3) connections 
to the Barnegat Branch Trail for the OC Parks and Recreation Department, in an 
amount not to exceed $34,450.00. (QP2019-123) 

2. Awarding a Contract for Voting Machine Transportation Services to Miller Auto 
Leasing Company, for the period of 5/1/2020 through 4/30/2022, in an amount not to 
exceed $35,000.00.  (C2020-66) 

3. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to James W. Casey, d/b/a Branch of Jesse, 
LLC, to serve as OC Jail Chaplain, in an amount not to exceed $34,177.56 for the 
period of April 5, 2020 through April 4, 2021.  (PP2020-65) 

4. Awarding a Purchase Order to T&M Associates to provide Environmental Consulting 
Services for the Ocean County Old Sheriff Building #21 Demolition, 118 Washington 
Street, Toms River, in an amount not to exceed $82,150.00.  (QP2019-105) 

5. Awarding a Purchase Order to T&M Associates to provide Energy Consulting 
Services for the Courthouse West Wing Steam-to-Hot Water System Conversion 
Project, in an amount not to exceed $179,500.00.  (QP2019-104) 

6. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Total Control Systems, LLC for 
Control System Engineering Services for Ocean County Movable Bridges, in an 
amount not to exceed $46,720.00. (PP2020-67) 

7. Qualifying seven (7) firms as eligible to provide Consultant Material Sampling, 
Inspection and Testing Services for Various Projects in Ocean County, Where and As 
Directed by Various Departments of the County of Ocean, on a project specific 
proposal basis, for the period of 4/18/2020 through 4/17/2021, as follows: Pennoni 
Associates, Inc.; ATANE Engineers, Architects and Land Surveyors, P.C.; French & 
Parrello Associates, P.A.; Maser Consulting P.A.; NV5 Northeast, Inc.; Princeton 
Hydro, LLC; and Atlantic Engineering Laboratories, Inc. (QP2020-68) 

8. Amending the award of a Purchase Order to Dewberry Engineers, Inc. to provide 
additional Construction Project Management for Various Road and Bridge Projects 
related to the New Jersey Natural Gas SRL Installation, CR 539 North Section from 
Monmouth Road (CR 537) to West Veterans Highway (CR 528), Plumsted 
Township, in an amount not to exceed $62,512.95. (PP2018-136) 
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9. Awarding a Purchase Order to Urban Engineers, Inc. to provide On-Call Traffic 
Engineering Professional Services for the Downtown Toms River Concept 
Development, Toms River Township, County of Ocean, in an amount not to exceed 
$194,000.00. (QP2020-58) 

N. APPOINTMENTS AND REAPPOINTMENTS 

1. Reappointing Dr. Michael W. Joyce, M.D. to the position of Assistant OC Medical 
Examiner for a term of one (1) year, commencing 4/20/2020 through 4/19/2021. 

2. Reappointing Dr. Harry L. Larkin, Jr., M.D. to the position of Assistant OC Medical 
Examiner for a term of one (1) year, commencing 5/1/2020 through 4/30/2021. 

3. Reappointing Captain David Schenk and Lieutenant Kevin J. Cooney to the position 
of OC Deputy Coordinator of Emergency Management for a term of three (3) years, 
term to expire 4/15/2023. 

4. Reappointing Elaine McCrystal, Lakewood to the OC PLANNING BOARD for a 
term of three (3) years, term to expire 4/18/2023.  

O. RECEIVED ITEMS 

P. RESOLUTIONS FROM GOVERNING BODIES 

1. Berkeley Township resolution #20-141-R authorizing a Shared Service Agreement 
with Ocean County for the Prosecutor's Program for FY2020. 

2. Manchester Township resolution #20-176 authorizing a Shared Service Agreement 
with Ocean County for the Prosecutor's Program for FY2020. 

3. Toms River Township authorizing a Shared Service Agreement with Ocean County 
for the Prosecutor's Program for FY2020. 

Q. MINUTES AND MEETING NOTICES 

1. OC Utilities Authority Meeting Minutes of 2/3/2020. 

2. OC Utilities Authority Meeting Minutes of 2/27/2020. 

3. OC Planning Board Meeting Minutes of 3/4/2020. 

4. OC Shade Tree Advisory Commission Meeting Minutes of 1/9/2020. 

R. APPROVALS 

1. Division of Local Government Services approval of seven (7) items of revenue. 

S. CORRESPONDENCE 
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1. Letter from Freeholder Director Vicari to Governor Phil Murphy regarding 
opposition to proposed toll hikes on the Garden State Parkway and the NJ Turnpike. 

2. Letter from 9th District Legislators to Freeholder Director Vicari regarding 
opposition to proposed toll hikes on the Garden State Parkway and the NJ Turnpike. 

3. Letter from 9th District Legislators to the NJ Department of Transportation and the 
NJ Turnpike Authority regarding opposition to proposed toll hikes on the Garden 
State Parkway and the NJ Turnpike. 

4. NJ Department of Transportation notice that all Federal-aid projects must comply 
with the existing statutes, regulations and implemented policies regarding the Buy 
America requirements set forth by the US Department of Transportation. 

T. FREEHOLDER COMMENTS 

U. PUBLIC COMMENTS - "Members of the audience are invited at this time with a limit of 
five (5) minutes per speaker." 

V. ADJOURNMENT 
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	Meeting Agenda for Apr 15, 2020_Board Meeting Agenda
	CALL TO ORDER
	ROLL CALL
	STATEMENT€€€€Compliance with the Open Public Meetings Act
	THE PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE AND PRAYER
	PROCLAMATIONS
	Proclaiming April 2020 as "Autism Awareness Month" in Ocean County.
	Proclaiming April 2020 as "Child Abuse€Prevention Month" in Ocean County.
	Proclaiming April 2020 as "National Prevention of Cruelty to Animals Month" in Ocean County.
	Proclaiming the week of April 19-25, 2020 as "National Library Week" and formally recognizing April 21, 2020 as "National Library Workers Day" in Ocean County.

	ORDINANCE - PUBLIC HEARING
	ORDINANCE #2020-7 - An Ordinance authorizing the Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Various Roads all located in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey, and appropriating $12,772,128.00 therefor and authorizing the Issuance of $12,772,128.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance the same.
	ORDINANCE #2020-8 - An Ordinance€authorizing the€Installation of New and Upgraded Traffic Control Devices at Various Locations, all in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey,€and appropriating $1,500,000.00 therefor and authorizing the Issuance of $1,425,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance the same.
	ORDINANCE #2020-9 - An Ordinance€authorizing€a Project consisting of the Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Certain County Roads, all located in the€County of Ocean, State of New Jersey,€and appropriating $1,500,000.00 therefor and authorizing the Issuance of $1,425,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance the same.
	ORDINANCE #2020-10 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $2,000,000.00 from the Capital Improvement Fund for the Acquisition of Title, Rights-of-Way and/or Easements of Certain Parcels of Land (or parts thereof) for Road and/or Bridge Improvements along County Roads, all in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey.
	ORDINANCE #2020-11 - An Ordinance authorizing the Replacement of Colonial Drive South Bridge, Structure No. 1518-018, Manchester Township and Colonial Drive North Bridge, Structure No.€1518-017, Manchester Township, all in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey, and appropriating $5,000,000.00 therefor and authorizing the Issuance of $4,750,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance the same.
	ORDINANCE #2020-12 - An Ordinance authorizing the Reconstruction of Cedar Swamp Road (CR527), Freehold Road to Pheasant Grove Road, Phase II, located in the Township of Jackson, in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey and appropriating $2,000,000.00 therefor and authorizing the Issuance of $1,900,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance the same.
	ORDINANCE #2020-13 - An Ordinance authorizing€Traffic Safety Improvements along€County Route 528, Cedar Bridge Avenue, from Dr. Martin Luther King Drive to Vine Avenue, located in the Township of Lakewood, in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey and appropriating $2,200,000.00 therefor and authorizing the Issuance of $2,090,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance the same.
	ORDINANCE #2020-14 - An Ordinance authorizing the Replacement of€the Lake Shenandoah Spillway and Bridge, Structure No. 1514-012, located in the Township of Lakewood, in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey and appropriating $3,500,000.00 therefor and authorizing the Issuance of $3,325,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance the same.

	AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF BILLS IN BILL COMMITTEE REPORT NO. 8.
	AUTHORIZING ENGINEERING PAYMENTS TO CONTRACTORS AS LISTED BELOW:
	JERSEY CONSTRUCTION, INC. - Traffic Safety Improvements at the Intersection of County Route 528 and Oberlin Avenue, Lakewood Township - Change Order #1, E-$0.00, R-$0.00. (B2018-179E)
	KARKA CONSTRUCTION, INC.€-€Reconstruction of the Ridge Avenue and New Hampshire Avenue Signalized Intersection, Lakewood Township, No. II€-€Change Order€#2, E-$83,861.90, R-$60,859.51. (B2018-155E)
	MIDLANTIC CONSTRUCTION, LLC€-€Replacement of Ridgeway Boulevard Bridge (Structure No. 1518-002), Ridgeway Boulevard over the Ridgeway Branch of the Toms River, Manchester€Township -€Partial Estimate€#3, $55,723.01. (B2019-127E)
	C.J. HESSE, INC.€-€Reconstruction of Ridgeway Boulevard from Ridgeway Branch Bridge to C.R. 571, Manchester€Township -€Change Order #1, E-$70,168.27, R-$136,383.98.€(B2019-24E)
	MIDLANTIC CONSTRUCTION, LLC€-€Replacement of€Morris Boulevard Bridge (Structure No. 1530009),€Morris Boulevard over€Fox Island Creek,€Stafford€Township -€Partial Estimate€#5, $131,577.74. (B2019-110E)
	EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY€-€Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads,€Contract 2019A, Ocean County€-€Partial Estimate€#8, $27,346.27. (B2019-43E)

	RESOLUTIONS
	Authorizing the Personnel Resolution.
	Authorizing the submission of a Grant Application to the New Jersey Department of Community Affairs, Division of Local Government Services for a County Coordinator Fellowship Grant, in the amount of $50,000.00 through the Local Efficiency Achievement Program (LEAP).
	Authorizing the execution of a Revised Shared Services Agreement with the Borough of Surf City for€fire inspection services.
	Authorizing the Release of Bonds for Road Opening Permits.

	MOTIONS
	Authorizing the Clerk of the Board to accept and/or record legal instruments.
	Approving the Board Meeting Minutes of 3/18/2020.
	Authorizing the distribution of Requests for Proposals and/or Requests for Qualifications as follows: 1) Court Facility Architectural Design Services and 2)

Professional Engineering Services for Local Preliminary Engineering Study, Garden State Parkway Interchange 83, Toms River Township.
	Approving the Master Payroll paid on 4/15/2020 for the payroll period of 3/19/2020 through 4/1/2020 and for the payroll period of 4/2/2020 through 4/15/2020, in the amount of $5,173,602.96.

	BID AWARDS
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of TRANSPORTATION OF RECYCLABLE MATERIALS TO R&B Debris, LLC, the lowest qualified bidder. (B2020-43)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS OR GREATER to Beyer Bros. Corp.; Mid-Atlantic Truck Centre, Inc.; Robert H. Hoover & Sons, Inc.; Johnson & Towers, Inc.; Campbell Freightliner, LLC; Cherry Valley Tractor Sales; Granturk Equipment Co., Inc.; H. A. DeHart & Son, Inc.; Bellmawr Truck Repair Co., Inc.; Houpert Fleet Services dba Houpert Truck Service; R&H Spring & Truck Repair, Inc.; Bergey’s Trucks, Inc. dba Bergey’s Truck Center; W.E. Timmerman Co., Inc.; Aquatech Hotsy, Inc. dba Aquatech-USA.com; D&W Diesel, Inc.; Jerry’s Towing & Diesel Repair and On-Site Fleet Service, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders.  No bids were received for Item Nos. 3, 12, 15, 17, 18, 22, 23, 25, 27, 29, 32, 35, 36, 37, 39, 42, 43, 47, 49 and 50.  Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 9 and 45 as nonresponsive. All no bid and rejected items will be rebid. Item Nos. 1, 2, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 10, 11, 14, 16, 19, 20, 21, 24, 26, 28, 30, 31, 33, 34, 38, 40, 41, 44, 45, 46, 48, 51, 55, 57, 60, 61, 63, 64, 65, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74, 75, 76, 77, 78, 79, 80, 81, 82, 83, 84 and 85 will be rebid to obtain additional vendors. (B2020-44)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS ALUMINUM BULKHEAD MATERIALS FOR€THE RECONSTRUCTION OF BULKHEAD AND DRAINAGE OUTFALLS to CMI Limited Co., the€sole qualified bidder.€ (B2020-51)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of STATIONERY AND OFFICE SUPPLIES to Office Basics, Inc. and Office Penny, LLC, the€lowest qualified bidders. (B2020-56)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of STEEL CHANNEL POSTS AND TIMBER FOR SIGN POSTS to Garden State Highway Products, Inc. and Traffic Safety Service, LLC, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2020-57)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS NO. II to O.D. Taragin & Bros., LLC; Keyport Army and Navy; and Bob Barker Company, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders.€€No bids were received on Item No. 59.€ Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 60a, 60b, 61a, 61b, 125, 126, 127, 128, 129, 130, 131, 132, 133, 134, 135, 136, 137 and 138 as unresponsive.€ The County Purchasing Agent is given the authority to enter into a negotiated contract for all no bid and rejected items in accordance with N.J.S.A. 40A:11-5(3). (B2020-58)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of FIRST AID SUPPLIES to Bound Tree Medical; The Olympic Glove & Safety Co., Inc.; JML Medical, Inc.; and Performance Health Supply, Inc. Dba Medco Supply, Masune & Surgical Supply Services, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2020-53)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of CORRUGATED POLYETHYLENE DRAINAGE PIPE to Chemung Supply Corp. and Bridgestate Foundry, the lowest qualified bidders.€ In the event of tie bids pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-6.1(d), bids are awarded to the bidder(s) in closest distance to the Ocean County Administration Building, 101 Hooper Avenue, Toms River, NJ, using the address indicated on their bid documentation. (B2020-46)
	Authorizing a one (1) year contract extension for the furnishing and delivery of PLUMBING SERVICES to Timothy Peters Plumbing & Heating Co., Inc., for the period of 5/1/2020 through 4/30/2021. (B2019-63)
	Rejecting all bids received for the furnishing and delivery of FIELD NETTING REPLACEMENT FOR BEAVER DAM COUNTY PARK€pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-13.2(d). €It will be rebid at a later date with revised specifications.
	Awarding a Contract for the REPLACEMENT OF CURB AND SIDEWALK AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS IN OCEAN COUNTY, CONTRACT 2020, to A. Takton Concrete Corp., the lowest qualified bidder,€ in the amount of $783,375.00. (B2020-64E)

	CHANGE ORDERS
	Authorizing Change Order No. 1 to Epic Mechanical, Inc. for the project entitled€Ocean County Health Department Animal Shelter HVAC Equipment Replacement, a no net increase to the contract amount. (B2019-177CE)

	CONTRACTS
	Awarding a Purchase Order to Suburban Consulting Engineers, Inc. to provide Engineering Design Services to locate, construct and maintain three (3) connections to the Barnegat Branch Trail for the OC Parks and Recreation Department, in an amount not to exceed $34,450.00. (QP2019-123)
	Awarding a€Contract for Voting Machine Transportation Services to Miller Auto Leasing Company, for the period of 5/1/2020 through€4/30/2022, in an amount not to exceed $35,000.00.€ (C2020-66)
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to James W. Casey, d/b/a Branch of Jesse, LLC, to serve as OC Jail Chaplain, in an amount not to exceed $34,177.56 for the period of April 5, 2020 through April 4, 2021.€ (PP2020-65)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to T&M Associates to provide Environmental Consulting Services for the Ocean County Old Sheriff Building #21 Demolition, 118 Washington Street, Toms River, in an amount not to exceed $82,150.00.€ (QP2019-105)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to T&M Associates to provide Energy Consulting Services for the Courthouse West Wing Steam-to-Hot Water System Conversion Project, in an amount not to exceed $179,500.00.€ (QP2019-104)
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Total Control Systems, LLC for Control System Engineering Services for Ocean County Movable Bridges, in an amount not to exceed $46,720.00. (PP2020-67)
	Qualifying seven (7) firms as eligible to provide Consultant Material Sampling, Inspection and Testing Services for Various Projects in Ocean County, Where and As Directed by Various Departments of the County of Ocean, on a project specific proposal basis, for the period of 4/18/2020 through 4/17/2021, as follows: Pennoni Associates, Inc.; ATANE Engineers, Architects and Land Surveyors, P.C.; French & Parrello Associates, P.A.; Maser Consulting P.A.; NV5 Northeast, Inc.; Princeton Hydro, LLC; and Atlantic Engineering Laboratories, Inc. (QP2020-68)
	Amending the award of€a Purchase Order to Dewberry Engineers, Inc. to provide additional€Construction Project Management for Various Road and Bridge Projects related to the New Jersey Natural Gas SRL Installation, CR 539 North Section from Monmouth Road (CR 537) to West Veterans Highway (CR 528), Plumsted Township,€in an amount not to exceed $62,512.95. (PP2018-136)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to Urban Engineers, Inc. to provide On-Call Traffic Engineering Professional Services for the Downtown Toms River Concept Development, Toms River Township, County of Ocean, in an amount not to exceed $194,000.00. (QP2020-58)

	APPOINTMENTS AND REAPPOINTMENTS
	Reappointing Dr. Michael W. Joyce, M.D. to the position of Assistant OC Medical Examiner for a term of one (1) year, commencing 4/20/2020 through 4/19/2021.
	Reappointing Dr. Harry L. Larkin, Jr., M.D. to the position of Assistant OC Medical Examiner for a term of one (1) year, commencing 5/1/2020 through 4/30/2021.
	Reappointing Captain David Schenk and Lieutenant Kevin J. Cooney to the position of OC Deputy Coordinator of Emergency Management for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 4/15/2023.
	Reappointing Elaine McCrystal, Lakewood to the OC PLANNING BOARD for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 4/18/2023.€

	RECEIVED ITEMS
	RESOLUTIONS FROM GOVERNING BODIES
	Berkeley Township resolution #20-141-R authorizing a Shared Service Agreement with€Ocean County for the Prosecutor's Program for FY2020.
	Manchester€Township resolution #20-176 authorizing a Shared Service Agreement with€Ocean County for the Prosecutor's Program for FY2020.
	Toms River€Township€authorizing a Shared Service Agreement with€Ocean County for the Prosecutor's Program for FY2020.

	MINUTES AND MEETING NOTICES
	OC Utilities Authority Meeting Minutes of 2/3/2020.
	OC Utilities Authority Meeting Minutes of 2/27/2020.
	OC Planning Board Meeting Minutes of 3/4/2020.
	OC Shade Tree Advisory Commission Meeting Minutes of 1/9/2020.

	APPROVALS
	Division of Local Government Services approval of seven (7) items of revenue.

	CORRESPONDENCE
	Letter from Freeholder Director Vicari to Governor Phil Murphy regarding opposition to proposed toll hikes on the Garden State Parkway and the NJ Turnpike.
	Letter from€9th District Legislators€to€Freeholder Director Vicari€regarding opposition to proposed toll hikes on the Garden State Parkway and the NJ Turnpike.
	Letter from€9th District Legislators€to€the NJ Department of Transportation and the NJ Turnpike Authority€regarding opposition to proposed toll hikes on the Garden State Parkway and the NJ Turnpike.
	NJ Department of Transportation notice that all Federal-aid projects must comply with the existing statutes, regulations and implemented policies regarding the Buy America requirements set forth by the US Department of Transportation.

	FREEHOLDER COMMENTS
	PUBLIC COMMENTS - "Members of the audience are invited at this time with a limit of five (5) minutes per speaker."
	ADJOURNMENT


