
Board Meeting Agenda

Date: March 25, 2026 - 4:00 PM

Location: Administration Building
Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

A. CALL TO ORDER

B. STATEMENT Compliance with the Open Public Meetings Act

C. ROLL CALL

D. THE PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE AND PRAYER

E. PROCLAMATIONS

1. Proclaiming the month of March 2026 as "National Nutrition Month" in Ocean 
County.

F. RESOLUTION - INTRODUCTION

1. 2026 County Budget and Accompanying Resolutions.

G. RESOLUTION - PUBLIC HEARING

1. Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory 
Committee to acquire property identified as Block 171, Lots 7 & 8, Borough of Point 
Pleasant Beach, totaling approximately 0.59 acres located on Channel Drive, in an 
amount not to exceed $2,860,000.00, plus up to $6,500.00 in property tax 
adjustments.
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H. ORDINANCE - PUBLIC HEARING

1. ORDINANCE #2026-1 - An Ordinance authorizing the Rehabilitation and Repair of 
Various Bridges, in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey, and appropriating 
$5,500,000.00 therefor and authorizing the issuance of $5,225,000.00 in Bonds or 
Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance the same.

2. ORDINANCE #2026-2 - An Ordinance authorizing the Installation of New and 
Upgraded Traffic Control Devices at Various Locations, all in the County of Ocean, 
State of New Jersey, and appropriating $5,500,000.00 therefor and authorizing the 
issuance of $5,225,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of 
Ocean to finance the same.

3. ORDINANCE #2026-3 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $5,000,000.00 from 
the Capital Improvement Fund authorizing the Development and Construction of 
Manchester Park, located in Manchester Township, County of Ocean, State of New 
Jersey.

4. ORDINANCE #2026-4 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $1,200,000.00 from 
the Capital Improvement Fund authorizing the Purchase of Prosecutor's Body 
Cameras, Software and Related Equipment for the County of Ocean, State of New 
Jersey.

I. APPROVING AND RATIFYING THE PAYMENT OF BILLS IN BILL COMMITTEE 
REPORT NO. 6.

J. APPROVING AND RATIFYING THE PAYMENT OF BILLS IN BILL COMMITTEE 
REPORT NO. E-2.

K. RESOLUTIONS

1. Authorizing the Personnel Resolution.

2. Honoring Victoria K. Pecchioli as she retires from more than 31 years of dedicated 
service to the Ocean County Planning Department.

3. Authorizing Emergency Temporary Appropriations to the 2026 Temporary County 
Budget.

4. Approving and ratifying the actions taken by the Ocean County Sheriff's Office to 
electronically submit a Grant application to the U.S. Department of Justice, Office of 
Justice Programs, Bureau of Justice Assistance for the BJA FY25 The Kevin and 
Avonte Program: Reducing Injury and Death of Missing Individuals with Dementia 
and Developmental Disabilities to allow for the procurement of two (2) Unmanned 
Aerial Systems.

5. Approving and ratifying the actions taken by the Ocean County Sheriff's Office to 
electronically submit a Grant application to the U.S. Department of Justice, Office of 
Justice Programs, Bureau of Justice Assistance for the BJA FY25 The Kevin and 
Avonte Program: Reducing Injury and Death of Missing Individuals with Dementia 
and Developmental Disabilities to allow for the procurement of a canine vehicle.

6. Authorizing the execution of fourteen (14) 2026 Tourism Promotional Matching 
Grants, in an amount not to exceed $95,540.00.
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7. Authorizing the execution of an Intergovernmental Agreement with the Borough of 
Point Pleasant Beach to provide Schedule "C" Road Department services, in an 
amount not to exceed $825,000.00, Schedule "C" Engineering Department services, 
in an amount not to exceed $35,000.00, and Schedule "C" Vehicle Services 
Department services, in an amount not to exceed $2,000.00, for the period of 
1/1/2026 through 12/31/2026, contingent upon adoption of the 2026 County Budget.

8. Authorizing the execution of a Shared Services Agreement with the OC Board of 
Social Services for administration of the FY2025 HOME Tenant-Based Rental 
Assistance Program, in the amount of $500,000.00.

9. Authorizing the execution of a Shared Services Agreement with a participating 
municipality for the FY26 Drug Recognition Expert Callout Program, for the period 
of 10/1/2025 through 9/30/2026.

10. Authorizing the execution of a Shared Services Agreement with a participating 
municipality for the FY26 Driving While Intoxicated Enforcement Program, for the 
period of 10/1/2025 through 9/30/2026.

11. Authorizing the execution of an Agreement with Manchester Township for the New 
Jersey Superior Court Ocean Vicinage's Use of Facilities at the Manchester 
Municipal Courtroom, effective 3/12/2026.

12. Approving and ratifying the actions taken by the Ocean County Prosecutor to 
electronically execute a Federal Equitable Sharing Agreement with the U.S. 
Department of Justice and the U.S. Department of the Treasury for the OC 
Prosecutor's Office to assist in Organized Crime Drug Enforcement Task Force 
investigations and prosecutions, for the period of 1/1/2026 through 12/31/2026.

13. Accepting the results of the auction and authorizing the sale of property identified as 
Block 77, Lot 38.02, Plumsted Township, in the amount of $825,000.00.

14. Accepting the results of the auction and authorizing the sale of property identified as 
Block 82, Lot 1.12, Plumsted Township, in the amount of $797,500.00.

15. Authorizing the execution of a Mortgage and Mortgage Note Modification 
Agreement and a Deferred Loan Agreement Modification under the CDBG Housing 
Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the OC Planning Director, an increase in 
the amount of $2,060.00. (C2025-74)

16. Authorizing the execution of a Mortgage and Mortgage Note Modification 
Agreement and a Deferred Loan Agreement Modification under the HOME Housing 
Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the OC Planning Director, an increase in 
the amount of $7,000.00. (C2026-41)

17. Authorizing an amendment to the OC First Time Homebuyer Program Guidelines, to 
reflect the increased grant subsidy, in the amount of $25,000.00.

18. Authorizing the use of FY2023 and FY2024 HOME funds for the FY2026 First Time 
Homebuyer Activities. (CC2026-54)

19. Authorizing the Office of County Counsel to take all necessary legal action to 
intervene on behalf of the County of Ocean in seeking the disgorgement of funds 
diverted from the 9-1-1 System and Emergency Response Trust Fund account.
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20. Authorizing the execution of an Easement Agreement with the Department of the Air 
Force for various parcels associated with the new overpass bridge structure and 
realignment of C.R. 539 (Whiting-New Egypt Road over Ridge Way) at Joint Base 
McGuire-Dix-Lakehurst, Jackson and Plumsted Townships.

21. Approving and endorsing the OC Workforce Development Board Strategic Plan 
Modifications 2022-2026.

22. Adopting the revised Bylaws of the OC Homelessness Trust Fund Task Force.

23. Amending the fee schedule of the OC Golf Course at Atlantis and OC Golf Course at 
Forge Pond to include additional specific fee programs and services.

24. Authorizing the Release of Bonds for Road Opening Permits.

25. Supporting Senate Bill No. S1125 to prioritize the distribution of 9-1-1 System and 
Emergency Response Trust Fund monies.

26. Supporting the Safeguard American Voter Eligibility (SAVE) Act.

27. Urging the State of New Jersey to uphold the established age-related requirements 
governing adult communities.

28. Opposing proposed budget cuts to the Stay NJ Property Tax Relief Program for 
Senior Citizens.

29. Authorizing the execution of a Revised Shared Services Agreement with the Borough 
of Beach Haven for Fire Inspection Services, term to expire 12/31/2028.

30. Authorizing the execution of a Revised Shared Services Agreement with the Borough 
of South Toms River for Fire Inspection Services, term to expire 12/31/2028.

L. MOTIONS

1. Authorizing the Clerk of the Board to accept and/or record legal instruments.

2. Approving the Preliminary Board Meeting Minutes of 2/4/2026.

3. Approving the Preliminary Board Meeting Minutes of 2/25/2026.

4. Approving and Ratifying the Master Payroll paid on 3/11/2026 for the payroll period 
of 2/12/2026 through 2/25/2026, with Elected Officials paid to date, in the amount of 
$7,328,576.24.

5. Approving the distribution of Requests for Qualifications and/or Requests for 
Proposals, as follows: 1) Construction Project Management for Building and Site 
Development and 2) Multi-Media Advertising Platforms.

6. Approving the plans and specifications and authorizing the County Engineer to 
advertise for the receipt of bids for the Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of 
Certain County Roads, Contract 2024E, Various Townships.

7. Approving the Master Payroll paid on 3/25/2026 for the payroll period of 2/26/2026 
through 3/11/2026, with Elected Officials paid to date, in the amount of 
$7,172,074.78.
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M. TRAFFIC SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS

1. Authorizing the execution of an Agreement with the Township of Lakewood for the 
installation of a traffic signal at the intersection of County Road #93 (Route 623-New 
Hampshire Avenue) and County Road #40 (Chestnut Street), Township of Lakewood. 
(LKWD-84)

2. Authorizing the alteration of No Passing Zones along County Road #8 (Frank 
Applegate Road-Butterfly Road), Township of Jackson.

3. Authorizing the alteration of Speed Zones along County Road #40 (West Princeton 
Avenue), Township of Brick.

4. Authorizing the alteration of Speed Zones along County Road #67 (River Road), 
Township of Brick and Borough of Point Pleasant.

5. Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #2 
(Route 554-West Bay Avenue) and County Road #11 (Nautilus Drive), Township of 
Barnegat. (BRNT-7)

6. Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #91 
(Route 621-Grand Central Parkway) and Northern Boulevard (formerly Northern 
Boulevard and Park Avenue), Township of Berkeley. (BRKLY-17)

7. Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #11 
(Route 549-Hooper Avenue) and Ocean County Mall and Bey Lea Plaza, Township 
of Toms River. (DVR-20)

8. Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #54 
(Route 571-Route 549 Spur-Fischer Boulevard) and County Road #27 (Route 571-
Bay Avenue), Township of Toms River. (DVR-33)

9. Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #22 
(Route 638-Jackson Mills Road) and County Road #18 (Harmony Road), Township 
of Jackson. (JK-28)

10. Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #5 
(Route 527-East Veterans Highway) and County Road #8 (Butterfly Road) and Grand 
Boulevard, Township of Jackson. (JK-43)

11. Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #33 
(Route 614-Lacey Road) and Newark Avenue, Township of Lacey. (LCY-6)

12. Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #3 
(Route 639-North Hope Chapel Road) and North Lake Drive, Township of 
Lakewood. (LKWD-36)

13. Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #27 
(Route 571-Ridgeway Road) and Renaissance Drive, Township of Manchester. 
(MAN-9)

N. BID AWARDS
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1. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of WELL SYSTEMS 
INSTALLATION, MAINTENANCE, SERVICE AND REPAIR to Jersey Shore 
Lawn Sprinkler Company, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder. (B2026-21)

2. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of RIPRAP to Green Dream 
International LLC and Herman's Trucking, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders.  (B2026
-22)

3. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of INMATE COMMISSARY 
AND BANKING SERVICES to Keefe Commissary Network LLC, the sole qualified 
bidder.  (B2026-23)

4. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of GENERATOR 
ALTERATION, MAINTENANCE, SERVICE AND REPAIR to Penn Power Group 
LLC dba Penn Power Systems, the lowest qualified bidder. (B2026-24)

5. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of LOCKSMITH SERVICES 
FOR SECURITY LOCKING SYSTEMS AND DETENTION EQUIPMENT to 
Northstar Prison Maintenance and Repair LLC, the lowest qualified bidder. (B2026-
25)

6. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of SAND, GRAVEL, STONE 
AND TOPSOIL to Brick Wall Corporation; Britton Industries LLC; Eagles Lake 
Reserve, Inc.; Gibraltar Rock, Inc.; Mazza Mulch, Inc.; and Stavola Construction 
Materials LLC, the lowest qualified bidders.  No bids were received on Item Nos. 5, 
12, 13A, 13B, 13C, 20C, 23A, 23B and 23C.  Recommendation is made to reject 
Item Nos. 2, 3, 11, 15A, 15B, 15C, 16A, 16B, 16C, 18A, 18B, 18C, 19A, 19B, 19C, 
20A, 20B, 24A, 24B, 24C, 26A, 26B, 26C, 27A, 27B and 27C as unresponsive. All 
no bid and rejected items will be rebid. (B2026-28)

7. Awarding a Contract for SUPPLEMENTARY VEHICLE TOWING AND 
ROADSIDE SERVICES to Freedom Towings and Recovery LLC, the sole qualified 
bidder.  (B2026-29)

8. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS EQUIPMENT 
FOR THE TRAFFIC DIVISION to Mobotrex, LLC, the lowest qualified bidder.  No 
bids were received on four hundred and sixty-five (465) items.   Recommendation is 
made to reject Item Nos. 32, 33, 39, 40, 41, 42, 50, 63, 71, 72, 74, 77, 79, 81, 84, 87, 
88, 91, 92, 93, 94, 95, 96, 97, 99, 102, 103, 104, , 177, 178, 179, 187, 281, 286, 287, 
288, 307, 308 and 349 as unresponsive.  All no bid and rejected items will be rebid. 
(B2026-30)

9. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS ALUMINUM 
BULKHEAD MATERIALS to CMI Limited Co., the sole qualified bidder. (B2026-
31)

10. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of DUCTILE IRON CULVERT 
PIPE to Brent Material Company and Core & Main LP, the lowest qualified bidders. 
(B2026-32)

11. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of STEEL CHANNEL POSTS 
AND TIMBER FOR SIGN POSTS to National Highway Products, Inc. and Traffic 
Safety Service LLC, the lowest qualified bidders.  (B2026-33)
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12. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of REPAIR SERVICES FOR 
VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER to R.J. 
Sherman & Associates, Inc. dba Vermeer North Atlantic Sales & Service; Able Ford 
of New Jersey dba All American Ford; Bellmawr Truck Repair Co., Inc.; Cherry 
Valley Tractor Sales, Inc.; D&W Diesel, Inc.; Foley Incorporated; Freedom Towings 
and Recovery LLC; Granturk Equipment Co., Inc.; H.A. DeHart & Son, Inc.; 
Hoffman International, Inc.; Houpert Fleet Services LLC; Hudson County Motors, 
Inc.; Hunter Truck; Johnson & Towers LLC; Kenco Acquisition Corporation; On-
Site Fleet Service, Inc.; Orchards Hydraulic Service, Inc.; Robert H. Hoover & Sons, 
Inc.;  Schimpfs Garage LLC; The Norcia Corporation and United Ford LLC, the 
lowest qualified bidders.  Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 1, 3, 4, 8, 9, 
11, 12, 15, 17, 18, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 39, 42, 
46, 47, 48, 50, 53 and 54 as unresponsive.  They will be rebid.  Awarded Item Nos. 5, 
6, 10, 16, 32, 38, 40, 41, 43, 45, 51, 52, 64, 68, 73,74, 75, 77, 78, 79, 81 88 and 89 
will be rebid to obtain additional vendors. (B2026-34)

13. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of AUTOMATED EXTERNAL 
DEFIBRILLATORS AND SUPPLIES to Lifesavers, Inc., the lowest qualified 
bidder. (B2026-36)

14. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of CORRUGATED 
POLYETHYLENE DRAINAGE PIPE to Brent Material Company and Chemung 
Supply Corp, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2026-37)

15. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of CATIONIC ASPHALT 
EMULSION to Asphalt Paving Systems, Inc., the sole qualified bidder. (B2026-38)

16. Awarding a Contract for the RECONSTRUCTION AND RESURFACING OF 
PORTIONS OF CERTAIN COUNTY ROADS, CONTRACT 2024C, VARIOUS 
TOWNSHIPS to Earle Asphalt Company, the lowest qualified bidder, in the amount 
of $2,449,513.13. (B2026-45E)

17. Rescinding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of PROMOTIONAL ITEMS 
from Brandito dba Inkwell Global Marketing, as the vendor is unwilling to honor 
their contract. Item Nos. 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9 and 10 will not be rebid. (B2025-121)

18. Rescinding the Contract for the furnishing and delivery of LONG TERM SERVICE 
AND MAINTENANCE CONTRACT FOR COGENERATION SYSTEM AT THE 
COUNTY JUSTICE COMPLEX from Foley, Incorporated, as the vendor is unable to 
honor their contract. It will be rebid. (B2025-127)

19. Rescinding AGRICULTURAL SUPPLIES Item No. 41 from Heritage Landscape 
Supply Group, Inc., as the vendor is unable to honor their contract pricing.  
Recommendation is made to award Item No. 41 to Noble Turf LLC, the next lowest 
qualified bidder. (B2025-190)

20. Authorizing a vendor name change to the Contract for the furnishing and delivery of 
GOLF CARTS FOR OCEAN COUNTY GOLF COURSES from KLBL, LLC dba 
Vic Gerard Golf Cars, to Mid-Atlantic Golf Cars, LLC. (B2024-168)

21. Authorizing the transfer of a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of UNIFORMS 
FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS from Action Uniform Co., LLC to Galls, LLC. 
(B2025-136)

22. Authorizing the transfer of a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of UNIFORMS 
FOR LAW ENFORCEMENT OFFICERS from Action Uniform Co., LLC to Galls, 
LLC. (B2025-159)
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23. Amending Resolution No. 2026000260 adopted on 3/4/2026 awarding a Contract for 
the furnishing and delivery of AGRICULTURAL SUPPLIES NO. II to Priority 
Group Services LLC, to reflect the correct contract period of 3/4/2026 through 
1/14/2027. (B2026-26)

O. CHANGE ORDERS

1. Awarding Change Order No. 4 to Earle Asphalt Company for the project entitled 
Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 
2021A, an increase to the Contract in an amount not to exceed $78,475.52. (B2023-
106E)

P. CONTRACTS

1. Qualifying Max Spann Real Estate & Auction Co. as eligible to provide 
Auctioneering Services for the Sale of Various Types of Real Property on a project 
specific basis, for the period of 4/3/2026 through 4/2/2027. (QP2026-48)

2. Awarding a Competitive Contract to O.C.E.A.N., Inc. for administration of the First 
Time Homebuyer Activities FY2026, in the amount not to exceed $48,000.00 
annually, for the period of 4/17/2026 through 4/16/2028. (CC2026-49)

3. Awarding a Contract to Miller Auto Leasing Company to provide Voting Machine 
Transportation Services, for the period of 5/1/2026 through 4/30/2028, in the amount 
not to exceed $70,000.00 annually, with partial funding contingent upon adoption of 
the 2026 County Budget, 2027 Temporary County Budget and 2027 County Budget. 
(CP2026-50)

4. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to James W. Casey dba Branch of Jesse 
LLC, to serve as Correctional Chaplain, for the period of 4/5/2026 through 4/4/2027, 
in an amount not to exceed $41,500.00, contingent upon adoption of the 2026 County 
Budget. (QP2026-51)

5. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Marchetti Bros. LLC dba Total Control 
Systems, to provide Control System Engineering Services for Ocean County Movable 
Bridges, in an amount not to exceed $134,248.80, for the period of 3/25/2026 through 
3/24/2027. (PP2026-52)

6. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Mott MacDonald LLC, to provide 
Professional Engineering Services - Solid Waste Management and Recycling, in the 
estimated amount of $367,000.00, for the period of 3/25/2026 through 3/24/2027. 
(QP2026-53)

7. Awarding a Purchase Order to ACT Engineers, Inc. to provide On-Call 
Environmental Engineering Professional Services for Soil Investigations for Future 
Stormwater Management Facilities, Lakewood Township, in an amount not to exceed 
$93,261.40. (QP2025-76)

8. Awarding a Purchase Order to T&M Associates to provide Road Design Services to 
provide Consulting Services for Project Labor Agreements as related to upcoming 
Road and Bridge Projects, Various Townships, in an amount not to exceed 
$13,436.83. (QP2025-124)
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9. Terminating the Agreement with Axon Enterprise, Inc. (New Jersey State Contract 
No. 17-FLEET-00738) for the provision of body worn cameras, including all 
necessary hardware, software, storage, retrieval and ancillary equipment for the OC 
Sheriff's Office, effective 1/31/2026.

10. Awarding a Purchase Order to Axon Enterprise, Inc. (New Jersey State Contract No. 
17-FLEET-00738) to provide body worn cameras and accessories for the OC 
Sheriff's Department, in an amount not to exceed $841,827.04, for the period of 
2/1/2026 through 1/31/2031, with partial funding contingent upon adoption of the 
2027, 2028, 2029, 2030 and 2031 Temporary County Budgets and 2026, 2027, 2028, 
2029 and 2030 County Budgets.

11. Awarding a Purchase Order to AllRisk, Inc. (Contract No. ESCNJ 22/23-23) to 
provide asbestos abatement services at 212 Washington Street, Toms River, in an 
amount not to exceed $60,807.57.

12. Amending a Community Housing Development Organization (CHDO) Agreement 
with Ocean Housing Alliance, Inc. for the project entitled Rehabilitation of Joan 
Valentine House rental units located in Point Pleasant Beach, NJ, for additional 
renovation costs for flooring, an increase to the Contract in the amount of $28,057.96. 
(CP2023-41)

13. Amending the award of a Purchase Order to Johnson, Mirmiran & Thompson, Inc. to 
provide additional On-Call Traffic Engineering Professional Services for the 
intersection of CR 549 (Hooper Avenue) and CR 620 (Church Road/Kettle Creek 
Road), Toms River Township, an increase to the Contract in an amount not to exceed 
$49,993.74. (QP2021-63)

14. Amending the award of a Purchase Order to T&M Associates to provide additional 
Construction Project Management and Inspection Services for the Reconstruction of 
Cross Street, Route 626, from Augusta Boulevard to State Highway Route 9, 
Lakewood Township, an increase to the Contract in an amount not to exceed 
$9,788.95. (QP2022-155)

15. Amending a Resolution adopted on 2/11/2026 awarding Professional Services 
Agreements for Title Binder and Commitment / Insurance Search Services for 
Various Projects in Ocean County, to reflect the correct Special Projects Account 
number. (QP2026-33)

16. Rejecting all responses received for the RFP titled Creation, Design and Production 
of Video/Audio for Ocean County No. II as overbudget pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-
13.2(a) and pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-13.2(c) as the governing body has decided to 
abandon the project for the provision or performance of the goods and services.

Q. APPOINTMENTS AND REAPPOINTMENTS

1. Appointing Jellena Solan, Toms River as a new member and reappointing Linda 
Kelly, Manchester as a member of the CATTUS ISLAND COUNTY PARK 
ADVISORY COUNCIL, effective 4/1/2026, for a term of three (3) years, term to 
expire 3/31/2029.

2. Appointing Hunter Hawk, Waretown and Adam Ellender, Long Beach Township to 
the position of Assistant Fire Marshal, effective 3/30/2026, for an initial term to 
expire 1/14/2027.
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3. Reappointing Captain David E. Schenk and Chief Warrant Officer, Kevin Fennessy 
to the position of OC DEPUTY COORDINATOR OF EMERGENCY 
MANAGEMENT, effective 4/16/2026, for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 
4/15/2029.

4. Reappointing Leslie R. Cauvin, D.O., to the position of Assistant OC Medical 
Examiner for a term of one (1) year, effective 3/1/2026, term to expire 2/28/27.

5. Reappointing Harry L. Larkin, M.D., to the position of Assistant OC Medical 
Examiner for a term of one (1) year, effective 5/1/2026, term to expire 4/30/27.

6. Reappointing Kevin Douthitt, Long Beach Township; Michael Gesicki, Manahawkin; 
John J. Hess, Barnegat; Wayne E. Mauro, Esq., Waretown; Daniel B. Palumbo, 
Lanoka Harbor; David T. Peck, III, Whiting; Arthur Telfeian, BSN, ATP, Cream 
Ridge; Richard Ritorto, Manchester; and Frank Work, Jr., Toms River as citizen 
members of the OC AIRPARK ADVISORY COMMITTEE, effective 3/15/2026, for 
a term of one (1) year, term to expire 3/14/2027.

7. Reappointing Elaine McCrystal, Lakewood as a member of the OC PLANNING 
BOARD, effective 4/19/2026, for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 4/18/2029.

8. Reappointing Michael T. Mangum, Parkertown as a member for a term of five (5) 
years, term to expire 1/1/2031; and Timothy Chamberlain, Point Pleasant Beach as an 
Alternate Member No. 2 for a term of two (2) years, term to expire 1/1/2028, both 
effective 1/2/2026, to the OC SHADE TREE ADVISORY COMMISSION.

9. Rescinding the reappointment of David J. Hansen to the position of Part-Time 
Assistant Fire Marshal, effective 3/1/2026.

R. RECEIVED ITEMS

S. RESOLUTIONS FROM GOVERNING BODIES

1. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 71(26) authorizing the acceptance of the OC 
Comprehensive Alcoholism and Drug Abuse Grant from the NJ Department of 
Human Services, Division of Mental Health and Addiction Services, in the amount of 
$1,367,555.00, for the period of 1/1/2026 through 12/31/2026; and additional grant 
match funding in the amount of $215,748.00 has been appropriated by the OC Board 
of Health in the 2026 Budget.

2. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 77(26) approving the correction of a 
typographical error in Resolution No. 345(25) to reflect the corrected FY2027 
LACADA funding recommendations, in an amount not to exceed $283,930.00.

3. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 78(26) recommending reappointments to the 
Local Advisory Committee on Alcoholism and Drug Abuse (LACADA).

4. OC Board of Social Services, Resolution No. 2026-02-09 proclaiming April 7, 2026 
as "National Service Recognition Day" and the week of April 19-25, 2026 as 
"National Volunteer Week."

5. OC Board of Social Services, Resolution No. 2026-02-11 proclaiming the month of 
May 2026 as "Older Americans Month."
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6. OC Utilities Authority, Resolution No. 26-12818 authorizing the execution and 
delivery of the Loan Agreements to be executed by the Ocean County Utilities 
Authority and each of the New Jersey Infrastructure Bank and the State of New 
Jersey, acting by and through the Department of Environmental Protection and 
further authorizing the execution and delivery of the Escrow Agreement, all pursuant 
to the State Fiscal Year 2026 New Jersey Water Bank.

7. Monmouth County, Resolution No. 2026-0221 supporting Senate Concurrent 
Resolution No. 106 (Scutari, D-22) which would determine that the New Jersey 
Protecting Against Climate Threats (PACT)/Resilient Environment and Landscape 
(REAL) rules are inconsistent with legislative intent.

8. Morris County, Resolution No. 2026-236 supporting Senate Concurrent Resolution 
No. 106 (Scutari, D-22) which would determine that the New Jersey Protecting 
Against Climate Threats (PACT)/Resilient Environment and Landscape (REAL) 
rules are inconsistent with legislative intent.

9. Point Pleasant Beach Borough, Resolution No. 2026-0317/1L proclaiming April 7, 
2026 as "National Service Recognition Day" and the week of April 19-25, 2026 as 
"National Volunteer Week."

10. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 102(26) proclaiming the month of April 2026 as 
"National Alcohol Awareness Month."

11. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 103(26) proclaiming the month of April 2026 as 
"Minority and Multicultural Health Month."

12. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 104(26) proclaiming the month of April 2026 as 
"National Youth Sports Safety Month."

13. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 105(26) proclaiming the month of April 2026 as 
"National Distracted Drivers Month."

14. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 106(26) proclaiming the month of April 2026 as 
"Autism Acceptance Month."

15. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 108(26) proclaiming the week of April 19-25, 
2026 as "National Volunteer Week."

16. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 110(26) proclaiming the week of April 20-27, 
2026 as "National Infant Immunization Week."

17. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 111(26) proclaiming April 30, 2026 as "National 
Adopt a Shelter Pet Day."

18. Toms River Township, Resolution No. L-Feb 25, 2026-08 consenting to the Mayor's 
appointment of Chief Guy Maire as OEM Coordinator and Deputy Emergency 
Management Coordinators for the Township of Toms River.

19. Seaside Heights Borough, Resolution No. 26-113 opposing the NJDEP "Real" Rules 
in their current form.

T. MINUTES AND MEETING NOTICES

1. OC Planning Board, 2/11/2026 Meeting Minutes.
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2. OC Advisory Commission on the Status of Women, 2/10/2026 Meeting Minutes.

3. OC Tourism Business Advisory Council, 2/9/2026 Meeting Minutes.

4. OC Board of Health, 2/4/2026 Meeting Minutes.

5. OC Cultural & Heritage Commission, 1/20/2026 Meeting Minutes.

6. OC Library Commission, 1/20/2026 Reorganization Meeting Minutes.

7. OC Library Commission, 1/20/2026 Regular Meeting Minutes.

8. OC Library Commission, 1/28/2026 Special Meeting Minutes.

9. OC Homelessness Trust Fund Task Force, 1/8/2026 Meeting Minutes.

10. OC Opioid Advisory Council, 12/4/2025 Meeting Minutes.

11. OC Construction Board of Appeals, 3/12/2026 Meeting Cancellation Notice.

12. OC Library Commission, 2/17/2026 Regular Meeting Minutes.

13. OC Board of Health, 3/4/2026 Meeting Minutes.

14. OC College Board of Trustees, 3/26/2026 Meeting Notice.

15. OC Workforce Development Board, 12/9/2025 Meeting Minutes.

16. OC Environmental Agency, 2/19/2026 Meeting Minutes.

17. OC Mosquito Extermination Commission, 3/2/2026 Meeting Minutes.

U. COMMISSIONER COMMENTS

V. PUBLIC COMMENTS - "Comments from members of the audience are invited at this time 
with a limit of five (5) minutes per speaker."

W. ADJOURNMENT
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	Meeting Agenda for Mar 25, 2026_Board Meeting Agenda
	CALL TO ORDER
	STATEMENT Compliance with the Open Public Meetings Act
	ROLL CALL
	THE PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE AND PRAYER
	PROCLAMATIONS
	Proclaiming the month of March 2026 as "National Nutrition Month" in Ocean County.

	RESOLUTION - INTRODUCTION
	2026 County Budget and Accompanying Resolutions.

	RESOLUTION - PUBLIC HEARING
	Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory Committee to acquire property identified as Block 171, Lots 7 & 8, Borough of Point Pleasant Beach, totaling approximately 0.59 acres located on Channel Drive, in an amount not to exceed $2,860,000.00, plus up to $6,500.00 in property tax adjustments.

	ORDINANCE - PUBLIC HEARING
	ORDINANCE #2026-1 - An Ordinance authorizing the Rehabilitation and Repair of Various Bridges, in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey, and appropriating $5,500,000.00 therefor and authorizing the issuance of $5,225,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance the same.
	ORDINANCE #2026-2 - An Ordinance authorizing the Installation of New and Upgraded Traffic Control Devices at Various Locations, all in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey, and appropriating $5,500,000.00 therefor and authorizing the issuance of $5,225,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance the same.
	ORDINANCE #2026-3 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $5,000,000.00 from the Capital Improvement Fund authorizing the Development and Construction of Manchester Park, located in Manchester Township, County of Ocean, State of New Jersey.
	ORDINANCE #2026-4 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $1,200,000.00 from the Capital Improvement Fund authorizing the Purchase of Prosecutor's Body Cameras, Software and Related Equipment for the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey.

	APPROVING AND RATIFYING THE PAYMENT OF BILLS IN BILL COMMITTEE REPORT NO. 6.
	APPROVING AND RATIFYING THE PAYMENT OF BILLS IN BILL COMMITTEE REPORT NO. E-2.
	RESOLUTIONS
	Authorizing the Personnel Resolution.
	Honoring Victoria K. Pecchioli as she retires from more than 31 years of dedicated service to the Ocean County Planning Department.
	Authorizing Emergency Temporary Appropriations to the 2026 Temporary County Budget.
	Approving and ratifying the actions taken by the Ocean County Sheriff's Office to electronically submit a Grant application to the U.S. Department of Justice, Office of Justice Programs, Bureau of Justice Assistance for the BJA FY25 The Kevin and Avonte Program: Reducing Injury and Death of Missing Individuals with Dementia and Developmental Disabilities to allow for the procurement of two (2) Unmanned Aerial Systems.
	Approving and ratifying the actions taken by the Ocean County Sheriff's Office to electronically submit a Grant application to the U.S. Department of Justice, Office of Justice Programs, Bureau of Justice Assistance for the BJA FY25 The Kevin and Avonte Program: Reducing Injury and Death of Missing Individuals with Dementia and Developmental Disabilities to allow for the procurement of a canine vehicle.
	Authorizing the execution of fourteen (14) 2026 Tourism Promotional Matching Grants, in an amount not to exceed $95,540.00.
	Authorizing the execution of an Intergovernmental Agreement with the Borough of Point Pleasant Beach to provide Schedule "C" Road Department services, in an amount not to exceed $825,000.00, Schedule "C" Engineering Department services, in an amount not to exceed $35,000.00, and Schedule "C" Vehicle Services Department services, in an amount not to exceed $2,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2026 through 12/31/2026, contingent upon adoption of the 2026 County Budget.
	Authorizing the execution of a Shared Services Agreement with the OC Board of Social Services for administration of the FY2025 HOME Tenant-Based Rental Assistance Program, in the amount of $500,000.00.
	Authorizing the execution of a Shared Services Agreement with a participating municipality for the FY26 Drug Recognition Expert Callout Program, for the period of 10/1/2025 through 9/30/2026.
	Authorizing the execution of a Shared Services Agreement with a participating municipality for the FY26 Driving While Intoxicated Enforcement Program, for the period of 10/1/2025 through 9/30/2026.
	Authorizing the execution of an Agreement with Manchester Township for the New Jersey Superior Court Ocean Vicinage's Use of Facilities at the Manchester Municipal Courtroom, effective 3/12/2026.
	Approving and ratifying the actions taken by the Ocean County Prosecutor to electronically execute a Federal Equitable Sharing Agreement with the U.S. Department of Justice and the U.S. Department of the Treasury for the OC Prosecutor's Office to assist in Organized Crime Drug Enforcement Task Force investigations and prosecutions, for the period of 1/1/2026 through 12/31/2026.
	Accepting the results of the auction and authorizing the sale of property identified as Block 77, Lot 38.02, Plumsted Township, in the amount of $825,000.00.
	Accepting the results of the auction and authorizing the sale of property identified as Block 82, Lot 1.12, Plumsted Township, in the amount of $797,500.00.
	Authorizing the execution of a Mortgage and Mortgage Note Modification Agreement and a Deferred Loan Agreement Modification under the CDBG Housing Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the OC Planning Director, an increase in the amount of $2,060.00. (C2025-74)
	Authorizing the execution of a Mortgage and Mortgage Note Modification Agreement and a Deferred Loan Agreement Modification under the HOME Housing Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the OC Planning Director, an increase in the amount of $7,000.00. (C2026-41)
	Authorizing an amendment to the OC First Time Homebuyer Program Guidelines, to reflect the increased grant subsidy, in the amount of $25,000.00.
	Authorizing the use of FY2023 and FY2024 HOME funds for the FY2026 First Time Homebuyer Activities. (CC2026-54)
	Authorizing the Office of County Counsel to take all necessary legal action to intervene on behalf of the County of Ocean in seeking the disgorgement of funds diverted from the 9-1-1 System and Emergency Response Trust Fund account.
	Authorizing the execution of an Easement Agreement with the Department of the Air Force for various parcels associated with the new overpass bridge structure and realignment of C.R. 539 (Whiting-New Egypt Road over Ridge Way) at Joint Base McGuire-Dix-Lakehurst, Jackson and Plumsted Townships.
	Approving and endorsing the OC Workforce Development Board Strategic Plan Modifications 2022-2026.
	Adopting the revised Bylaws of the OC Homelessness Trust Fund Task Force.
	Amending the fee schedule of the OC Golf Course at Atlantis and OC Golf Course at Forge Pond to include additional specific fee programs and services.
	Authorizing the Release of Bonds for Road Opening Permits.
	Supporting Senate Bill No. S1125 to prioritize the distribution of 9-1-1 System and Emergency Response Trust Fund monies.
	Supporting the Safeguard American Voter Eligibility (SAVE) Act.
	Urging the State of New Jersey to uphold the established age-related requirements governing adult communities.
	Opposing proposed budget cuts to the Stay NJ Property Tax Relief Program for Senior Citizens.
	Authorizing the execution of a Revised Shared Services Agreement with the Borough of Beach Haven for Fire Inspection Services, term to expire 12/31/2028.
	Authorizing the execution of a Revised Shared Services Agreement with the Borough of South Toms River for Fire Inspection Services, term to expire 12/31/2028.

	MOTIONS
	Authorizing the Clerk of the Board to accept and/or record legal instruments.
	Approving the Preliminary Board Meeting Minutes of 2/4/2026.
	Approving the Preliminary Board Meeting Minutes of 2/25/2026.
	Approving and Ratifying the Master Payroll paid on 3/11/2026 for the payroll period of 2/12/2026 through 2/25/2026, with Elected Officials paid to date, in the amount of $7,328,576.24.
	Approving the distribution of Requests for Qualifications and/or Requests for Proposals, as follows: 1) Construction Project Management for Building and Site Development and 2) Multi-Media Advertising Platforms.
	Approving the plans and specifications and authorizing the County Engineer to advertise for the receipt of bids for the Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 2024E, Various Townships.
	Approving the Master Payroll paid on 3/25/2026 for the payroll period of 2/26/2026 through 3/11/2026, with Elected Officials paid to date, in the amount of $7,172,074.78.

	TRAFFIC SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS
	Authorizing the execution of an Agreement with the Township of Lakewood for the installation of a traffic signal at the intersection of County Road #93 (Route 623-New Hampshire Avenue) and County Road #40 (Chestnut Street), Township of Lakewood. (LKWD-84)
	Authorizing the alteration of No Passing Zones along County Road #8 (Frank Applegate Road-Butterfly Road), Township of Jackson.
	Authorizing the alteration of Speed Zones along County Road #40 (West Princeton Avenue), Township of Brick.
	Authorizing the alteration of Speed Zones along County Road #67 (River Road), Township of Brick and Borough of Point Pleasant.
	Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #2 (Route 554-West Bay Avenue) and County Road #11 (Nautilus Drive), Township of Barnegat. (BRNT-7)
	Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #91 (Route 621-Grand Central Parkway) and Northern Boulevard (formerly Northern Boulevard and Park Avenue), Township of Berkeley. (BRKLY-17)
	Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #11 (Route 549-Hooper Avenue) and Ocean County Mall and Bey Lea Plaza, Township of Toms River. (DVR-20)
	Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #54 (Route 571-Route 549 Spur-Fischer Boulevard) and County Road #27 (Route 571-Bay Avenue), Township of Toms River. (DVR-33)
	Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #22 (Route 638-Jackson Mills Road) and County Road #18 (Harmony Road), Township of Jackson. (JK-28)
	Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #5 (Route 527-East Veterans Highway) and County Road #8 (Butterfly Road) and Grand Boulevard, Township of Jackson. (JK-43)
	Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #33 (Route 614-Lacey Road) and Newark Avenue, Township of Lacey. (LCY-6)
	Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #3 (Route 639-North Hope Chapel Road) and North Lake Drive, Township of Lakewood. (LKWD-36)
	Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #27 (Route 571-Ridgeway Road) and Renaissance Drive, Township of Manchester. (MAN-9)

	BID AWARDS
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of WELL SYSTEMS INSTALLATION, MAINTENANCE, SERVICE AND REPAIR to Jersey Shore Lawn Sprinkler Company, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder. (B2026-21)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of RIPRAP to Green Dream International LLC and Herman's Trucking, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders.  (B2026-22)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of INMATE COMMISSARY AND BANKING SERVICES to Keefe Commissary Network LLC, the sole qualified bidder.  (B2026-23)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of GENERATOR ALTERATION, MAINTENANCE, SERVICE AND REPAIR to Penn Power Group LLC dba Penn Power Systems, the lowest qualified bidder. (B2026-24)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of LOCKSMITH SERVICES FOR SECURITY LOCKING SYSTEMS AND DETENTION EQUIPMENT to Northstar Prison Maintenance and Repair LLC, the lowest qualified bidder. (B2026-25)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL to Brick Wall Corporation; Britton Industries LLC; Eagles Lake Reserve, Inc.; Gibraltar Rock, Inc.; Mazza Mulch, Inc.; and Stavola Construction Materials LLC, the lowest qualified bidders.  No bids were received on Item Nos. 5, 12, 13A, 13B, 13C, 20C, 23A, 23B and 23C.  Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 2, 3, 11, 15A, 15B, 15C, 16A, 16B, 16C, 18A, 18B, 18C, 19A, 19B, 19C, 20A, 20B, 24A, 24B, 24C, 26A, 26B, 26C, 27A, 27B and 27C as unresponsive. All no bid and rejected items will be rebid. (B2026-28)
	Awarding a Contract for SUPPLEMENTARY VEHICLE TOWING AND ROADSIDE SERVICES to Freedom Towings and Recovery LLC, the sole qualified bidder.  (B2026-29)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS EQUIPMENT FOR THE TRAFFIC DIVISION to Mobotrex, LLC, the lowest qualified bidder.  No bids were received on four hundred and sixty-five (465) items.   Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 32, 33, 39, 40, 41, 42, 50, 63, 71, 72, 74, 77, 79, 81, 84, 87, 88, 91, 92, 93, 94, 95, 96, 97, 99, 102, 103, 104, , 177, 178, 179, 187, 281, 286, 287, 288, 307, 308 and 349 as unresponsive.  All no bid and rejected items will be rebid. (B2026-30)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS ALUMINUM BULKHEAD MATERIALS to CMI Limited Co., the sole qualified bidder. (B2026-31)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of DUCTILE IRON CULVERT PIPE to Brent Material Company and Core & Main LP, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2026-32)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of STEEL CHANNEL POSTS AND TIMBER FOR SIGN POSTS to National Highway Products, Inc. and Traffic Safety Service LLC, the lowest qualified bidders.  (B2026-33)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER to R.J. Sherman & Associates, Inc. dba Vermeer North Atlantic Sales & Service; Able Ford of New Jersey dba All American Ford; Bellmawr Truck Repair Co., Inc.; Cherry Valley Tractor Sales, Inc.; D&W Diesel, Inc.; Foley Incorporated; Freedom Towings and Recovery LLC; Granturk Equipment Co., Inc.; H.A. DeHart & Son, Inc.; Hoffman International, Inc.; Houpert Fleet Services LLC; Hudson County Motors, Inc.; Hunter Truck; Johnson & Towers LLC; Kenco Acquisition Corporation; On-Site Fleet Service, Inc.; Orchards Hydraulic Service, Inc.; Robert H. Hoover & Sons, Inc.;  Schimpfs Garage LLC; The Norcia Corporation and United Ford LLC, the lowest qualified bidders.  Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 1, 3, 4, 8, 9, 11, 12, 15, 17, 18, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 39, 42, 46, 47, 48, 50, 53 and 54 as unresponsive.  They will be rebid.  Awarded Item Nos. 5, 6, 10, 16, 32, 38, 40, 41, 43, 45, 51, 52, 64, 68, 73,74, 75, 77, 78, 79, 81 88 and 89 will be rebid to obtain additional vendors. (B2026-34)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of AUTOMATED EXTERNAL DEFIBRILLATORS AND SUPPLIES to Lifesavers, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder. (B2026-36)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of CORRUGATED POLYETHYLENE DRAINAGE PIPE to Brent Material Company and Chemung Supply Corp, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2026-37)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of CATIONIC ASPHALT EMULSION to Asphalt Paving Systems, Inc., the sole qualified bidder. (B2026-38)
	Awarding a Contract for the RECONSTRUCTION AND RESURFACING OF PORTIONS OF CERTAIN COUNTY ROADS, CONTRACT 2024C, VARIOUS TOWNSHIPS to Earle Asphalt Company, the lowest qualified bidder, in the amount of $2,449,513.13. (B2026-45E)
	Rescinding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of PROMOTIONAL ITEMS from Brandito dba Inkwell Global Marketing, as the vendor is unwilling to honor their contract. Item Nos. 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9 and 10 will not be rebid. (B2025-121)
	Rescinding the Contract for the furnishing and delivery of LONG TERM SERVICE AND MAINTENANCE CONTRACT FOR COGENERATION SYSTEM AT THE COUNTY JUSTICE COMPLEX from Foley, Incorporated, as the vendor is unable to honor their contract. It will be rebid. (B2025-127)
	Rescinding AGRICULTURAL SUPPLIES Item No. 41 from Heritage Landscape Supply Group, Inc., as the vendor is unable to honor their contract pricing.  Recommendation is made to award Item No. 41 to Noble Turf LLC, the next lowest qualified bidder. (B2025-190)
	Authorizing a vendor name change to the Contract for the furnishing and delivery of GOLF CARTS FOR OCEAN COUNTY GOLF COURSES from KLBL, LLC dba Vic Gerard Golf Cars, to Mid-Atlantic Golf Cars, LLC. (B2024-168)
	Authorizing the transfer of a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS from Action Uniform Co., LLC to Galls, LLC. (B2025-136)
	Authorizing the transfer of a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of UNIFORMS FOR LAW ENFORCEMENT OFFICERS from Action Uniform Co., LLC to Galls, LLC. (B2025-159)
	Amending Resolution No. 2026000260 adopted on 3/4/2026 awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of AGRICULTURAL SUPPLIES NO. II to Priority Group Services LLC, to reflect the correct contract period of 3/4/2026 through 1/14/2027. (B2026-26)

	CHANGE ORDERS
	Awarding Change Order No. 4 to Earle Asphalt Company for the project entitled Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 2021A, an increase to the Contract in an amount not to exceed $78,475.52. (B2023-106E)

	CONTRACTS
	Qualifying Max Spann Real Estate & Auction Co. as eligible to provide Auctioneering Services for the Sale of Various Types of Real Property on a project specific basis, for the period of 4/3/2026 through 4/2/2027. (QP2026-48)
	Awarding a Competitive Contract to O.C.E.A.N., Inc. for administration of the First Time Homebuyer Activities FY2026, in the amount not to exceed $48,000.00 annually, for the period of 4/17/2026 through 4/16/2028. (CC2026-49)
	Awarding a Contract to Miller Auto Leasing Company to provide Voting Machine Transportation Services, for the period of 5/1/2026 through 4/30/2028, in the amount not to exceed $70,000.00 annually, with partial funding contingent upon adoption of the 2026 County Budget, 2027 Temporary County Budget and 2027 County Budget. (CP2026-50)
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to James W. Casey dba Branch of Jesse LLC, to serve as Correctional Chaplain, for the period of 4/5/2026 through 4/4/2027, in an amount not to exceed $41,500.00, contingent upon adoption of the 2026 County Budget. (QP2026-51)
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Marchetti Bros. LLC dba Total Control Systems, to provide Control System Engineering Services for Ocean County Movable Bridges, in an amount not to exceed $134,248.80, for the period of 3/25/2026 through 3/24/2027. (PP2026-52)
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Mott MacDonald LLC, to provide Professional Engineering Services - Solid Waste Management and Recycling, in the estimated amount of $367,000.00, for the period of 3/25/2026 through 3/24/2027. (QP2026-53)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to ACT Engineers, Inc. to provide On-Call Environmental Engineering Professional Services for Soil Investigations for Future Stormwater Management Facilities, Lakewood Township, in an amount not to exceed $93,261.40. (QP2025-76)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to T&M Associates to provide Road Design Services to provide Consulting Services for Project Labor Agreements as related to upcoming Road and Bridge Projects, Various Townships, in an amount not to exceed $13,436.83. (QP2025-124)
	Terminating the Agreement with Axon Enterprise, Inc. (New Jersey State Contract No. 17-FLEET-00738) for the provision of body worn cameras, including all necessary hardware, software, storage, retrieval and ancillary equipment for the OC Sheriff's Office, effective 1/31/2026.
	Awarding a Purchase Order to Axon Enterprise, Inc. (New Jersey State Contract No. 17-FLEET-00738) to provide body worn cameras and accessories for the OC Sheriff's Department, in an amount not to exceed $841,827.04, for the period of 2/1/2026 through 1/31/2031, with partial funding contingent upon adoption of the 2027, 2028, 2029, 2030 and 2031 Temporary County Budgets and 2026, 2027, 2028, 2029 and 2030 County Budgets.
	Awarding a Purchase Order to AllRisk, Inc. (Contract No. ESCNJ 22/23-23) to provide asbestos abatement services at 212 Washington Street, Toms River, in an amount not to exceed $60,807.57.
	Amending a Community Housing Development Organization (CHDO) Agreement with Ocean Housing Alliance, Inc. for the project entitled Rehabilitation of Joan Valentine House rental units located in Point Pleasant Beach, NJ, for additional renovation costs for flooring, an increase to the Contract in the amount of $28,057.96. (CP2023-41)
	Amending the award of a Purchase Order to Johnson, Mirmiran & Thompson, Inc. to provide additional On-Call Traffic Engineering Professional Services for the intersection of CR 549 (Hooper Avenue) and CR 620 (Church Road/Kettle Creek Road), Toms River Township, an increase to the Contract in an amount not to exceed $49,993.74. (QP2021-63)
	Amending the award of a Purchase Order to T&M Associates to provide additional Construction Project Management and Inspection Services for the Reconstruction of Cross Street, Route 626, from Augusta Boulevard to State Highway Route 9, Lakewood Township, an increase to the Contract in an amount not to exceed $9,788.95. (QP2022-155)
	Amending a Resolution adopted on 2/11/2026 awarding Professional Services Agreements for Title Binder and Commitment / Insurance Search Services for Various Projects in Ocean County, to reflect the correct Special Projects Account number. (QP2026-33)
	Rejecting all responses received for the RFP titled Creation, Design and Production of Video/Audio for Ocean County No. II as overbudget pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-13.2(a) and pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-13.2(c) as the governing body has decided to abandon the project for the provision or performance of the goods and services.

	APPOINTMENTS AND REAPPOINTMENTS
	Appointing Jellena Solan, Toms River as a new member and reappointing Linda Kelly, Manchester as a member of the CATTUS ISLAND COUNTY PARK ADVISORY COUNCIL, effective 4/1/2026, for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 3/31/2029.
	Appointing Hunter Hawk, Waretown and Adam Ellender, Long Beach Township to the position of Assistant Fire Marshal, effective 3/30/2026, for an initial term to expire 1/14/2027.
	Reappointing Captain David E. Schenk and Chief Warrant Officer, Kevin Fennessy to the position of OC DEPUTY COORDINATOR OF EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT, effective 4/16/2026, for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 4/15/2029.
	Reappointing Leslie R. Cauvin, D.O., to the position of Assistant OC Medical Examiner for a term of one (1) year, effective 3/1/2026, term to expire 2/28/27.
	Reappointing Harry L. Larkin, M.D., to the position of Assistant OC Medical Examiner for a term of one (1) year, effective 5/1/2026, term to expire 4/30/27.
	Reappointing Kevin Douthitt, Long Beach Township; Michael Gesicki, Manahawkin; John J. Hess, Barnegat; Wayne E. Mauro, Esq., Waretown; Daniel B. Palumbo, Lanoka Harbor; David T. Peck, III, Whiting; Arthur Telfeian, BSN, ATP, Cream Ridge; Richard Ritorto, Manchester; and Frank Work, Jr., Toms River as citizen members of the OC AIRPARK ADVISORY COMMITTEE, effective 3/15/2026, for a term of one (1) year, term to expire 3/14/2027.
	Reappointing Elaine McCrystal, Lakewood as a member of the OC PLANNING BOARD, effective 4/19/2026, for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 4/18/2029.
	Reappointing Michael T. Mangum, Parkertown as a member for a term of five (5) years, term to expire 1/1/2031; and Timothy Chamberlain, Point Pleasant Beach as an Alternate Member No. 2 for a term of two (2) years, term to expire 1/1/2028, both effective 1/2/2026, to the OC SHADE TREE ADVISORY COMMISSION.
	Rescinding the reappointment of David J. Hansen to the position of Part-Time Assistant Fire Marshal, effective 3/1/2026.

	RECEIVED ITEMS
	RESOLUTIONS FROM GOVERNING BODIES
	OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 71(26) authorizing the acceptance of the OC Comprehensive Alcoholism and Drug Abuse Grant from the NJ Department of Human Services, Division of Mental Health and Addiction Services, in the amount of $1,367,555.00, for the period of 1/1/2026 through 12/31/2026; and additional grant match funding in the amount of $215,748.00 has been appropriated by the OC Board of Health in the 2026 Budget.
	OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 77(26) approving the correction of a typographical error in Resolution No. 345(25) to reflect the corrected FY2027 LACADA funding recommendations, in an amount not to exceed $283,930.00.
	OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 78(26) recommending reappointments to the Local Advisory Committee on Alcoholism and Drug Abuse (LACADA).
	OC Board of Social Services, Resolution No. 2026-02-09 proclaiming April 7, 2026 as "National Service Recognition Day" and the week of April 19-25, 2026 as "National Volunteer Week."
	OC Board of Social Services, Resolution No. 2026-02-11 proclaiming the month of May 2026 as "Older Americans Month."
	OC Utilities Authority, Resolution No. 26-12818 authorizing the execution and delivery of the Loan Agreements to be executed by the Ocean County Utilities Authority and each of the New Jersey Infrastructure Bank and the State of New Jersey, acting by and through the Department of Environmental Protection and further authorizing the execution and delivery of the Escrow Agreement, all pursuant to the State Fiscal Year 2026 New Jersey Water Bank.
	Monmouth County, Resolution No. 2026-0221 supporting Senate Concurrent Resolution No. 106 (Scutari, D-22) which would determine that the New Jersey Protecting Against Climate Threats (PACT)/Resilient Environment and Landscape (REAL) rules are inconsistent with legislative intent.
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