
Board Meeting Agenda

Date: May 6, 2020 - 4:00 PM

Location: Administration Building
Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

A. CALL TO ORDER 

B. ROLL CALL 

C. STATEMENT    Compliance with the Open Public Meetings Act 

D. THE PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE AND PRAYER 

E. PROCLAMATIONS 

1. Proclaiming the month of May 2020 as "Older Americans Month". 

F. ORDINANCE - INTRODUCTION 

1. ORDINANCE #2020-15 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $1,000,000.00 
from the Capital Improvement Fund for the cost of HVAC, ADA and Fire Sprinkler 
Upgrades to the Southern Service Center located in Stafford Township, County of 
Ocean, State of New Jersey. 

2. ORDINANCE #2020-16 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $500,000.00 from 
the Capital Improvement Fund for the cost of Various Equipment Upgrades at the 
Northern Recycling Center located in Lakewood Township, County of Ocean, State 
of New Jersey. 

3. ORDINANCE #2020-17 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $2,000,000.00 
from the Capital Improvement Fund for the cost of Renovations to the Wells Mills 
Nature Center located in Ocean Township, County of Ocean, State of New Jersey. 
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4. ORDINANCE #2020-18 - An Ordinance authorizing Capital Renovations, 
Replacements and Upgrades to the Ocean County Vocational-Technical School 
District Sites and Buildings, in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey, including 
but not limited to the Brick location, and appropriating the aggregate amount of 
$2,800,000.00 therefor, and authorizing the Issuance of $2,800,000.00 in Bonds or 
Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance part of the cost thereof. 

5. ORDINANCE #2020-19 - An Ordinance authorizing Reconstruction and Upgrades to 
the 129 Hooper Avenue Parking Garage located in Toms River Township, in the 
County of Ocean, State of New Jersey, including but not limited to Relocation of the 
Security Office, and appropriating $3,300,000.00 therefor and authorizing the 
Issuance of $3,000,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes to finance the same. 

G. RESOLUTION - PUBLIC HEARING 

1. Ocean County Consortium FY2020-2024 Consolidated Plan and FY2020 Action 
Plan. 

2. Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory 
Committee to acquire property identified as Block 51, Lot 4 in the Township of 
Barnegat, totaling approximately 76.15 acres located on Old Cedar Bridge Road, in 
an amount not to exceed $500,000.00 plus up to $2,060.00 for property tax 
adjustments. 

H. AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF BILLS IN BILL COMMITTEE REPORT NO. 9. 

I. AUTHORIZING ENGINEERING PAYMENTS TO CONTRACTORS AS LISTED 
BELOW: 

1. EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - The Barnegat Branch Trail Maintenance Contract 
2019, Barnegat and Ocean Townships - Partial Estimate #1, $95,981.65. (B2019-
208E) 

2. MARBRO, INC. - Replacement of Grawtown Road Bridge (Structure No. 1511-009), 
Grawtown Road over Dove Mill Branch of Toms River, Jackson Township - Change 
Order #1, E-$0.00, R-$0.00. (B2019-91E) 

3. EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Replacement of Main Street Bridge (Structure No. 
1520-003), Main Street (C.R. 613), over Waretown Creek, Ocean Township - Change 
Order #1, E-$15,363.60, R-$6,044.00. (B2019-148E) 

4. EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Construction of County Site Improvements at 
Southern Service Center, Township of Stafford - Partial Estimate #2, $36,371.48. 
(B2019-153E) 

5. EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of 
Certain County Roads, Contract 2018D - Partial Estimate #10, $395,381.48. (B2019-
21E) 

J. RESOLUTIONS 

1. Authorizing the Personnel Resolution. 
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2. Honoring Denise Granberg as she retires from 31 years of service to the Ocean 
County Department of Risk Management. 

3. Supporting Assembly Resolution 152 urging the Governor of New Jersey to reject the 
toll increase proposed by the New Jersey Turnpike Authority. 

4. Authorizing an amendment to the 2020 Budget for the program entitled HUD: CDBG 
Program Income FY20, in the amount of $29,600.00. 

5. Authorizing an amendment to the 2020 Budget for the program entitled State Health 
Insurance Assistance Program FY20, in the amount of $46,400.00. 

6. Authorizing the cancellation of Capital Budget account balances that are no longer 
needed. 

7. Authorizing the execution of a Grant Application to the Federal Aviation 
Administration under the Coronavirus Aid, Relief, and Economic Security (CARES) 
Act, in the amount of $69,000.00. 

8. Authorizing the OC Transportation Mini-Grant Program FY20, in the amount of 
$40,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2020 through 12/31/2020. 

9. Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Agreement under the HOME Housing 
Rehabilitation Program, as directed by the OC Planning Director. (C2020-69) 

10. Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Agreement under the HOME Housing 
Rehabilitation Program, as directed by the OC Planning Director. (C2020-70) 

11. Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Agreement under the CDBG Housing 
Rehabilitation Program, as directed by the OC Planning Director. (C2020-71) 

12. Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Agreement under the CDBG Housing 
Rehabilitation Program, as directed by the OC Planning Director. (C2020-72) 

13. Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with Ocean County College to provide 
Schedule "C" Road Department services, in an amount not to exceed $30,000.00, for 
the period of 1/1/2020 through 12/31/2020. 

14. Authorizing the execution of an Agreement with 21 Plus, Inc. to allow the OC 
Department of Transportation Services (Ocean Ride) to provide transportation 
services to eligible clients of the Main Street Adult Training Center, in an amount not 
to exceed $98,000.00, for the period of 6/1/2020 through 5/31/2021. (C2020-73) 

15. Authorizing Benchmark Resolution Services, LLC to serve as Mediator to resolve a 
dispute with Atlantic Coast Fibers, LLC, the contracted operator for the 
OC Recycling Center Processing Facilities. 

16. Amending a Resolution previously adopted on 3/18/2020 authorizing the execution of 
the State Health Insurance Program FY20, reflecting a revised grant funding amount. 

17. Authorizing a Modification to the First-Time Homebuyer Program to include a new 
participant, as recommended by the Planning Director. (CC2018-54) 

18. Authorizing the Execution of a Deed Notice for Former New Jersey Natural Gas 
Toms River MGP Property - Herflicker Boulevard, Toms River Township. 
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19. Authorizing the execution of a Collective Negotiations Agreement with the 
Policemen's Benevolent Association Local 258. 

K. MOTIONS 

1. Authorizing the Clerk of the Board to accept and/or record legal instruments. 

2. Approving the Board Meeting Minutes of 4/1/2020. 

3. Authorizing the distribution of Requests for Proposals and/or Requests for 
Qualifications as follows: 1) Perishable Food Providers; and 2) Engineering Services 
for the Design & Permitting of a New County Park in Manchester Township. 

4. Authorizing the Acquisition of Right-of-Way and/or Easement(s) by gift, purchase, 
exchange or condemnation for the repair of culvert walls located along Herbertsville 
Road, Brick Township, for purposes of improving Saw Mill Creek drainage. (1 
parcel) 

5. Approving the plans and specifications and authorizing the County Engineer to 
advertise for the receipt of bids for the project entitled Replacement of Bamber 
Bridge (Structure No. 1512-008), Lacey Road (C.R. 614) over the Middle Branch of 
Cedar Creek, Township of Lacey. 

6. Approving the plans and specifications and authorizing the County Engineer to 
advertise for the receipt of bids for the project entitled Reconstruction and 
Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 2019B. 

7. Approving the Master Payroll paid on 4/29/2020 for the payroll period of 4/2/2020 
through 4/15/2020 and for the payroll period of 4/16/2020 through 4/29/2020, in the 
amount of $5,506,539.96. 

L. TRAFFIC SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS 

1. Authorizing the altering of Through Street designations along County Road #2 (Front 
Street-Magnolia Avenue, Archertown-Collier Mills Road) and County Road #61 
(Hawkin Road) in the Township of Plumsted and the Township of Jackson. 

M. BID AWARDS 

1. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of HAND TOOLS, CASES AND 
STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. II to Snap-On Industrial, a Division of IDSC 
Holdings LLC; and Van Wickle Auto Supply, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders.  No 
bids were received on Item Nos. 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18 and 39.  
Recommendation is made to reject Item No. 27 as unresponsive.  All no bid and 
rejected items will be rebid.  Item Nos. 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 28, 29, 30, 31, 
32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37 and 38 will be rebid to obtain additional vendors. (B2020-47) 

2. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: NEW 
SPORT UTILITY VEHICLES NO. II to Winner Ford, the lowest qualified bidder. 
(B2020-48) 
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3. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing, loading and delivery of SAND, GRAVEL, 
STONE AND TOPSOIL to Mitchell Products, LLC; Stavola Construction Materials, 
Inc.; R.W.V. Land & Livestock South, Inc.; Brickwall Corporation; Tuckahoe Sand 
& Gravel Co., Inc.; Britton Industries, Inc.; and Recycling of Central Jersey, LLC, 
the lowest qualified bidders.  No bids were received on Item Nos. 12a, 12b, 12c, 12d, 
12e, 12f, 12g, 12h, 18a, 18b, 18c, 18d, 18e, 18f, 18g, 18h, 19, 21a, 21b, 22a, 22b, 
22c, 23a, 23b, 23c, 23d, 23e, 23f, 23g, 23h, 26a, 26b, 26c, 27a, 27b, 27c, 28a, 28b, 
28c, 28d, 28e, 28f, 28g, 28h, 29, 30a, 30b, 30c, 30d, 30e, 30f, 30g and 30h.  
Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 13a, 13b, 13c, 13d, 13e, 13f, 13g, 13h, 
32a and 32b as unresponsive.  All no bid and rejected items will be rebid. (B2020-49)

4. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of PRINTING OF OCEAN 
COUNTY BROCHURES to Graphic Press, the lowest qualified bidder. (B2020-54) 

5. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of SNOW PLOW BLADES, 
GRADER BLADES AND BOLTS to Chemung Supply Corp.; Winter Equipment 
Company, Inc. and BMS Property Management, Inc. (B2020-55) 

6. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of AUTOMOTIVE FILTERS to 
Parts Authority, LLC; Colton Automotive; and GSAC Corp. t/a Auto Parts 
Connection/NAPA, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2020-60) 

7. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: NEW 
LOW FLOOR MINI VANS to Rohrer Enterprises, Inc. dba Rohrer Bus Sales, the 
lowest qualified bidder. (B2020-61) 

8. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of PRINTING PROJECTS to 
Indiana Printing and Publishing Co., Inc., the lowest qualified bidder. (B2020-63) 

9. No bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of CAR WASHING 
SERVICES NO. II.  Recommendation is made to rebid Car Washing Services at a 
later date to obtain additional vendors. 

10. Amending the award of Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of REPAIR 
SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS OR 
GREATER, due to a clerical error, as follows: Awarding Item No. 57 to On-Site 
Fleet Service, Inc.; Rescinding Item Nos. 2, 13, 52, 53 and 54 from Johnson & 
Towers, Inc.; Rescinding Item Nos. 13, 52, 53, 67 and 68 from Beyer Bros. Corp.; 
Rescinding Item Nos. 13 and 14 from Campbell Freightliner, LLC; Rescinding Item 
Nos. 52, 53 and 54 from Houpert Fleet Services dba Houpert Truck Service; 
Rescinding Item Nos. 52, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 62, 66, 67 and 81 from Jerry's 
Towing & Diesel Repair; Rescinding Item Nos. 52, 53, 54, 62 and 66 from On-Site 
Fleet Service, Inc.; Rescinding Item Nos. 56, 57, 58, 59 and 62 from H.A. DeHart & 
Son, Inc.; Rescinding Item No. 58 from Robert H. Hoover & Sons, Inc.; and 
Rescinding Item Nos. 58 and 66 from D&W Diesel, Inc.  In the event of tie bids 
pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-6.1(d), bids are awarded to the bidder(s) in closest 
distance to the Ocean County Administration Building, 101 Hooper Avenue, Toms 
River, NJ, using the address indicated on their bid documentation. (B2020-44) 

N. CHANGE ORDERS 

1. Authorizing Change Order No. 3 to Arthur J. Ogren, Inc. for the project entitled 
MANCHESTER TRANSPORTATION GARAGE, an increase to the contract in the 
amount of $62,837.25. (B2019-30CE) 
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2. Amending a Resolution adopted on 4/1/2020 awarding Change Order No. 2 to Arthur 
J. Ogren, Inc. for the project entitled Manchester Transportation Garage, to reflect 
revised account numbers. (B2019-30CE) 

O. CONTRACTS 

1. Awarding a Contract to Turf Equipment and Supply Co., Inc. (ESCNJ Cooperative 
Contract No. 18/19-25) to provide new mowers and an aerator to support the Parks 
and Recreation Department in the maintenance of OC Parks, in an amount not to 
exceed $195,485.35. 

2. Awarding a Purchase Order to T&M Associates for Construction Project 
Management for Building and Site Development Services associated with the 
Transportation Facility at Manchester Project Completion Additional Services, in an 
amount not to exceed $32,082.00. (QP2019-87) 

3. Awarding a Purchase Order to T&M Associates to provide Engineering Design 
Services related to restoration of the Cox House, 353 N. Main Street, Barnegat , NJ, 
in an amount not to exceed $113,594.00. (QP2019-123) 

4. Awarding a Purchase Order to Maser Consulting P.A. to provide Environmental 
Consulting Services for the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Program, in an amount not 
to exceed $5,100.00. (QP2019-105) 

5. Awarding a Purchase Order to Maser Consulting P.A. to provide Professional Land 
Surveying Services for the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Program, in an amount not 
to exceed $63,000.00. (QP2020-57) 

6. Awarding a Purchase Order to Gravatt Consulting Group, Inc. to provide Professional 
Land Surveying Services for the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Program, in an 
amount not to exceed $17,500.00. (QP2020-57) 

7. Amending the award of a Purchase Order to Mott MacDonald to provide additional 
Architectural Design Services associated with the Design and Construction of the 
Social Services Facility, an increase in an amount not to exceed $84,114.00. (QP2019
-70) 

8. Amending a Contract with SHI International (State Contract No. 89851) to provide 
additional work related to the Dell EMC DPS Suite upgrade to support the Data 
Domain for the Ocean County back-up and archiving systems, an increase in an 
amount not to exceed $27,700.00. 

9. Amending the award of a Purchase Order to Urban Engineers, Inc. to provide 
additional Construction Project Management and Inspection Services related to the 
Replacement of Grawtown Road Bridge (Structure No. 1511-009), Grawtown Road 
over Dove Mill Branch of Toms River, Jackson Township, an increase in the amount 
of $18,168.90. (PP2018-136) 

10. Amending the award of a Purchase Order to Atane Engineers, Architects & Land 
Surveyors, P.C. to provide additional Construction Project Management and 
Inspection Services related to the Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of 
Certain County Roads, Contract 2018D, an increase in the amount of $39,141.92. 
(PP2018-136) 
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11. Awarding a Purchase Order to Maser Consulting, P.A. to provide Consultant Material 
Sampling, Inspection and Testing Services related to the Reconstruction and 
Resurfacing of County Route 539, from the Garden State Parkway to State Highway 
Route 72, Little Egg Harbor, Stafford and Barnegat Townships, in an amount not to 
exceed $5,182.00. (QP2020-68) 

P. APPOINTMENTS AND REAPPOINTMENTS 

1. Reappointing Andrew Green, Lakewood; Jamie Jubert, South Toms River; Melanie 
Mitchell, LCSW, Toms River; Stamatina Skevakis, Toms River; and Lydia J. 
Valencia, Lakewood as members of the LOCAL ADVISORY COMMITTEE ON 
ALCOHOLISM AND DRUG ABUSE (LACADA) for a term of two (2) years, term 
to expire May 8, 2022. 

Q. RECEIVED ITEMS 

R. RESOLUTIONS FROM GOVERNING BODIES 

1. Township of Ocean, Resolution No. 2020-143 proclaiming April 7, 2020 as "National 
Service Recognition Day" and the week of April 19 - 25, 2020 as "National Volunteer 
Week". 

2. Township of Brick, Resolution No. 182-20 urging Governor Phil Murphy and the 
New Jersey Turnpike Authority to reconsider any plan that increases tolls on the 
Garden State Parkway and the New Jersey Turnpike. 

3. County of Mercer, Resolution No. 2020-206 supporting Senate Bill 1147 and 
Assembly Bill A-1372 which requires lead paint inspection prior to home purchases 
and tenant turnover while establishing an educational program on lead hazards. 

S. MINUTES AND MEETING NOTICES 

1. OC Board of Social Services Meeting Minutes of 2/25/2020. 

2. OC Planning Board Meeting Minutes of 4/1/2020. 

3. OC Mosquito Extermination Commission Meeting Minutes of 3/16/2020. 

4. OC Insurance Committee Meeting Minutes of 3/19/2020. 

5. OC Utilities Authority Meeting Minutes of 3/26/2020. 

6. OC Commission for Individuals with Disabilities Meeting Notice of 5/15/2020. 

7. OC Mental Health Board Meeting Notice of 5/11/2020. 

T. REPORTS 

1. OC Treasurer's Report for the period ending February 2020. 
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2. OC Supplemental Debt Statement dated 5/5/2020 for Ordinances introduced on 
5/6/2020. 

U. CORRESPONDENCE 

1. Notice of Filing and Public Hearings in the matter of the Petition of Atlantic City 
Energy Company to reconcile and update the level of its Non-Utility Generation 
Charge and its Societal Benefits Charge (2020), BPU Docket No. ER20010088. 

2. Notice of Filing and Notice of Public Hearings in the matter of the petition of Public 
Service Electric and Gas Company for approval of the next phase of the Gas System 
Modernization Program and associated cost recovery mechanism ("GSMP II") 
(December 2019 GSMP II Rate Filing), Docket No. GR19120002. 

V. FREEHOLDER COMMENTS 

W. PUBLIC COMMENTS - "Comments from members of the audience are invited at this time 
with a limit of five (5) minutes per speaker." 

X. ADJOURNMENT 
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	Meeting Agenda for May 06, 2020_Board Meeting Agenda
	CALL TO ORDER
	ROLL CALL
	STATEMENT€€€€Compliance with the Open Public Meetings Act
	THE PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE AND PRAYER
	PROCLAMATIONS
	Proclaiming the month of May 2020 as "Older Americans Month".

	ORDINANCE - INTRODUCTION
	ORDINANCE #2020-15 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $1,000,000.00 from the Capital Improvement Fund for the cost of HVAC, ADA and Fire Sprinkler Upgrades to the Southern Service Center located in Stafford Township, County of Ocean, State of New Jersey.
	ORDINANCE #2020-16 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $500,000.00 from the Capital Improvement Fund for the cost of€Various Equipment Upgrades at the Northern€Recycling Center located in€Lakewood Township, County of Ocean, State of New Jersey.
	ORDINANCE #2020-17 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $2,000,000.00 from the Capital Improvement Fund for the cost of€Renovations to the Wells Mills Nature Center located in€Ocean Township, County of Ocean, State of New Jersey.
	ORDINANCE #2020-18 - An Ordinance authorizing€Capital Renovations, Replacements and Upgrades to the Ocean County Vocational-Technical School District Sites and Buildings, in the€County of Ocean, State of New Jersey, including but not limited to the Brick location, and appropriating the aggregate amount of $2,800,000.00 therefor, and authorizing the Issuance of $2,800,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance part of the cost thereof.
	ORDINANCE #2020-19 - An Ordinance authorizing Reconstruction and Upgrades to the 129 Hooper Avenue Parking Garage located in Toms River Township, in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey, including but not limited to Relocation of the Security Office, and appropriating $3,300,000.00 therefor and authorizing the Issuance of $3,000,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes to finance the same.

	RESOLUTION - PUBLIC HEARING
	Ocean County Consortium FY2020-2024 Consolidated Plan and FY2020 Action Plan.
	Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory Committee to acquire property identified as Block 51, Lot 4 in the Township of Barnegat, totaling approximately 76.15 acres located on Old Cedar Bridge Road, in an amount not to exceed $500,000.00 plus up to $2,060.00 for property tax adjustments.

	AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF BILLS IN BILL COMMITTEE REPORT NO. 9.
	AUTHORIZING ENGINEERING PAYMENTS TO CONTRACTORS AS LISTED BELOW:
	EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - The Barnegat Branch Trail Maintenance Contract 2019, Barnegat and Ocean Townships - Partial Estimate #1, $95,981.65. (B2019-208E)
	MARBRO, INC. - Replacement of Grawtown Road Bridge (Structure No. 1511-009), Grawtown Road over Dove Mill Branch of Toms River, Jackson Township - Change Order #1, E-$0.00, R-$0.00. (B2019-91E)
	EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Replacement of Main Street Bridge (Structure No. 1520-003), Main Street (C.R. 613), over Waretown Creek, Ocean Township - Change Order #1, E-$15,363.60, R-$6,044.00. (B2019-148E)
	EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Construction of County Site Improvements at Southern Service Center, Township of Stafford - Partial Estimate #2, $36,371.48. (B2019-153E)
	EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 2018D - Partial Estimate #10, $395,381.48. (B2019-21E)

	RESOLUTIONS
	Authorizing the Personnel Resolution.
	Honoring Denise Granberg as she retires from 31 years of service to the Ocean County Department of Risk Management.
	Supporting Assembly Resolution€152 urging the Governor of New Jersey to reject the toll increase proposed by the New Jersey Turnpike Authority.
	Authorizing an amendment to the 2020 Budget for the program entitled HUD: CDBG Program Income FY20, in the amount of $29,600.00.
	Authorizing an amendment to the 2020 Budget for the program entitled€State Health Insurance Assistance Program€FY20, in the amount of $46,400.00.
	Authorizing the cancellation of Capital Budget account balances that are no longer needed.
	Authorizing the execution of a Grant Application to the€Federal Aviation Administration under the Coronavirus Aid, Relief, and Economic Security (CARES) Act, in the amount of $69,000.00.
	Authorizing the OC Transportation Mini-Grant Program FY20, in the amount of $40,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2020 through 12/31/2020.
	Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Agreement under the HOME Housing Rehabilitation Program, as directed by the OC Planning Director. (C2020-69)
	Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Agreement under the HOME Housing Rehabilitation Program, as directed by the OC Planning Director. (C2020-70)
	Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Agreement under the CDBG Housing Rehabilitation Program, as directed by the OC Planning Director. (C2020-71)
	Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Agreement under the CDBG Housing Rehabilitation Program, as directed by the OC Planning Director. (C2020-72)
	Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with Ocean County College to provide Schedule "C" Road Department services, in an amount not to exceed $30,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2020 through 12/31/2020.
	Authorizing the execution of an Agreement with 21 Plus, Inc. to allow the OC Department of Transportation Services (Ocean Ride) to provide transportation services to eligible clients of the Main Street Adult Training Center, in an amount not to exceed $98,000.00, for the period of 6/1/2020 through 5/31/2021. (C2020-73)
	Authorizing Benchmark Resolution Services, LLC to serve as Mediator to resolve a dispute with Atlantic Coast Fibers, LLC, the contracted operator for the OC€Recycling Center Processing Facilities.
	Amending a Resolution previously adopted on 3/18/2020 authorizing the execution of the State Health Insurance Program FY20, reflecting a revised€grant funding amount.
	Authorizing a Modification to the First-Time Homebuyer Program to include a new participant, as recommended by the Planning Director. (CC2018-54)
	Authorizing the Execution of a Deed Notice for Former New Jersey Natural Gas Toms River MGP Property - Herflicker Boulevard, Toms River Township.
	Authorizing the execution of a Collective Negotiations Agreement with the Policemen's Benevolent Association Local 258.

	MOTIONS
	Authorizing the Clerk of the Board to accept and/or record legal instruments.
	Approving the Board Meeting Minutes of 4/1/2020.
	Authorizing the distribution of Requests for Proposals and/or Requests for Qualifications as follows: 1) Perishable Food Providers; and 2) Engineering Services for the Design & Permitting of a New County Park in Manchester Township.
	Authorizing the Acquisition of Right-of-Way and/or Easement(s) by gift, purchase, exchange or condemnation for the repair of culvert walls located along Herbertsville Road, Brick Township, for purposes of improving Saw Mill Creek drainage. (1 parcel)
	Approving the plans and specifications and authorizing the County Engineer to advertise for the receipt of bids for the project entitled Replacement of Bamber Bridge (Structure No. 1512-008), Lacey Road (C.R. 614) over the Middle Branch of Cedar Creek, Township of Lacey.
	Approving the plans and specifications and authorizing the County Engineer to advertise for the receipt of bids for the project entitled Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 2019B.
	Approving the Master Payroll paid on 4/29/2020 for the payroll period of 4/2/2020 through 4/15/2020 and for the payroll period of 4/16/2020 through 4/29/2020, in the amount of $5,506,539.96.

	TRAFFIC SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS
	Authorizing the altering of Through Street designations along County Road #2 (Front Street-Magnolia Avenue, Archertown-Collier Mills Road) and County Road #61 (Hawkin Road) in the Township of Plumsted and the Township of Jackson.

	BID AWARDS
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. II to Snap-On Industrial, a Division of IDSC Holdings LLC; and Van Wickle Auto Supply, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. €No bids were received on Item Nos. 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18 and 39.€ Recommendation is made to reject Item No. 27 as unresponsive. €All no bid and rejected items will be rebid. €Item Nos. 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37 and 38 will be rebid to obtain additional vendors. (B2020-47)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: NEW SPORT UTILITY VEHICLES NO. II to Winner Ford, the lowest qualified bidder. (B2020-48)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing, loading and delivery of SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL to Mitchell Products, LLC; Stavola Construction Materials, Inc.; R.W.V. Land & Livestock South, Inc.; Brickwall Corporation; Tuckahoe Sand & Gravel Co., Inc.; Britton Industries, Inc.; and Recycling of Central Jersey, LLC, the lowest qualified bidders.€ No bids were received on Item Nos. 12a, 12b, 12c, 12d, 12e, 12f, 12g, 12h, 18a, 18b, 18c, 18d, 18e, 18f, 18g, 18h, 19, 21a, 21b, 22a, 22b, 22c, 23a, 23b, 23c, 23d, 23e, 23f, 23g, 23h, 26a, 26b, 26c, 27a, 27b, 27c, 28a, 28b, 28c, 28d, 28e, 28f, 28g, 28h, 29, 30a, 30b, 30c, 30d, 30e, 30f, 30g and 30h.€ Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 13a, 13b, 13c, 13d, 13e, 13f, 13g, 13h, 32a and 32b as unresponsive.€ All no bid and rejected items will be rebid. (B2020-49)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of PRINTING OF OCEAN COUNTY BROCHURES to Graphic Press, the lowest qualified bidder. (B2020-54)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of SNOW PLOW BLADES, GRADER BLADES AND BOLTS to Chemung Supply Corp.; Winter Equipment Company, Inc. and BMS Property Management, Inc. (B2020-55)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of AUTOMOTIVE FILTERS to Parts Authority, LLC; Colton Automotive; and GSAC Corp.€t/a Auto Parts Connection/NAPA, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2020-60)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: NEW LOW FLOOR MINI VANS to Rohrer Enterprises, Inc. dba Rohrer Bus Sales, the lowest qualified bidder. (B2020-61)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of PRINTING PROJECTS to Indiana Printing and Publishing Co., Inc., the lowest qualified bidder. (B2020-63)
	No bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of CAR WASHING SERVICES NO. II.€ Recommendation is made€to rebid Car Washing Services at a later date to obtain additional vendors.
	Amending the award of Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS OR GREATER, due to a clerical error,€as follows:€Awarding Item No. 57 to On-Site Fleet Service, Inc.; Rescinding Item Nos.€2, 13, 52, 53 and 54 from Johnson & Towers, Inc.;€Rescinding Item Nos.€13, 52, 53, 67 and 68 from Beyer Bros. Corp.; Rescinding€Item Nos.€13 and 14 from Campbell Freightliner, LLC;€Rescinding Item Nos.€52, 53 and 54 from Houpert Fleet Services dba Houpert Truck Service; Rescinding Item Nos.€52, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 62, 66, 67 and 81 from Jerry's Towing & Diesel Repair; Rescinding Item Nos.€52, 53, 54, 62 and 66 from On-Site Fleet Service, Inc.; Rescinding Item Nos.€56, 57, 58, 59 and 62 from H.A. DeHart & Son, Inc.; Rescinding Item No.€58 from Robert H. Hoover & Sons, Inc.;€and Rescinding Item Nos.€58 and 66€from D&W Diesel, Inc.€ In the event of tie bids pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-6.1(d), bids are awarded to the bidder(s) in closest distance to the Ocean County Administration Building, 101 Hooper Avenue, Toms River, NJ, using the address indicated on their bid documentation. (B2020-44)

	CHANGE ORDERS
	Authorizing Change Order No. 3 to Arthur J. Ogren, Inc. for the project entitled MANCHESTER TRANSPORTATION GARAGE, an increase to the contract in the amount of $62,837.25. (B2019-30CE)
	Amending a Resolution adopted on 4/1/2020 awarding Change Order No. 2 to Arthur J. Ogren, Inc. for the project entitled Manchester Transportation Garage, to reflect revised account numbers. (B2019-30CE)

	CONTRACTS
	Awarding a Contract to Turf Equipment and Supply Co., Inc. (ESCNJ Cooperative Contract No. 18/19-25) to provide new mowers and an aerator to support the Parks and Recreation Department€in€the maintenance of OC Parks, in an amount not to exceed $195,485.35.
	Awarding a Purchase Order to T&M Associates for Construction Project Management for Building and Site Development Services associated with the Transportation Facility at Manchester Project Completion Additional Services, in an amount not to exceed $32,082.00. (QP2019-87)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to T&M Associates to provide Engineering Design Services related to restoration of the Cox House, 353 N. Main Street, Barnegat , NJ, in an amount not to exceed $113,594.00. (QP2019-123)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to€Maser Consulting P.A.€to provide Environmental Consulting€Services€for the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Program,€in an amount not to exceed $5,100.00. (QP2019-105)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to Maser Consulting P.A. to provide Professional Land Surveying Services for the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Program, in an amount not to exceed $63,000.00. (QP2020-57)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to€Gravatt Consulting Group, Inc.€to provide€Professional Land Surveying€Services€for the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Program,€in an amount not to exceed $17,500.00. (QP2020-57)
	Amending the award of€a Purchase Order to Mott MacDonald to provide additional Architectural Design Services associated with the Design and Construction of the Social Services Facility, an increase in an amount not to exceed $84,114.00. (QP2019-70)
	Amending a Contract with SHI International (State Contract No. 89851) to provide additional work related to the Dell EMC DPS Suite upgrade to support the Data Domain for the Ocean County back-up and archiving systems, an increase in an amount not to exceed $27,700.00.
	Amending the award of a Purchase Order to Urban Engineers, Inc. to provide additional Construction Project Management and Inspection Services related to€the Replacement of Grawtown Road Bridge (Structure No. 1511-009), Grawtown Road over Dove Mill Branch of Toms River, Jackson Township, an increase in the amount of $18,168.90. (PP2018-136)
	Amending the award of a Purchase Order to Atane Engineers, Architects & Land Surveyors, P.C. to provide additional Construction Project Management and Inspection Services related to€the Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 2018D, an increase in the amount of $39,141.92. (PP2018-136)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to Maser Consulting, P.A. to provide Consultant Material Sampling, Inspection and Testing Services related to the Reconstruction and Resurfacing of County Route 539, from the Garden State Parkway to State Highway Route 72, Little Egg Harbor, Stafford and Barnegat Townships, in an amount not to exceed $5,182.00. (QP2020-68)

	APPOINTMENTS AND REAPPOINTMENTS
	Reappointing Andrew Green, Lakewood; Jamie Jubert, South Toms River; Melanie Mitchell, LCSW, Toms River; Stamatina Skevakis, Toms River; and Lydia J. Valencia, Lakewood as members of the LOCAL ADVISORY COMMITTEE ON ALCOHOLISM AND DRUG ABUSE (LACADA) for a term of two (2) years, term to expire May 8, 2022.

	RECEIVED ITEMS
	RESOLUTIONS FROM GOVERNING BODIES
	Township of Ocean, Resolution No.€2020-143 proclaiming April 7, 2020 as "National Service Recognition Day" and the week of April 19 - 25, 2020 as "National Volunteer Week".
	Township of Brick, Resolution No.€182-20 urging Governor Phil Murphy and the New Jersey Turnpike Authority to reconsider any plan that increases tolls on the Garden State Parkway and the New Jersey Turnpike.
	County of Mercer, Resolution No. 2020-206 supporting Senate Bill 1147 and Assembly Bill A-1372 which requires lead paint inspection prior to home purchases and tenant turnover while establishing an educational program on lead hazards.

	MINUTES AND MEETING NOTICES
	OC Board of Social Services Meeting Minutes of 2/25/2020.
	OC Planning Board Meeting Minutes of 4/1/2020.
	OC Mosquito Extermination Commission Meeting Minutes of 3/16/2020.
	OC Insurance Committee Meeting Minutes of 3/19/2020.
	OC Utilities Authority Meeting Minutes of 3/26/2020.
	OC Commission for Individuals with Disabilities Meeting Notice of 5/15/2020.
	OC Mental Health Board Meeting Notice of 5/11/2020.

	REPORTS
	OC Treasurer's Report for the period ending February 2020.
	OC Supplemental Debt Statement dated 5/5/2020 for Ordinances introduced on 5/6/2020.

	CORRESPONDENCE
	Notice of Filing and Public Hearings in the matter of the Petition of Atlantic City Energy Company to reconcile and update the level of its Non-Utility Generation Charge and its Societal Benefits Charge (2020), BPU Docket No. ER20010088.
	Notice of Filing and Notice of Public Hearings in the matter of the petition of Public Service Electric and Gas Company for approval of the next phase of the Gas System Modernization Program and associated cost recovery mechanism ("GSMP II") (December 2019 GSMP II Rate Filing), Docket No. GR19120002.

	FREEHOLDER COMMENTS
	PUBLIC COMMENTS - "Comments from members of the audience are invited at this time with a limit of five (5) minutes per speaker."
	ADJOURNMENT


