
Board Meeting Agenda

Date: February 19, 2020 - 4:00 PM

Location: Administration Building
Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

A. CALL TO ORDER 

B. ROLL CALL 

C. STATEMENT    Compliance with the Open Public Meetings Act 

D. THE PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE AND PRAYER 

E. ORDINANCE - PUBLIC HEARING 

1. ORDINANCE #2020-1 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $3,000,000.00 from 
the Capital Improvement Fund for the Construction of Stormwater Management 
Facilities at Various Locations, all in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey. 

2. ORDINANCE #2020-2 - An Ordinance authorizing Various Engineering, Road, and 
Bridge Improvements, at Various Locations, all in the County of Ocean, State of New 
Jersey, and appropriating $3,500,000.00 therefor and authorizing the issuance of 
$3,325,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to 
finance the same. 

3. ORDINANCE #2020-3 - An Ordinance authorizing the Rehabilitation and Repair of 
Various Bridges, in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey, and appropriating 
$2,000,000.00 therefor and authorizing the issuance of $1,900,000.00 in Bonds or 
Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance the same. 
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4. ORDINANCE #2020-4 - An Ordinance authorizing the Reconstruction of Prospect 
Street (Cross Street to U.S. 9), located in the Township of Lakewood, in the County 
of Ocean, State of New Jersey, and appropriating $2,500,000.00 therefor and 
authorizing the issuance of $2,375,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of 
the County of Ocean to finance the same. 

5. ORDINANCE #2020-5 - An Ordinance authorizing the Reconstruction of North 
Hope Chapel Road (County Line Road to Miller Road), located in the Township of 
Lakewood, in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey, and appropriating 
$3,000,000.00 therefor and authorizing the issuance of $2,850,000.00 in Bonds or 
Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance the same. 

6. ORDINANCE #2020-6 - An Ordinance authorizing the Design of Reconstruction and 
Resurfacing of Certain County Roads, all in the County of Ocean, State of New 
Jersey, and appropriating $1,500,000.00 therefor and authorizing the issuance of 
$1,425,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to 
finance the same. 

F. RESOLUTION - INTRODUCTION 

1. 2020 County Budget and Accompanying Resolutions. 

G. AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF BILLS IN BILL COMMITTEE REPORT NO. 4. 

H. AUTHORIZING ENGINEERING PAYMENTS TO CONTRACTORS AS LISTED 
BELOW: 

1. EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Replacement of East Branch Culvert (Structure 
No. 1533-011), Warren Grove-Whiting Road (C.R. 539) over the East Branch of the 
Oswego River, Barnegat Township - Partial Estimate #3, $13,579.22. (B2018-138E) 

2. C.J. HESSE, INC. - Reconstruction of Ridgeway Boulevard from Ridgeway Branch 
Bridge to C.R. 571, Township of Manchester - Partial Estimate #4, $182,930.36. 
(B2019-24E) 

3. MIDLANTIC CONSTRUCTION, LLC - Replacement of Ridgeway Boulevard 
Bridge (Structure No. 1518-002), Ridgeway Boulevard over the Ridgeway Branch of 
the Toms River, Manchester Township - Partial Estimate #2, $90,585.34. (B2019-
127E) 

4. MIDLANTIC CONSTRUCTION, LLC - Replacement of Morris Boulevard Bridge 
(Structure No. 1530009), Morris Boulevard over Fox Island Creek, Stafford 
Township - Partial Estimate #3, $261,848.55. (B2019-110E) 

5. BLACK ROCK ENTERPRISES, LLC - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions 
of Certain County Roads, Contract 2017D - Final Estimate #12, $213,480.05. (B2018
-70E) 

6. EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of 
Certain County Roads, Contract 2018C - Partial Estimate #5, $58,747.77. (B2019-
64E) 
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7. EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of 
Certain County Roads, Contract 2019A - Partial Estimate #7, $116,283.20. (B2019-
43E) 

I. RESOLUTIONS 

1. Authorizing the Personnel Resolution. 

2. Authorizing the cancellation and closeout of certain grants. 

3. Authorizing the acceptance of a grant award from the New Jersey Department of 
Human Services for the FY2019 Medication Assisted Treatment (MAT) Program, for 
the period of 12/1/2019 through 5/30/2020, in the amount of $233,332.00. 

4. Authorizing the execution of an agreement with a Certified Child Passenger Safety 
Technician through the Child Restraint Program Grant FY20, for the period of 
10/1/2019 through 9/30/2020. 

5. Authorizing the execution of a Shared Services Agreement with Cumberland County 
for the housing of short-term commitment status juveniles. 

6. Authorizing the execution of Shared Services Agreements with various municipalities 
for the OC Recycling Center Use and Revenue Sharing Program, for the period of 
1/1/2020 through 12/31/2024. 

7. Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the Borough of Harvey Cedars to 
provide Schedule "C" Road Department services, in an amount not to exceed 
$10,000.00, and Schedule "C" Engineering Department services, in an amount not to 
exceed $1,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2020 through 12/31/2020. 

8. Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the Borough of Mantoloking to 
provide Schedule "C" Road Department services, in an amount not to exceed 
$6,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2020 through 12/31/2020. 

9. Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the Central Regional Board of 
Education to provide Schedule "C" Road Department services, in an amount not to 
exceed $5,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2020 through 12/31/2020. 

10. Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the Borough of Island Heights to 
provide Schedule "C" Road Department services, in an amount not to exceed 
$40,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2020 through 12/31/2020. 

11. Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC Utilities Authority to 
partially fund the 2020 OC Sewerage Pump Out Vessel Program, in an amount not to 
exceed $65,000.00, term to expire 12/31/2020. 

12. Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the Township of Brick for 
participation in the 2020 OC Sewerage Pump Out Vessel Program, in an amount not 
to exceed $40,000.00, with partial funding contingent upon adoption of the 2020 
County Budget, term to expire 12/31/2020. 

13. Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the Borough of Seaside Park for 
participation in the 2020 OC Sewerage Pump Out Vessel Program, in an amount not 
to exceed $50,000.00,with partial funding contingent upon adoption of the 2020 
County Budget, term to expire 12/31/2020. 
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14. Authorizing an Agreement with the Barnegat Bay Decoy and Baymen's Museum for 
participation in the 2020 OC Sewerage Pump Out Vessel Program, in an amount not 
to exceed $40,000.00, with partial funding contingent upon adoption of the 2020 
County Budget, term to expire 12/31/2020. 

15. Authorizing an Intercounty Mutual Aid Assistance Agreement with participating 
units for the OC Sheriff's Department. 

16. Authorizing the execution of the 2020 Initial Boundary Validation Program (BVP) 
for the U.S. Census Bureau. 

17. Amending a resolution adopted on 11/20/2019 authorizing a Shared Services 
Agreement with Toms River Township to enlist the services of the Township of 
Toms River's Clean Communities Educational Program, to reflect a correction to the 
account number. 

18. Amending a resolution adopted on 6/19/2019 authorizing the execution of a Grant 
Application for the Emergency Management Agency Assistance FY19, to include 
additional language in the grant application. 

19. Authorizing the designation of a new Volunteer Assistant C.E.R.T. Program Team 
Coordinator to assist the Sheriff's Office, Office of Emergency Management. 

20. Opposing any law that would unconstitutionally restrict the rights under the Second 
Amendment. 

21. Authorizing the execution of Agreement Modification No. 1 with the NJ Department 
of Transportation for the Construction of Horizontal Curve High Friction Surface 
Treatment, Jackson, Lacey, Manchester, Plumsted and Toms River Townships, and 
Point Pleasant Borough, Ocean County, Federal Project No. HSIP-D00S(252), 
Agreement No. 2019-DT-BLA-307. 

22. Concurring with Ordinance No. 2017-22A of the Borough of Point Pleasant Beach to 
eliminate two (2) 15-minute parking spaces located on Broadway and add two (2) 15-
minute parking spaces on Arnold Avenue in the Borough of Point Pleasant Beach. 

23. Authorizing the execution of an Agreement with Jersey Central Power and Light for 
the temporary relocation of overhead distribution facilities on Ridgeway Boulevard 
associated with the Replacement of Ridgeway Boulevard Bridge (Structure No. 1518-
002), Ridgeway Boulevard over the Ridgeway Branch of the Toms River, 
Manchester Township. 

24. Authorizing the execution of an Easement Extension Agreement with New Jersey 
Natural Gas Company for an extension of the installation of facilities in Block 72, 
Lot 7 in the Township of Manchester. 

25. Authorizing the Release of Bonds for Road Opening Permits. 

26. Authorizing the execution of a Collective Bargaining Agreement with the Fraternal 
Order of Police Jersey Shore Lodge 222 (Ocean County Prosecutor's Sergeants' 
Association), for the period of 7/1/2019 through 6/30/2022. 

27. Authorizing the execution of a Collective Bargaining Agreement with the Ocean 
County Prosecutor's Office Superior Officers' Association, for the period of 7/1/2019 
through 6/30/2022. 

Page 4 of 9



J. MOTIONS 

1. Authorizing the Clerk of the Board to accept and/or record legal instruments. 

2. Approving the Pre-Board Meeting Minutes of 1/8/2020. 

3. Approving the Board Meeting Minutes of 1/15/2020. 

4. Authorizing the distribution of Requests for Proposals and/or Requests for 
Qualifications as follows: 1) Correctional Chaplain; 2) Control System Engineering 
Services for Ocean County Movable Bridges; and 3) Consultant Material Sampling, 
Inspection and Testing Services for Various Projects in Ocean County Where and As 
Directed by Various Departments of the County of Ocean. 

5. Approving the plans and specifications and authorizing the County Engineer to 
advertise for the receipt of bids for the Stormwater Management Contract 2020A, 
Various Townships. 

6. Approving the Master Payroll paid on 2/19/2020 for the payroll period of 1/23/2020 
through 2/5/2020 and for the payroll period of 2/6/2020 through 2/19/2020, in the 
amount of $5,230,152.58. 

K. TRAFFIC SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS 

1. Authorizing the removal of the Weight Limit Restriction on Bridge No. 1520003, 
known as Main Street Bridge (Main Street over Waretown Creek) within the 
Township of Ocean, effective immediately. 

L. BID AWARDS 

1. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of POLYETHYLENE LINERS, 
BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS to United Sales USA Corp.; Central Poly-
Bag Corp.; Interboro Packaging Corp.; W.B. Mason Co., Inc.; and Imperial Bag & 
Paper Co., LLC, the lowest qualified bidders.  Recommendation is made to reject 
Item Nos. 1 and 3 as unresponsive.  Both rejected items will be rebid. (B2020-10) 

2. Awarding a Contract for the PROPOSED REFINISHES AT OCEAN COUNTY 
JUSTICE COMPLEX TUNNEL, TOMS RIVER, NJ, NO. II to J.H. Williams 
Enterprises, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder, for a Total Bid Award in the amount of 
$87,400.00 (including an allowance of $7,000.00). (B2020-12A) 

3. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of SOLAR POWERED LED 
SIGNS AND SOLAR POWERED SPEED RADAR SIGNS to Traffic Logix 
Corporation and J. Q. & G., Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. (B2020-14) 

4. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND 
LUBRICANTS to Romeo Enterprises; Prime Lube, Inc.; Johnson & Towers, Inc.; 
and PetroChoice, LLC, the lowest qualified bidders.  No bids were received on Item 
No. 21d. It will not be rebid as it is no longer needed. (B2020-17) 
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5. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: NEW 
VANS, WAGONS, CARS AND PICKUP TRUCKS to Winner Ford, the lowest 
qualified bidder.  No bids were received on Item Nos. 3, 3a, 3b, 3c, 3d, 3e, 3f, 3g, 3h, 
3i, 3j, 3k, 3l, 3m, 3n, 3o, 3p, 3q, 3r, 3s and 3t.  Recommendation is made to reject 
Item Nos. 3u and 3v as unresponsive.  All no bid and rejected items will not be rebid 
as they are no longer needed. (B2020-22) 

6. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of WORK CLOTHES FOR 
VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS to Dot Designing; Keyport Army Navy; Bob Barker 
Company, Inc.; A&M Industrial, Inc.; and All-Star Custom Apparel and Design, Inc., 
the lowest qualified bidders.  No bids were received on Item Nos. 57 and 59.  
Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 35, 60a, 60b, 61a, 61b, 62, 65, 66, 125, 
126, 127, 128, 129, 130, 131, 132, 133, 134, 135, 136, 137 and 138 as unresponsive.  
All no bid and rejected items will be rebid.  Rejected Item Nos. 65 and 66 will be 
rebid with revised specifications. (B2020-23) 

7. Rejecting all bids received for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: 
NEW SPORT UTILITY VEHICLES.  It will be rebid with revised specifications. 

8. Rejecting the sole bid received for the furnishing and delivery of RESCUE VESSEL 
WITH TRAILER NO. II and authorizing the County Purchasing Agent to enter into a 
negotiated contract in accordance with N.J.S.A. Chapter 40A:11-5(3), as no 
responsive bids were received for a second time. 

9. Rescinding PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND 
SUPPLIES Item No. 153 from Cloud-Age IT, as the vendor is unable to honor their 
contract. Recommendation is made to enter into an amendatory contract for Item No. 
153 with Star Data Co., the next lowest qualified bidder. (B2019-171) 

M. CHANGE ORDERS 

1. Awarding Change Order No. 3 to Gavan General Contracting, Inc. for the project 
entitled Plumsted Garage Vehicle Wash Facility, an increase in the amount of 
$2,912.16. (B2018-110CE) 

N. CONTRACTS 

1. Awarding a Contract to Global Tel*Link Corporation to provide Ocean County 
Department of Corrections Video Visitation Maintenance, in an amount not to exceed 
$59,850.00, contingent upon adoption of the 2020 County Budget, for the period of 
3/1/2020 through 2/28/2021. (CP2020-53) 

2. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Mott MacDonald, LLC to provide 
Professional Engineering Services - Solid Waste Management, Recycling and 
Underground Storage Tanks, in an amount not to exceed $378,900.00, for the period 
of 3/2/2020 through 3/1/2021. (QP2020-54) 

3. Accepting the Qualifications of Magnum Integrated Marketing, LLC; NJ Advance 
Media; and Town Square Media to provide General Advertising, Radio Advertising 
and/or Subscription Services No. II, for the period of 1/1/2020 through 12/31/2020. 
(QP2020-56) 

4. Amending a Contract with Robert W. Allison, CPA, RMA, PSA to provide Auditing 
Services, an increase in the amount of $20,000.00. (QP2020-4) 
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5. Awarding a Purchase Order to T&M Associates to provide Environmental Consulting 
Services for the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Program, in an amount not to exceed 
$23,950.00. (QP2019-105) 

6. Awarding Professional Services Contracts for Title Binder and Commitment / 
Insurance and Search Services to Surety Title Agency /Coastal Region, LLC; Allstate 
Title Agency, LLC; Mid-State Abstract Company; and Two Rivers Title Company, 
LLC, in an amount not to exceed $125,000.00, for the period of 2/1/2020 through 
1/31/2021. (QP2020-55) 

7. Authorizing the County Purchasing Agent to enter into negotiations for the furnishing 
and delivery of Software Licensing and Maintenance Services compatible with 
Bentley Systems Software for the OC Engineer's Office, for the period of 2/19/2020 
through 2/18/2022. 

8. Qualifying twenty-two (22) firms as eligible to provide Land Surveying Services for 
Various Projects in Ocean County, on a project specific contract basis, for the period 
of 2/21/2020 through 2/20/2021 as follows: Van Cleef Engineering Associates, LLC; 
Owen, Little & Associates, Inc.; Remington & Vernick Engineers, Inc.; GEOD 
Corporation; Adams, Rehmann & Heggan Associates, Inc.; French & Parrello 
Associates, P.A.; Maser Consulting P.A.; CME Associates; ACT Engineers, Inc.; 
Churchill Consulting Engineers; Environmental Resolutions, Inc.; Johnson, Mirmiran 
& Thompson, Inc.; Gravatt Consulting Group, Inc.; GTS Consultants, Inc.; Dynamic 
Survey, LLC; Bowman Consulting Group, Ltd.; AmerCom Corp.; Morgan 
Engineering, LLC; WJH Engineering, LLC; Professional Design Services, LLC; 
MFS Consulting Engineers & Surveyors, DPC; and Schaeffer Nassar Scheidegg 
Consulting Engineers, LLC. (QP2020-57) 

9. Qualifying eleven (11) firms as eligible to provide On-Call Traffic Engineering 
Professional Services, on a project specific contract basis, for the period of 2/21/2020 
through 2/20/2021 as follows: Remington & Vernick Engineers, Inc.; French & 
Parrello Associates, PA; Urban Engineers, Inc.; Stantec Consulting Services, Inc.; 
Johnson, Mirmiran & Thompson, Inc.; McMahon Associates, Inc.; Greenman-
Pedersen, Inc.; NV5, Inc.; Dewberry Engineers, Inc.; Maser Consulting P.A.; and 
Environmental Resolutions, Inc. (QP2020-58) 

10. Amending a Contract with Community Medical Center, Inc. to provide Autopsy 
Services for the Medical Examiner, an increase in an amount not to exceed 
$4,182.00. (QP2018-139) 

O. APPOINTMENTS AND REAPPOINTMENTS 

1. Appointing Robert Day, Barnabas Health Community Medical Center; Vin Ebenau, 
WOBM; and Jessica Raftery, Hackensack Meridian Health Ocean Medical Center as 
new members and reappointing Israel Bursztyn, Lakewood; Brian Kubiel, Toms 
River Board of Fire Commissioners; and Patrick Gildner, Hackensack Meridian 
Health Southern Ocean Medical Center as members of the OC EMERGENCY 
MANAGEMENT COUNCIL, for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 3/1/2023. 

2. Appointing Shelby Voorhees, Manahawkin and Sandra Rodriguez, Brick as new 
members and reappointing Doreen Burns, Toms River; April Yezzi, Toms River; 
Shabsi Ganzweig, Lakewood; and L. Thomas Gross, Jr., Bayville as members of the 
OC COMMISSION ON CHILD SAFETY AND AWARENESS, for a term of three 
(3) years, term to expire 2/28/2023. 

3. Appointing Jane Kunka, Barnegat as a new member of the OC OFFICE OF SENIOR 
SERVICES ADVISORY COUNCIL for an initial term to expire 12/31/2022.  
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4. Reappointing Dr. Leslie Cauvin, D.O. to the position of Assistant County Medical 
Examiner for a term of one (1) year, term to expire 2/28/2021. 

5. Reappointing Ronald Dancer, Plumsted and William Fox, New Egypt as members of 
the OC NATURAL LANDS TRUST FUND ADVISORY COMMITTEE, for a term 
of three (3) years, term to expire 2/18/2023. 

P. RECEIVED ITEMS 

Q. RESOLUTIONS FROM GOVERNING BODIES 

1. OC Health Department Resolution No. 75(20) proclaiming the month of March 2020 
as "National Colorectal Awareness Month". 

2. OC Health Department Resolution No. 76(20) proclaiming the month of March 2020 
as "National Nutrition Month". 

3. OC Health Department Resolution No. 77(20) proclaiming the week of March 2-6, 
2020 as "National School Breakfast Week". 

4. OC Health Department Resolution No. 78(20) proclaiming March 15-21, 2020 as 
"National Poison Prevention Week". 

5. OC Health Department Resolution No. 79(20) declaring March 12-16, 2020 as 
"National Flood Safety Awareness Week". 

6. OC Health Department Resolution No. 80(20) proclaiming March 30-April 5, 2020 
as "National Drug and Alcohol Facts Week". 

7. OC Health Department Resolution No. 81(20) proclaiming March 24, 2020 as 
"National World Tuberculosis Awareness Day". 

8. Township of Berkeley, Resolution No. 2020-96-R supporting the Ocean County 
Board of Chosen Freeholders' commitment to continuing services for the senior 
community. 

9. Township of Berkeley, Resolution No. 2020-97-R supporting Bill A512. 

10. Township of Berkeley, Resolution No. 2020-98-R opposing A969/S902 and S903 
which amend the permissible exemptions from immunizations for school aged 
children. 

11. Township of Berkeley, Resolution No. 2020-99-R supporting the preservation of the 
Second Amendment. 

12. Township of Toms River Resolution supporting the siting of the Fourth Army Corps 
Headquarters at Joint Base McGuire-Dix-Lakehurst, New Jersey. 

R. MINUTES AND MEETING NOTICES 

1. OC Planning Board Meeting Minutes of 1/15/2020. 
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2. OC Board of Health Meeting Minutes of 1/22/2020. 

3. OC Mental Health Board Meeting Minutes of 1/13/2020. 

4. OC Youth Services Commission Meeting Minutes of 12/5/2019. 

5. OC Shade Tree Commission Meeting Minutes of 12/12/2019. 

6. OC Air Park Advisory Committee Meeting Minutes of 1/22/2020. 

7. OC Utilities Authority Annual Meeting Notice, February 13, 2020. 

S. REPORTS 

1. 2019 Annual Financial Statement for the County of Ocean. 

T. CORRESPONDENCE 

1. Atlantic City Electric Company Notice of Filing and Public Hearings I/M/O the 
Petition of Atlantic City Electric Company for Approval of Electric Base Rate 
Adjustments Pursuant to the PowerAhead Program (11/2019), BPU Docket No. 
ER19111434. 

U. FREEHOLDER COMMENTS 

V. PUBLIC COMMENTS - "Comments from members of the audience are invited at this time 
with a limit of five (5) minutes per speaker." 

W. ADJOURNMENT 

Page 9 of 9






























































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































	Meeting Agenda for Feb 19, 2020_Board Meeting Agenda
	CALL TO ORDER
	ROLL CALL
	STATEMENT€€€€Compliance with the Open Public Meetings Act
	THE PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE AND PRAYER
	ORDINANCE - PUBLIC HEARING
	ORDINANCE #2020-1 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $3,000,000.00 from the Capital Improvement Fund for the Construction of Stormwater Management Facilities at Various Locations, all in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey.
	ORDINANCE #2020-2 - An Ordinance authorizing Various Engineering, Road, and Bridge Improvements, at Various Locations, all in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey, and appropriating $3,500,000.00 therefor and authorizing the issuance of $3,325,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance the same.
	ORDINANCE #2020-3 - An Ordinance authorizing the Rehabilitation and Repair of Various Bridges, in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey, and appropriating $2,000,000.00 therefor and authorizing the issuance of $1,900,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance the same.
	ORDINANCE #2020-4 - An Ordinance authorizing the Reconstruction of Prospect Street (Cross Street to U.S. 9), located in the Township of Lakewood, in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey, and appropriating $2,500,000.00 therefor and authorizing the issuance of $2,375,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance the same.
	ORDINANCE #2020-5 - An Ordinance authorizing the Reconstruction of North Hope Chapel Road (County Line Road to Miller Road), located in the Township of Lakewood, in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey, and appropriating $3,000,000.00 therefor and authorizing the issuance of $2,850,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance the same.
	ORDINANCE #2020-6 - An Ordinance authorizing the Design of Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Certain County Roads, all in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey, and appropriating $1,500,000.00 therefor and authorizing the issuance of $1,425,000.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to finance the same.

	RESOLUTION - INTRODUCTION
	2020 County Budget and Accompanying Resolutions.

	AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF BILLS IN BILL COMMITTEE REPORT NO. 4.
	AUTHORIZING ENGINEERING PAYMENTS TO CONTRACTORS AS LISTED BELOW:
	EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Replacement of East Branch Culvert (Structure No. 1533-011), Warren Grove-Whiting Road (C.R. 539) over the East Branch of the Oswego River, Barnegat Township - Partial Estimate #3, $13,579.22. (B2018-138E)
	C.J. HESSE, INC. - Reconstruction of Ridgeway Boulevard from Ridgeway Branch Bridge to C.R. 571, Township of Manchester - Partial Estimate #4, $182,930.36. (B2019-24E)
	MIDLANTIC CONSTRUCTION, LLC - Replacement of Ridgeway Boulevard Bridge (Structure No. 1518-002), Ridgeway Boulevard over the Ridgeway Branch of the Toms River, Manchester Township - Partial Estimate #2, $90,585.34. (B2019-127E)
	MIDLANTIC CONSTRUCTION, LLC - Replacement of Morris Boulevard Bridge (Structure No. 1530009), Morris Boulevard over Fox Island Creek, Stafford Township - Partial Estimate #3, $261,848.55. (B2019-110E)
	BLACK ROCK ENTERPRISES, LLC - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 2017D - Final Estimate #12, $213,480.05. (B2018-70E)
	EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 2018C - Partial Estimate #5, $58,747.77. (B2019-64E)
	EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 2019A - Partial Estimate #7, $116,283.20. (B2019-43E)

	RESOLUTIONS
	Authorizing the Personnel Resolution.
	Authorizing the cancellation and closeout of certain grants.
	Authorizing the acceptance of a grant award from the New Jersey Department of Human Services for the FY2019 Medication Assisted Treatment (MAT) Program, for the period of 12/1/2019 through 5/30/2020, in the amount of $233,332.00.
	Authorizing the execution of an agreement with a Certified Child Passenger Safety Technician through the Child Restraint Program Grant FY20, for the period of 10/1/2019 through 9/30/2020.
	Authorizing the execution of a Shared Services Agreement with Cumberland County for the housing of short-term commitment status juveniles.
	Authorizing the execution of Shared Services Agreements with various municipalities for the OC Recycling Center Use and Revenue Sharing Program, for the period of 1/1/2020 through 12/31/2024.
	Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the Borough of Harvey Cedars to provide Schedule "C" Road Department services, in an amount not to exceed $10,000.00, and Schedule "C" Engineering Department services, in an amount not to exceed $1,000.00, for the period of 1/1/2020 through 12/31/2020.
	Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the Borough of Mantoloking to provide Schedule "C" Road Department services, in an amount not to exceed $6,000.00,€for the period of 1/1/2020 through 12/31/2020.
	Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the Central Regional Board of Education to provide Schedule "C" Road Department services, in an amount not to exceed $5,000.00,€for the period of 1/1/2020 through 12/31/2020.
	Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the Borough of Island Heights to provide Schedule "C" Road Department services, in an amount not to exceed $40,000.00,€for the period of 1/1/2020 through 12/31/2020.
	Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC Utilities Authority to partially fund the 2020 OC Sewerage Pump Out Vessel Program, in an amount not to exceed $65,000.00, term to expire 12/31/2020.
	Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the Township of Brick for participation in the 2020 OC Sewerage Pump Out Vessel Program, in an amount not to exceed $40,000.00, with partial funding contingent upon adoption of the 2020 County Budget, term to expire 12/31/2020.
	Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the Borough of Seaside Park for participation in the 2020 OC Sewerage Pump Out Vessel Program, in an amount not to exceed $50,000.00,with partial funding contingent upon adoption of the 2020 County Budget, term to expire 12/31/2020.
	Authorizing an Agreement with the Barnegat Bay Decoy and Baymen's Museum for participation in the 2020 OC Sewerage Pump Out Vessel Program, in an amount not to exceed $40,000.00, with partial funding contingent upon adoption of the 2020 County Budget, term to expire 12/31/2020.
	Authorizing an Intercounty Mutual Aid Assistance Agreement with participating units for the OC Sheriff's Department.
	Authorizing the execution of the 2020 Initial Boundary Validation Program (BVP) for the U.S. Census Bureau.
	Amending a resolution adopted on 11/20/2019 authorizing a Shared Services Agreement with Toms River Township to enlist the services of the Township of Toms River's Clean Communities Educational Program, to reflect a correction to€the account number.
	Amending a resolution adopted on 6/19/2019 authorizing the execution of a Grant Application for the Emergency Management Agency Assistance FY19, to include additional language in the grant application.
	Authorizing the designation of€a new Volunteer Assistant C.E.R.T. Program Team Coordinator to assist€the Sheriff's Office, Office of Emergency Management.
	Opposing any law that would unconstitutionally restrict the rights under the Second Amendment.
	Authorizing the execution of Agreement Modification No. 1 with the NJ Department of Transportation for the Construction of Horizontal Curve High Friction Surface Treatment, Jackson, Lacey, Manchester, Plumsted and Toms River Townships, and Point Pleasant Borough, Ocean County, Federal Project No. HSIP-D00S(252), Agreement No. 2019-DT-BLA-307.
	Concurring with Ordinance No. 2017-22A of the Borough€of€Point Pleasant Beach to eliminate two (2) 15-minute parking spaces located on Broadway and add two (2) 15-minute parking spaces on Arnold Avenue in the Borough of Point Pleasant Beach.
	Authorizing the execution of an€Agreement€with Jersey Central Power and Light for the temporary relocation of overhead distribution facilities on Ridgeway Boulevard associated with the Replacement of Ridgeway Boulevard Bridge (Structure No. 1518-002), Ridgeway Boulevard over the Ridgeway Branch of the Toms River, Manchester Township.
	Authorizing the execution of an Easement Extension Agreement with New Jersey Natural Gas Company for an extension of the installation of facilities in Block 72, Lot 7 in the Township of Manchester.
	Authorizing the Release of Bonds for Road Opening Permits.
	Authorizing the execution of a Collective€Bargaining Agreement with the Fraternal Order of Police Jersey Shore Lodge 222 (Ocean County Prosecutor's Sergeants' Association), for the period of 7/1/2019 through 6/30/2022.
	Authorizing the execution of a Collective€Bargaining Agreement with the Ocean County Prosecutor's Office Superior Officers'€Association, for the period of 7/1/2019 through 6/30/2022.

	MOTIONS
	Authorizing the Clerk of the Board to accept and/or record legal instruments.
	Approving the Pre-Board Meeting Minutes of 1/8/2020.
	Approving the Board Meeting Minutes of 1/15/2020.
	Authorizing the distribution of Requests for Proposals and/or Requests for Qualifications as follows: 1) Correctional Chaplain; 2) Control System Engineering Services for Ocean County Movable Bridges; and 3) Consultant Material Sampling, Inspection and Testing Services for Various Projects in Ocean County Where and As Directed by Various Departments of the County of Ocean.
	Approving the plans and specifications and authorizing the County Engineer to advertise for the receipt of bids for the Stormwater Management Contract 2020A, Various Townships.
	Approving the Master Payroll paid on 2/19/2020 for the payroll period of 1/23/2020 through 2/5/2020 and for the payroll period of 2/6/2020 through 2/19/2020, in the amount of $5,230,152.58.

	TRAFFIC SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS
	Authorizing the removal of the Weight Limit Restriction on Bridge No. 1520003, known as Main Street Bridge (Main Street over Waretown Creek) within the Township of Ocean, effective immediately.

	BID AWARDS
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS to United Sales USA Corp.; Central Poly-Bag Corp.; Interboro Packaging Corp.; W.B. Mason Co., Inc.; and Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC, the lowest qualified bidders.€ Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 1 and 3 as unresponsive.€ Both rejected items will be rebid. (B2020-10)
	Awarding a Contract for the PROPOSED REFINISHES AT OCEAN COUNTY JUSTICE COMPLEX TUNNEL, TOMS RIVER, NJ, NO. II to J.H. Williams Enterprises, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder, for a Total Bid Award in the amount of $87,400.00 (including an allowance of $7,000.00). (B2020-12A)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of SOLAR POWERED LED SIGNS AND SOLAR POWERED SPEED RADAR SIGNS to Traffic Logix Corporation and J. Q. & G., Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. (B2020-14)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS to Romeo Enterprises; Prime Lube, Inc.; Johnson & Towers, Inc.; and PetroChoice, LLC, the lowest qualified bidders.€ No bids were received on Item No. 21d.€It will not be rebid as it is no longer needed. (B2020-17)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: NEW VANS, WAGONS, CARS AND PICKUP TRUCKS to Winner Ford, the lowest qualified bidder.€ No bids were received on Item Nos. 3, 3a, 3b, 3c, 3d, 3e, 3f, 3g, 3h, 3i, 3j, 3k, 3l, 3m, 3n, 3o, 3p, 3q, 3r, 3s and 3t.€ Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 3u and 3v as unresponsive.€ All no bid and rejected items will not be rebid as they are no longer needed. (B2020-22)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS to Dot Designing; Keyport Army Navy; Bob Barker Company, Inc.; A&M Industrial, Inc.; and All-Star Custom Apparel and Design, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders.€ No bids were received on Item Nos. 57 and 59.€ Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 35, 60a, 60b, 61a, 61b, 62, 65, 66, 125, 126, 127, 128, 129, 130, 131, 132, 133, 134, 135, 136, 137 and 138 as unresponsive.€ All no bid and rejected items will be rebid.€ Rejected Item Nos. 65 and 66 will be rebid with revised specifications. (B2020-23)
	Rejecting all bids received for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: NEW SPORT UTILITY VEHICLES.€ It will be rebid with revised specifications.
	Rejecting the sole bid received for the furnishing and delivery of RESCUE VESSEL WITH TRAILER NO. II and authorizing the County Purchasing Agent to enter into a negotiated contract in accordance with N.J.S.A. Chapter 40A:11-5(3), as no responsive bids were received for a second time.
	Rescinding PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES€Item No. 153 from Cloud-Age IT, as the vendor is unable to honor their contract. Recommendation is made to enter into an amendatory contract for Item No. 153 with Star Data Co., the next lowest qualified bidder. (B2019-171)

	CHANGE ORDERS
	Awarding Change Order No. 3 to Gavan General Contracting, Inc. for the project entitled Plumsted Garage Vehicle Wash Facility, an increase in the amount of $2,912.16. (B2018-110CE)

	CONTRACTS
	Awarding a Contract to Global Tel*Link Corporation to provide Ocean County Department of Corrections Video Visitation Maintenance, in an amount not to exceed $59,850.00, contingent upon adoption of the 2020€County Budget,€for the period of 3/1/2020 through 2/28/2021. (CP2020-53)
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Mott MacDonald, LLC to provide Professional Engineering Services - Solid Waste Management, Recycling and Underground Storage Tanks, in an amount not to exceed $378,900.00, for the period of 3/2/2020 through 3/1/2021. (QP2020-54)
	Accepting the Qualifications of Magnum Integrated Marketing, LLC; NJ Advance Media; and Town Square Media to provide General Advertising, Radio Advertising and/or Subscription Services No. II, for the period of 1/1/2020 through 12/31/2020. (QP2020-56)
	Amending a Contract with Robert W. Allison, CPA, RMA, PSA to provide Auditing Services, an increase in the amount of $20,000.00. (QP2020-4)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to T&M Associates to provide Environmental Consulting Services for the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Program, in an amount not to exceed $23,950.00. (QP2019-105)
	Awarding Professional Services Contracts for Title Binder and Commitment / Insurance and Search Services to Surety Title Agency /Coastal Region, LLC; Allstate Title Agency, LLC; Mid-State Abstract Company; and Two Rivers Title Company, LLC, in an amount not to exceed $125,000.00, for the period of 2/1/2020 through 1/31/2021. (QP2020-55)
	Authorizing the County Purchasing Agent to enter into negotiations for the furnishing and delivery of Software Licensing and Maintenance Services compatible with Bentley Systems Software for the OC Engineer's Office, for the period of 2/19/2020 through 2/18/2022.
	Qualifying twenty-two (22) firms as eligible to provide Land Surveying Services for Various Projects in Ocean County, on a project specific contract basis, for the period of 2/21/2020 through 2/20/2021 as follows: Van Cleef Engineering Associates, LLC; Owen, Little & Associates, Inc.; Remington & Vernick Engineers, Inc.; GEOD Corporation; Adams, Rehmann & Heggan Associates, Inc.; French & Parrello Associates, P.A.; Maser Consulting P.A.; CME Associates; ACT Engineers, Inc.; Churchill Consulting Engineers; Environmental Resolutions, Inc.; Johnson, Mirmiran & Thompson, Inc.; Gravatt Consulting Group, Inc.; GTS Consultants, Inc.; Dynamic Survey, LLC; Bowman Consulting Group, Ltd.; AmerCom Corp.; Morgan Engineering, LLC; WJH Engineering, LLC; Professional Design Services, LLC; MFS Consulting Engineers & Surveyors, DPC; and Schaeffer Nassar Scheidegg Consulting Engineers, LLC. (QP2020-57)
	Qualifying eleven (11) firms as eligible to provide On-Call Traffic Engineering Professional Services, on a project specific contract basis, for the period of 2/21/2020 through 2/20/2021 as follows: Remington & Vernick Engineers, Inc.; French & Parrello Associates, PA; Urban Engineers, Inc.; Stantec Consulting Services, Inc.; Johnson, Mirmiran & Thompson, Inc.; McMahon Associates, Inc.; Greenman-Pedersen, Inc.; NV5, Inc.; Dewberry Engineers, Inc.; Maser Consulting P.A.; and Environmental Resolutions, Inc. (QP2020-58)
	Amending a Contract with Community Medical Center, Inc. to provide Autopsy Services for the Medical Examiner, an increase in an amount not to exceed $4,182.00. (QP2018-139)

	APPOINTMENTS AND REAPPOINTMENTS
	Appointing Robert Day, Barnabas Health Community Medical Center; Vin Ebenau, WOBM; and Jessica Raftery, Hackensack Meridian Health Ocean Medical Center as new members and reappointing Israel Bursztyn, Lakewood; Brian Kubiel, Toms River Board of Fire Commissioners; and Patrick Gildner, Hackensack Meridian Health Southern Ocean Medical Center as members of the OC EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT COUNCIL, for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 3/1/2023.
	Appointing Shelby Voorhees, Manahawkin and Sandra Rodriguez, Brick as new members and reappointing Doreen Burns, Toms River; April Yezzi, Toms River; Shabsi Ganzweig, Lakewood; and L. Thomas Gross, Jr., Bayville as members of the OC COMMISSION ON CHILD SAFETY AND AWARENESS, for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 2/28/2023.
	Appointing Jane Kunka, Barnegat as a new member of the OC OFFICE OF SENIOR SERVICES ADVISORY COUNCIL for an initial term to expire 12/31/2022.€
	Reappointing Dr. Leslie Cauvin, D.O. to the position of Assistant County Medical Examiner for a term of one (1) year, term to expire 2/28/2021.
	Reappointing Ronald Dancer, Plumsted and William Fox, New Egypt as members of the OC NATURAL LANDS TRUST FUND ADVISORY COMMITTEE, for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 2/18/2023.

	RECEIVED ITEMS
	RESOLUTIONS FROM GOVERNING BODIES
	OC Health Department Resolution No. 75(20) proclaiming the month of March 2020 as "National Colorectal Awareness Month".
	OC Health Department Resolution No. 76(20) proclaiming the month of March 2020 as "National Nutrition Month".
	OC Health Department Resolution No. 77(20) proclaiming the week of March 2-6, 2020 as "National School Breakfast Week".
	OC Health Department Resolution No. 78(20) proclaiming March 15-21, 2020 as "National Poison Prevention Week".
	OC Health Department Resolution No. 79(20) declaring March 12-16, 2020 as "National Flood Safety Awareness Week".
	OC Health Department Resolution No. 80(20) proclaiming March 30-April 5, 2020 as "National Drug and Alcohol Facts Week".
	OC Health Department Resolution No. 81(20) proclaiming March 24, 2020 as "National World Tuberculosis Awareness Day".
	Township of Berkeley, Resolution No. 2020-96-R supporting the Ocean County Board of Chosen Freeholders' commitment to continuing services for the senior community.
	Township of Berkeley, Resolution No. 2020-97-R supporting Bill A512.
	Township of Berkeley, Resolution No. 2020-98-R opposing A969/S902 and S903 which amend the permissible exemptions from immunizations for school aged children.
	Township of Berkeley, Resolution No. 2020-99-R supporting the preservation of the Second Amendment.
	Township of Toms River Resolution supporting the siting of the Fourth Army Corps Headquarters at Joint Base McGuire-Dix-Lakehurst, New Jersey.

	MINUTES AND MEETING NOTICES
	OC Planning Board Meeting Minutes of 1/15/2020.
	OC Board of Health Meeting Minutes of 1/22/2020.
	OC Mental Health Board Meeting Minutes of 1/13/2020.
	OC Youth Services Commission Meeting Minutes of 12/5/2019.
	OC Shade Tree Commission Meeting Minutes of 12/12/2019.
	OC Air Park Advisory Committee Meeting Minutes of 1/22/2020.
	OC Utilities Authority Annual Meeting Notice, February 13, 2020.

	REPORTS
	2019 Annual Financial Statement for the County of Ocean.

	CORRESPONDENCE
	Atlantic City Electric Company Notice of Filing and Public Hearings I/M/O the Petition of Atlantic City Electric Company for Approval of Electric Base Rate Adjustments Pursuant to the PowerAhead Program (11/2019), BPU Docket No. ER19111434.

	FREEHOLDER COMMENTS
	PUBLIC COMMENTS - "Comments from members of the audience are invited at this time with a limit of five (5) minutes per speaker."
	ADJOURNMENT


