
Board Meeting Agenda

Date: December 21, 2016 - 4:00 PM

Location: Administration Building
Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

A. Call to Order 

B. Roll Call 

C. STATEMENT    Compliance with the Open Public Meetings Act 

D. The Pledge of Allegiance and Prayer 

E. ORDINANCE - PUBLIC HEARING 

1. ORDINANCE #2016-26 - Refunding Bond Ordinance providing for Various Capital 
Equipment and Improvements for the Energy Savings Improvement Program of the 
County of Ocean, New Jersey, appropriating an amount not to exceed $18,000,000.00 
therefor and authorizing the issuance of Bonds or Notes of the County of Ocean for 
financing the cost thereof. 

F. RESOLUTION - PUBLIC HEARING 

1. Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory 
Committee to participate in the acquisition of property identified as Addendum A, 
totaling approximately 95 acres in Barnegat and Ocean Townships, in an amount not 
to exceed $575,500.00. 

2. Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory 
Committee to participate in the acquisition of Block 882, Lot 4.01, Berkeley 
Township, in an amount not to exceed $432,500.00 plus up to $6,000.00 for property 
tax adjustments. 
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3. Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory 
Committee to participate in the acquisition of Block 8.35, Lot 9, Beachwood 
Borough, in an amount not to exceed $500.00 plus up to $100.00 for property tax 
adjustments. 

4. Accepting the recommendation of the OC Natural Lands Trust Fund Advisory 
Committee to participate in the acquisition of Block 106, Lot 6 and Block 107, Lot 
11, Manchester Township, in an amount not to exceed $105,000.00 plus $900.00 for 
property tax adjustments. 

G. Authorizing Payment of Bills in Bill Committee Report No. 24. 

H. Authorizing Engineering Payments to Contractors as listed below. 

1. GREEN CONSTRUCTION, INC. - Improvements to Garden State Parkway 
Interchange 91, Brick Township - Partial Estimate #21 - $346,558.79. 

2. EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Replacement of Jackson Mills Culvert No. 1511-
042, Jackson Township - Partial Estimate #1 - $26,832.40. 

3. C.J. HESSE, INC. - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of CR 528 (East Veterans 
Highway), from 500' East of Whitesville Road to 700' East of Siena Drive, Jackson 
Township - Partial Estimate #5 - $130,808.34. 

4. J.C. CONTRACTING, INC. - Construction of Long Beach Boulevard Traffic Signal 
Upgrades, Phase A, Group 2, Long Beach Boulevard, Long Beach Township - Partial 
Estimate #2 - $85,355.53. 

5. LUCAS CONSTRUCTION GROUP, INC. - Stormwater Management Contract 
2016A, Toms River Township - Final Estimate #5 - $37,270.95. 

6. EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of 
Certain County Roads, Contract 2015E - Partial Estimate #3 - $148,840.21. 

7. EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of 
Certain County Roads, Contract 2016A - Partial Estimate #4 - $588,102.19. 

I. RESOLUTIONS 

1. Authorizing the County Personnel Resolution. 

2. Honoring Thomas Coccia as he retires from 40 years of dedicated service to the 
Ocean County Central Mailroom. 

3. Honoring Dawn Rowley as she retires from 28 years of dedicated service to the 
Ocean County Central Mailroom. 

4. Authorizing transfers between Current Account Balances. 

5. Authorizing the Cancellation of Current Account Balances that are no longer needed. 

6. Authorizing the transfer of 2015 Encumbrances to Accounts Payable. 
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7. Re-authorizing established Change Funds for the year 2017. 

8. Authorizing an increase to the Petty Cash Fund for the Department of Vehicle 
Services. 

9. Authorizing a name change for the Custodian of the Petty Cash Fund for the 
Department of Vehicle Services. 

10. Authorizing the execution of a Grant Application for the Emergency Management 
Agency Assistance Grant FY16. 

11. Authorizing the execution of a Grant Application to the NJ Department of 
Transportation for Runway 6-24 Precision Approach Path Indicators (PAPIs) & 
Runway End Identifier Lights (REILs) (Construction) Project at the OC Airpark. 

12. Authorizing an Amendment to a Grant Application adopted on 2/17/2016 to include 
additional language for the FY15 Paul Coverdell Forensic Science Improvement 
Grant. 

13. Authorizing the execution of three (3) Agreements for the OC Disability Awareness 
Through Education Program (O.C.D.A.T.E.). 

14. Authorizing Shared Service Agreements with various Municipalities for the Driving 
While Intoxicated Enforcement Program FY16. 

15. Authorizing Shared Service Agreements with various Municipalities for the Drug 
Recognition Expert Callout Program FY16. 

16. Authorizing Shared Service Agreements with various Municipalities for 9-1-1 
Emergency Telecommunications Services. 

17. Authorizing a Shared Services Agreement with the OCUA for Construction of a 
Public Service Communications Tower. 

18. Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Agreement under the CDBG Housing 
Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the Planning Director. 

19. Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Agreement under the CDBG Housing 
Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the Planning Director. 

20. Authorizing a Modification to a Deferred Loan Agreement under the HOME Housing 
Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the Planning Director. 

21. Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with OC Vocational-Technical School 
for Schedule "C" Vehicle Services, in an amount not to exceed $70,000.00. 

22. Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC Mosquito Extermination 
Commission for Schedule "C" Vehicle Services, in an amount not to exceed $500.00. 

23. Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC Library for Schedule "C" 
Vehicle Services, in an amount not to exceed $110,000.00. 

24. Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC Board of Social Services 
for Schedule "C" Vehicle Services, in an amount not to exceed $20,000.00. 
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25. Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC PIC, Inc. for Schedule "C" 
Vehicle Services, in an amount not to exceed $5,000.00. 

26. Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC Health Department for 
Schedule "C" Vehicle Services, in an amount not to exceed $200,000.00. 

27. Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC Library Commission for 
participation in the OC Self-Insured Workers' Compensation Program. 

28. Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC Board of Social Services 
for participation in the OC Self-Insured Workers' Compensation Program. 

29. Authorizing an Amendment to a Memorandum of Understanding adopted on 
2/22/2016 with the Township of Berkeley through the Prosecutor's Body Worn 
Camera Grant FY15. 

30. Accepting the Quotation from All Chemical Leasing, Inc. for a Pre-Owned Water 
Tanker Trailer, in an amount not to exceed $20,620.00. 

31. Authorizing the transfer of PP2016-126 from HMM Architects, PC to Mott 
MacDonald Architects, PC for the contract duration under the same terms and 
conditions. 

32. Authorizing a one (1) year extension of Contract B2016-40 with Keith & Jacqueline 
Conroy, Inc. d/b/a West Jersey Air Conditioning & Heating  Co. for Heating, 
Ventilating & Air Conditioning Maintenance, Service and Alteration. 

33. Amending a Resolution adopted on 10/19/2016 due to typographical errors. 

34. Rescinding a Resolution adopted on 11/16/2016 for the transfer of ownership of a 
Vehicle no longer needed for County use to the Township of Berkeley. 

35. Authorizing the execution of a Collective Bargaining Agreement with the NJ State 
Policeman's Benevolent Association Local #258A representing Correction's Superior 
Officers for the period 4/1/2016 through 6/30/2019. 

36. Approving the Release of Bonds for Road Opening Permits. 

J. MOTIONS 

1. Authorizing the Clerk of the Board to record and/or accept Legal Instruments. 

2. Approving the Distribution of Requests for Proposals and/or Request for 
Qualifications for: 1) Professional Engineering Services - Solid Waste Management, 
Recycling and Underground Storage Tanks  2) Special Labor Counsel  3) Title 
Binder and Commitment/Insurance and Search Services for various projects in Ocean 
County, where and as directed by various Departments of Ocean County  4) On-Call 
Traffic Engineering Professional Services, where and as directed by the County 
Engineer  5) Land Surveying Services for various projects in Ocean County, where 
and as directed by various Departments of Ocean County 

3. Approving the OC Master Payroll paid on 12/14/2016 for the payroll period of 
11/17/2016 through 11/30/2016 and for the payroll period of 12/1/2016 through 
12/14/2016, in the amount of $5,149,938.74 

4. Approving the Minutes of the Pre-Board Meeting of 10/26/2016. 
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5. Authorizing the acquisition of Right-of-Way and/or Easement(s) by gift, purchase, 
exchange or condemnation for the Traffic Signal and Intersection Safety Upgrades 
along County Road 54, Fischer Boulevard at Cattus Island Boulevard (Overlay 
2016B), and is in conjunction with project Reconstruction and Resurfacing of 
Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 2016B, Toms River Township (one 
parcel). 

6. Authorizing the acquisition of Right-of-Way and/or Easement(s) by gift, purchase, 
exchange or condemnation for the Traffic Signal and Intersection Safety Upgrades 
along County Road 54, Fischer Boulevard at Overlook Drive (Overlay 2016B), and is 
in conjunction with project Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain 
County Roads, Contract 2016B, Toms River Township (one parcel). 

7. Authorizing the acquisition of Right-of-Way and/or Easement(s) by gift, purchase, 
exchange or condemnation for the Traffic Signal and Intersection Safety Upgrades 
along County Road 14, Church Road at Road 16, Old Freehold Road (Overlay 
2016B), and in conjunction with project Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions 
of Certain County Roads, Contract 2016B, Toms River Township (two parcels). 

8. Authorizing the acquisition of Right-of-Way and/or Easement(s) by gift, purchase, 
exchange or condemnation at the intersection of County Road 32, James Street and 
Grantwood Drive (formerly Grantwood Avenue) for the purpose of an intersection 
reconstruction upgrade, Lakewood Township (one parcel). 

K. TRAFFIC SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS 

1. Consenting to Jackson Township's Ordinance #20-16 for Prohibiting Left Turns at 
CR #3 (Hope Chapel Road) and the exit driveway of Wawa Shopping Plaza. 

L. BID AWARDS 

1. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: NEW 
EXCAVATOR to Jesco, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder. 

2. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: NEW 
RACK PICKUP TRUCK WITH LIFTGATE to Maplecrest Lincoln-Mercury, Inc. 
dba Maplecrest Ford Lincoln, the lowest qualified bidder. 

3. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of GENERATOR 
IMPROVEMENTS AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS, TOMS RIVER to Gary Kubiak & 
Son Electric, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder. 

4. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of RIPRAP to Trap Rock 
Industries, LLC, the lowest qualified bidder. 

5. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of INTEGRATED PEST 
MANAGEMENT to Meticulous Landscaping, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder. 

6. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: NEW 
REFUSE COLLECTION TRUCK to Robert H. Hoover & Sons, Inc., the lowest 
qualified bidder. 

7. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of SUPER HEAVY DUTY 96" 
FLAIL to Cherry Valley Tractor Sales, the lowest qualified bidder. 
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8. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS EQUIPMENT 
FOR THE TRAFFIC DIVISION OF THE ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT to Good 
Friend Electric; General Traffic Equipment Corp.; Traffic Parts. Inc.; Flemington 
Aluminum & Brass, Inc.; Signal Control Products, Inc.; and Intelligent Traffic  
Supply Products, LLC, the lowest qualified bidders.  No bids were received for items 
115, 151, 155, 156, 177, 187, 221, 222, 228, 230, 271, 305, 306, 307, 309, 327, 333, 
340, 345, 350, 359, 360, 361, 363, 364 and 368.  Recommendation is made to reject 
item 229.  All no bid and rejected bid items will be rebid. 

9. Awarding Contract for the furnishing and delivery of EQUIPMENT PARTS, 
REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR THE SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT 
DEPARTMENT to Gerhart Scale Corp.; Deacon Equipment Company, Inc. and 
Advance Scale, the lowest qualified bidders.  No bids were received for one hundred 
and forty (140) items.  The no bid items will be rebid, except for items 18a, 18b, 18c, 
and 18d, which are no longer needed. 

10. Awarding a Contract for the MANHOLE COVERS AND CONCRETE SLABS 
REPLACEMENT AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS, TOMS RIVER, NJ to Seacoast 
Construction, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder, in an amount not to exceed 
$49,250.00. 

11. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of TOURISM FULFILLMENT 
SERVICES FOR THE TOURISM COUNCIL to Rick L. Marschall, the lowest 
qualified bidder. 

12. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: NEW 
MEDIUM DUTY DUMP TRUCK WITH PLOW AND SPREADER to Route 23 
Automall, LLC, the lowest qualified bidder. 

13. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of AGRICULTURAL SUPPLIES 
to Reed & Perrine Sales, Inc.; Andre & Son, Inc.; Seeton Turf Warehouse, LLC; 
Fisher & Son Co., Inc.; Crop Production Services; Plant Food Company, Inc.; Siteone 
Landscape Supply and Levitt's, LLC, the lowest qualified bidders.  No bids were 
received for items 1, 5, 18, 30, 53, 71, 78, 81, 82, 83, 89, 95 and 97.  
Recommendation is made to reject item 11.  All no bid and rejected bid items will be 
rebid. 

14. Rescinding Section II (Items No. 19-33) and Section IV (Items No. 51-54) awarded 
to Seaboard Fire and Safety as vendor can no longer honor their contract for FIRE 
EXTINGUISHERS, FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS, FIRE SUPPRESSION & 
SPRINKLER SYSTEMS MAINTENANCE, SERVICE & REPAIR.  
Recommendation is made to enter into an Amendatory Contract with Allied Fire & 
Safety Equipment Company, Inc. for Section II (Items No. 19-33) and a Contract 
with Absolute Protective Systems, Inc. for Section IV (Items No. 51-54), the next 
lowest qualified bidders. 

15. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: NEW 
CARS, TRUCKS, SUV'S AND VANS NO. III to Maplecrest Lincoln-Mercury, Inc. 
DBA Maplecrest Ford Lincoln, the lowest qualified bidder. 

M. CHANGE ORDERS 

1. Authorizing Change Order #7 to Eagle Construction Services, Inc.for the Ocean 
County Justice Complex Additions and Alterations, a decrease in the amount of 
$4,192.00. 
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N. CONTRACTS 

1. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Edison Imaging Associates, P.A. t/a 
Advanced Medical Imaging of Toms River for a Certified Radiology Facility to 
provide Radiology Services for the OC Workers' Compensation Program. 

2. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Monmouth Medical Center Southern 
Campus to provide Mental Health Services to Ocean County Residents, in an amount 
not to exceed $367,845.00. 

3. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Ocean Mental Health Services to 
provide Mental Health Services to Ocean County Residents, in an amount not to 
exceed $754,451.00. 

4. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Preferred Behavioral Health of NJ to 
provide Mental Health Services to Ocean County Residents, in an amount not to 
exceed $504,370.00. 

5. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Frank B. Holman, III to audit the 
accounts and records for the OC Insurance Program and to perform auditing services 
for the OC Department of Senior Services. 

6. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to NMS Labs to provide the OC Medical 
Examiner's Office with Postmortem Toxicology Laboratory Services. 

7. Awarding Professional Service Contracts to Kedz Funeral Home, Wood Funeral 
Home Colonial Funeral Home, Oliverie Funeral Home and Tilghman Funeral Home 
to provide the OC Medical Examiner's Office with Licensed Funeral Home Directors 
for the purpose of transporting human remains. 

8. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to DT Service, LLC to provide Drug and 
Alcohol Testing Services to assist the County in complying with the Omnibus 
Transportation Testing Act of 1991, in an amount not to exceed $18,000.00. 

9. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to RWJ Barnabas Health Corporate Care 
to provide the County of Ocean with Professional Medical Services, in an amount not 
to exceed $35,000.00. 

10. Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Shore Forensic Psychology, LLC to 
provide Pre-Employment Psychological Evaluations for the County of Ocean. 

11. Awarding an Extraordinary, Unspecifiable Services Contract to National Vision 
Administrators, L.L.C. to provide the County of Ocean with a Vision Service Plan, in 
an amount not to exceed $100,000.00. 

12. Awarding an Extraordinary, Unspecifiable Services Contract to Conner Strong & 
Buckelew Companies, Inc. for Insurance Brokerage, Consultant and Risk 
Management Services for the County of Ocean. 

13. Awarding an Extraordinary, Unspecifiable Services Contract to Dawn Kennedy-
Little, D.O. for Medical Advisory/Consultant Services for the OC Prosecutor's Office 
SANE Program, in an amount not to exceed $5,100.00. 

14. Awarding an Extraordinary, Unspecifiable Services Contract to Vetgroup, Inc. to 
provide Counseling and other related services to the Veterans of Ocean County, in an 
amount not to exceed $190,350.00. 
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15. Awarding a Contract to Qual-Lynx to provide Claims Administration and related 
services to assist the County in the administration of its General Liability, Auto 
Liability, Police Professional, Public Official and Worker Compensation Insurance 
Programs. 

16. Awarding a Contract to The Actuarial Advantage, Inc. for a Consultant for the 
provision of Actuarial Services for the Self-Insured Portion of the OC Insurance 
Program. 

17. Awarding a Contract to Insurance Buyers' Council, Inc. for a Consultant to provide 
Risk Management and Insurance Advisory Services for the County's Risk 
Assumption and Insurance Program. 

18. Awarding a Contract to Preferred Behavioral Health of NJ, Inc. to provide the County 
of Ocean with an Employee Assistance Program, in an amount not to exceed 
$36,075.00. 

19. Authorizing a one (1) year contract extension to Election Graphics, Inc. to provide 
the County of Ocean with Election Ballot Design, Printing and other related services. 

20. Awarding a Competitive Contract to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to 
provide Home Delivered Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount 
not to exceed $152,593.00. 

21. Awarding a Competitive Contract to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to 
provide Home Delivered Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount 
not to exceed $1,501,443.00. 

22. Awarding a Competitive Contract to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to 
provide Home Delivered Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount 
not to exceed $41,308.00. 

23. Awarding a Competitive Contract to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to 
provide Social Support Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to 
exceed $40,895.00. 

24. Awarding a Competitive Contract to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to 
provide Congregate Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not 
to exceed $782,173.00. 

25. Awarding a Competitive Contract to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to 
provide Weekend/Holiday Home Delivered Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean 
County, in an amount not to exceed $124,173.00. 

26. Awarding a Competitive Contract to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to 
provide Social Support Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to 
exceed $478,749.00. 
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27. Awarding Professional Service Contracts for Small Road and Bridge Design 
Services, Various Locations throughout Ocean County, where and as directed by the 
County Engineer, to the following:  Bridges: Cherry, Weber & Associates, P.C.; 
AmerCom Corporation; Johnson, Mirmiran & Thompson, Inc.; NV5, Inc.; Dewberry 
Engineers, Inc.; Mott MacDonald, LLC; IH Engineers, Inc.; Maser Consulting, PA; 
Churchill Consulting Engineers, LLC; French & Parrello Associates, PA; CME 
Associates and Buchart Horn, Inc. Roads: Owen, Little and Associates, Inc.; T&M 
Associates; Michael Baker International, Inc.; Stantec Consulting Services, Inc.; 
HAKS Engineers, Architects and Land Surveyors, PC; Remington, Vernick & Vena 
Engineers; Greenman-Pedersen, Inc.; DW Smith Associates, Inc.; KMA Consulting 
Engineers; Environment Resolutions, Inc.; Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc. and The 
Alaimo Group, Inc. 

O. APPOINTMENTS AND REAPPOINTMENTS 

1. Appointing Mark Villinger, OC Planning Board and reappointing Jeff Adams, 
Jackson; Alan Perry, Bayville; Mark C. Vodak, Plumsted; Christine R. Raabe, Soil 
Conservation District and Dr. Steven Yergeau, Rutger's Cooperative Extension to the 
OC AGRICULTURE DEVELOPMENT BOARD for a term of four (4) years, term to 
expire 12/31/2020. 

2. Appointing Channell Wilkins, O.C.E.A.N., Inc. and Reappointing Anthony M. 
Agliata, OC Planning Department; Linda Murtagh, OC Board of Social Services; 
Marshall J. Kern, Representative, Banking/Financial; Tracy Maksel, OC Department 
of Human Services; Faith Liguori, Ocean Housing Alliance, Inc.; Carol Wolfe, 
Homes Now, Inc.; Representative, Governing Body of Brick Township; 
Representative, Governing Body of Jackson Township; Representative, Governing 
Body of Lakewood Township; Representative, Governing Body of Toms River 
Township; Representative, Berkeley Housing Authority; Representative, Brick 
Housing Authority; and Representative, Lakewood Housing Authority to the 
COUNTY HOUSING ADVISORY COMMITTEE (CHAC) for a term of one (1) 
year, term to expire 12/31/2017. 

3. Appointing Steven J. Simone, Toms River to the OC TRANSPORTATION 
ADVISORY COMMITTEE FOR SENIOR CITIZENS AND PERSONS WITH 
DISABILITIES for an initial term to expire 10/23/2019. 

4. Reappointing Julie N. Tarrant to the position of Chief Financial Officer for a term of 
three (3) years, term to expire 12/31/2019. 

5. Reappointing Michael J. Fiure to the position of Director of Management and Budget 
for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 12/31/2019. 

6. Reappointing Sheriff Michael G. Mastronardy to the position of County Coordinator 
of Emergency Management, Department of Emergency Services for a term of three 
(3) years, term to expire 1/5/2020. 

7. Reappointing Anthony M. Agliata, OC Department of Planning and Keith J. 
Goetting, Director of OC Employee Relations to the COMMUNITY 
DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT COMMITTEE  for a term of one (1) year, term 
to expire 12/31/2017. 

8. Reappointing Henry J. Mancini, Stafford Township and Ruthanne Scaturro, Brick to 
the OC LIBRARY COMMISSION for a term of five (5) years, term to expire 
12/31/2021. 
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9. Reappointing Hilda Diaz, Toms River; Robert Martino, Berkeley Township; and 
Linwood McWilliams, Toms River to the OC OFFICE OF SENIOR SERVICES 
ADVISORY COUNCIL for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 12/31/2019. 

10. Reappointing Charlene Costaris, Barnegat as a member for a term of five (5) years, 
term to expire 1/1/2022; and John Reiser, Stafford Township as Alternate Member 
No. 1 for a term of two (2) years, term to expire 1/1/2019; both to the OC SHADE 
TREE ADVISORY COMMISSION. 

11. Reappointing Jill Perez, Toms River to the OC BOARD OF SOCIAL SERVICES for 
a term of five (5) years, term to expire 12/31/2021. 

12. Reappointing Patrick Donnelly, Lakewood; David Most, Forked River; Suzanne M. 
Plesnarski, Manchester; and Angela Kacsur, Toms River to the OC SOLID WASTE 
ADVISORY COUNCIL for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 12/31/2019. 

13. Reappointing Susan Sedivec, Toms River; Barbara Lehman, Harvey Cedars; Dr. 
Theresa J. Kubiel, Toms River; Dana Ann O'Connor, Ship Bottom; Bonnie R. 
Peterson, Esq., Seaside Park; and April Yezzi, Toms River to the OC ADVISORY 
COMMISSION ON THE STATUS OF WOMEN for a term of three (3) years, term 
to expire 12/31/2019. 

P. RECEIVED ITEMS 

Q. RESOLUTIONS FROM GOVERNING BODIES 

1. Plumsted Township supporting A-1707 prohibiting Municipal Ordinances to create 
Sanctuary City. 

2. OC Library Commission authorizing a Lease Agreement with Paramount Commons 
at Whiting, LLC, the County of Ocean and the Township of Manchester for 
operations of a Branch Library. 

3. OC Library Commission establishing the 2017 Meeting Schedule. 

4. Hudson County authorizing the NJ Association of Counties, on behalf of the County 
Executive and Board of Chosen Freeholders of Hudson County, to file a complaint 
with the NJ Council on Local Mandates. 

5. Mercer County recognizing November 2016 as "Pancreatic Cancer Awareness 
Month". 

6. Ocean Township proclaiming December 2016 as "3D National Drunk and Drugged 
Driving Prevention Month". 

7. Ocean Township recognizing November 2016 as "National Family Caregiver 
Month". 

8. Ocean Township proclaiming December 1, 2016 as "World AIDS Day". 

R. MINUTES AND MEETING NOTICES 

1. OC Planning Board Meeting Minutes of 11/16/2016. 
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2. OC Library Commission Meeting Minutes of 11/15/2016 and 2017 Meeting Dates. 

3. OC Insurance Committee Meeting Minutes of 11/17/2016. 

4. OC Workforce Development Board Meeting Minutes of 9/13/2016. 

5. OC Transportation Advisory Committee for Senior Citizens and Persons with 
Disabilities Meeting Minutes of 11/30/2016. 

S. REPORTS 

1. OC Treasurer's Report for the period ending October 2016. 

2. Ocean County 2016 Abstract of Ratables. 

T. APPROVALS 

1. Division of Local Government Services approval of four (4) Items of Revenue. 

U. CORRESPONDENCE 

1. Surf City Borough Mayor's Winter Newsletter to residents. 

V. FREEHOLDER COMMENTS 

W. PUBLIC COMMENTS - Comments from members of the audience are invited at this time 
with a limit of five (5) minutes per speaker. 

X. ADJOURNMENT 
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	LUCAS CONSTRUCTION GROUP, INC. - Stormwater Management Contract 2016A, Toms River Township - Final Estimate #5 - $37,270.95.
	EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 2015E - Partial Estimate #3 - $148,840.21.
	EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 2016A - Partial Estimate #4 - $588,102.19.

	RESOLUTIONS
	Authorizing the County Personnel Resolution.
	Honoring Thomas Coccia as he retires from 40 years of dedicated service to the Ocean County Central Mailroom.
	Honoring Dawn Rowley as she retires from 28 years of dedicated service to the Ocean County Central Mailroom.
	Authorizing transfers between Current Account Balances.
	Authorizing the Cancellation of Current Account Balances that are no longer needed.
	Authorizing the transfer of 2015 Encumbrances to Accounts Payable.
	Re-authorizing established Change Funds for the year 2017.
	Authorizing an increase€to the Petty Cash Fund for the Department of Vehicle Services.
	Authorizing a name change for the Custodian of the Petty Cash Fund for the Department of Vehicle Services.
	Authorizing the execution of a Grant Application for the Emergency Management Agency Assistance Grant FY16.
	Authorizing the execution of a Grant Application to the NJ Department of Transportation for Runway 6-24 Precision Approach Path Indicators (PAPIs) & Runway End Identifier Lights (REILs) (Construction) Project at the€OC Airpark.
	Authorizing an Amendment to a Grant Application adopted on 2/17/2016 to include additional language for the FY15 Paul Coverdell Forensic Science Improvement Grant.
	Authorizing the execution of three (3) Agreements for the OC Disability Awareness Through Education Program (O.C.D.A.T.E.).
	Authorizing Shared Service Agreements with various Municipalities for the Driving While Intoxicated Enforcement Program FY16.
	Authorizing Shared Service Agreements with various Municipalities for the Drug Recognition Expert Callout Program FY16.
	Authorizing Shared Service Agreements with various Municipalities for 9-1-1 Emergency Telecommunications Services.
	Authorizing a Shared Services Agreement with the OCUA for Construction of a Public Service Communications Tower.
	Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Agreement under the CDBG Housing Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the Planning Director.
	Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Agreement under the CDBG Housing Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the Planning Director.
	Authorizing a Modification to a Deferred Loan Agreement under the HOME Housing Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the Planning Director.
	Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with OC Vocational-Technical School for Schedule "C" Vehicle Services, in an amount not to exceed $70,000.00.
	Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC Mosquito Extermination Commission for Schedule "C" Vehicle Services, in an amount not to exceed $500.00.
	Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC Library for Schedule "C" Vehicle Services, in an amount not to exceed $110,000.00.
	Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC Board of Social Services for Schedule "C" Vehicle Services, in an amount not to exceed $20,000.00.
	Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC PIC, Inc.€for Schedule "C" Vehicle Services, in an amount not to exceed $5,000.00.
	Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC Health Department for Schedule "C" Vehicle Services, in an amount not to exceed $200,000.00.
	Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC Library Commission for participation in the OC Self-Insured Workers' Compensation Program.
	Authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the OC Board of Social Services for participation in the OC Self-Insured Workers' Compensation Program.
	Authorizing an Amendment to a Memorandum of Understanding adopted on 2/22/2016 with the Township of Berkeley through the Prosecutor's Body Worn Camera Grant FY15.
	Accepting the Quotation from All Chemical Leasing, Inc. for a Pre-Owned Water Tanker Trailer, in an amount not to exceed $20,620.00.
	Authorizing the transfer of PP2016-126 from HMM Architects, PC to Mott MacDonald Architects, PC for the contract duration under the same terms and conditions.
	Authorizing a one (1) year extension of Contract B2016-40 with Keith & Jacqueline Conroy, Inc. d/b/a West Jersey Air Conditioning & Heating€ Co. for Heating, Ventilating & Air Conditioning Maintenance, Service and Alteration.
	Amending a Resolution adopted on 10/19/2016 due to typographical errors.
	Rescinding a Resolution adopted on 11/16/2016 for the transfer of ownership of a Vehicle no longer needed for County use to the Township of Berkeley.
	Authorizing the execution of a Collective Bargaining Agreement with the NJ State Policeman's Benevolent Association Local #258A representing Correction's Superior Officers for the period 4/1/2016 through 6/30/2019.
	Approving the Release of Bonds for Road Opening Permits.

	MOTIONS
	Authorizing the Clerk of the Board to record and/or accept Legal Instruments.
	Approving the Distribution of Requests for Proposals and/or Request for Qualifications for: 1) Professional Engineering Services - Solid Waste Management, Recycling and Underground Storage Tanks€ 2) Special Labor Counsel€ 3) Title Binder and Commitment/Insurance and Search Services for various projects in Ocean County, where and as directed by various Departments of Ocean County€ 4) On-Call Traffic Engineering Professional Services, where and as directed by the County Engineer€ 5) Land Surveying Services for various projects in Ocean County, where and as directed by various Departments of Ocean County
	Approving the OC Master Payroll paid on 12/14/2016 for the payroll period of 11/17/2016 through 11/30/2016 and for the payroll period of 12/1/2016 through 12/14/2016, in the amount of $5,149,938.74
	Approving the Minutes of the Pre-Board Meeting of 10/26/2016.
	Authorizing the acquisition of Right-of-Way and/or Easement(s) by gift, purchase, exchange or condemnation for the Traffic Signal and Intersection Safety Upgrades along County Road 54, Fischer Boulevard at Cattus Island Boulevard (Overlay 2016B), and is in conjunction with project Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 2016B, Toms River Township (one parcel).
	Authorizing the acquisition of Right-of-Way and/or Easement(s) by gift, purchase, exchange or condemnation for the Traffic Signal and Intersection Safety Upgrades along County Road 54, Fischer Boulevard at Overlook Drive (Overlay 2016B), and is in conjunction with project Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 2016B, Toms River Township (one parcel).
	Authorizing the acquisition of Right-of-Way and/or Easement(s) by gift, purchase, exchange or condemnation for the Traffic Signal and Intersection Safety Upgrades along County Road 14, Church Road at Road 16, Old Freehold Road (Overlay 2016B), and in conjunction with project Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Portions of Certain County Roads, Contract 2016B, Toms River Township (two parcels).
	Authorizing the acquisition of Right-of-Way and/or Easement(s) by gift, purchase, exchange or condemnation at the intersection of County Road 32, James Street and Grantwood Drive (formerly Grantwood Avenue) for the purpose of an intersection reconstruction upgrade, Lakewood Township (one parcel).

	TRAFFIC SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS
	Consenting to Jackson Township's Ordinance #20-16 for Prohibiting Left Turns at CR #3 (Hope Chapel Road) and the exit driveway of Wawa Shopping Plaza.

	BID AWARDS
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: NEW EXCAVATOR to Jesco, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder.
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: NEW RACK PICKUP TRUCK WITH LIFTGATE to Maplecrest Lincoln-Mercury, Inc. dba Maplecrest Ford Lincoln, the lowest qualified bidder.
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of GENERATOR IMPROVEMENTS AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS, TOMS RIVER to Gary Kubiak & Son Electric, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder.
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of RIPRAP to Trap Rock Industries, LLC, the lowest qualified bidder.
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of INTEGRATED PEST MANAGEMENT to Meticulous Landscaping, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder.
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: NEW REFUSE COLLECTION TRUCK to Robert H. Hoover & Sons, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder.
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of SUPER HEAVY DUTY 96" FLAIL to Cherry Valley Tractor Sales, the lowest qualified bidder.
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS EQUIPMENT FOR THE TRAFFIC DIVISION OF THE ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT to Good Friend Electric; General Traffic Equipment Corp.; Traffic Parts. Inc.; Flemington Aluminum & Brass, Inc.; Signal Control Products, Inc.; and Intelligent Traffic€ Supply Products, LLC, the lowest qualified bidders.€ No bids were received for items 115, 151, 155, 156, 177, 187, 221, 222, 228, 230, 271, 305, 306, 307, 309, 327, 333, 340, 345, 350, 359, 360, 361, 363, 364 and 368.€ Recommendation is made to reject item 229.€ All no bid and rejected bid items will be rebid.
	Awarding Contract for the furnishing and delivery of EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR THE SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT DEPARTMENT to Gerhart Scale Corp.; Deacon Equipment Company, Inc.€and Advance Scale, the lowest qualified bidders.€ No bids were received for one hundred and forty (140) items.€ The no bid items will be rebid, except for items 18a, 18b, 18c, and 18d, which are no longer needed.
	Awarding a Contract for the MANHOLE COVERS AND CONCRETE SLABS REPLACEMENT AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS, TOMS RIVER, NJ to Seacoast Construction, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder, in an amount not to exceed $49,250.00.
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of TOURISM FULFILLMENT SERVICES FOR THE TOURISM COUNCIL to Rick L. Marschall, the lowest qualified bidder.
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: NEW MEDIUM DUTY DUMP TRUCK WITH PLOW AND SPREADER to Route 23 Automall, LLC, the lowest qualified bidder.
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of AGRICULTURAL SUPPLIES to Reed & Perrine Sales, Inc.; Andre & Son, Inc.; Seeton Turf Warehouse, LLC; Fisher & Son Co., Inc.; Crop Production Services; Plant Food Company, Inc.; Siteone Landscape Supply and Levitt's, LLC, the lowest qualified bidders.€ No bids were received for items 1, 5, 18, 30, 53, 71, 78, 81, 82, 83, 89, 95 and 97.€ Recommendation is made to reject item 11.€ All no bid and rejected bid items will be rebid.
	Rescinding Section II (Items No. 19-33) and Section IV (Items No. 51-54) awarded to Seaboard Fire and Safety as vendor can no longer honor their contract for FIRE EXTINGUISHERS, FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS, FIRE SUPPRESSION & SPRINKLER SYSTEMS MAINTENANCE, SERVICE & REPAIR.€ Recommendation is made to enter into an Amendatory Contract with Allied Fire & Safety Equipment Company, Inc. for Section II (Items No. 19-33) and a Contract with Absolute Protective Systems, Inc. for Section IV (Items No. 51-54), the next lowest qualified bidders.
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: NEW CARS, TRUCKS, SUV'S AND VANS NO. III to Maplecrest Lincoln-Mercury, Inc. DBA Maplecrest Ford Lincoln, the lowest qualified bidder.

	CHANGE ORDERS
	Authorizing Change Order #7 to Eagle Construction Services, Inc.for the Ocean County Justice Complex Additions and Alterations, a decrease in the amount of $4,192.00.

	CONTRACTS
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Edison Imaging Associates, P.A. t/a Advanced Medical Imaging of Toms River for a Certified Radiology Facility to provide Radiology Services for the OC Workers' Compensation Program.
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Monmouth Medical Center Southern Campus to provide Mental Health Services to Ocean County Residents, in an amount not to exceed $367,845.00.
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Ocean Mental Health Services to provide Mental Health Services to Ocean County Residents, in an amount not to exceed $754,451.00.
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Preferred Behavioral Health of NJ to provide Mental Health Services to Ocean County Residents, in an amount not to exceed $504,370.00.
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Frank B. Holman, III to audit the accounts and records for the OC Insurance Program and to perform auditing services for the OC Department of Senior Services.
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to NMS Labs to provide the OC Medical Examiner's Office with Postmortem Toxicology Laboratory Services.
	Awarding Professional Service Contracts to Kedz Funeral Home, Wood Funeral Home Colonial Funeral Home, Oliverie Funeral Home and Tilghman Funeral Home to provide the OC Medical Examiner's Office with Licensed Funeral Home Directors for the purpose of transporting human remains.
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to DT Service, LLC to provide Drug and Alcohol Testing Services to assist the County in complying with the Omnibus Transportation Testing Act of 1991, in an amount not to exceed $18,000.00.
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to RWJ Barnabas Health Corporate Care to provide the County of Ocean with Professional Medical Services, in an amount not to exceed $35,000.00.
	Awarding a Professional Services Contract to Shore Forensic Psychology, LLC to provide Pre-Employment Psychological Evaluations for the County of Ocean.
	Awarding an Extraordinary, Unspecifiable Services Contract to National Vision Administrators, L.L.C. to provide the County of Ocean with a Vision Service Plan, in an amount not to exceed $100,000.00.
	Awarding an Extraordinary, Unspecifiable Services Contract to Conner Strong & Buckelew Companies, Inc. for Insurance Brokerage, Consultant and Risk Management Services for the County of Ocean.
	Awarding an Extraordinary, Unspecifiable Services Contract to Dawn Kennedy-Little, D.O. for€Medical Advisory/Consultant Services for the OC Prosecutor's Office SANE Program, in an amount not to exceed $5,100.00.
	Awarding an Extraordinary, Unspecifiable Services Contract to Vetgroup, Inc. to provide Counseling and other related services to the Veterans of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed $190,350.00.
	Awarding a Contract to Qual-Lynx to provide Claims Administration and related services to assist the County in the administration of its General Liability, Auto Liability, Police Professional, Public Official and Worker Compensation Insurance Programs.
	Awarding a Contract to The Actuarial Advantage, Inc. for a Consultant for the provision of Actuarial Services for the Self-Insured Portion of the OC Insurance Program.
	Awarding a Contract to Insurance Buyers' Council, Inc. for a Consultant to provide Risk Management and Insurance Advisory Services for the County's Risk Assumption and Insurance Program.
	Awarding a Contract to Preferred Behavioral Health of NJ, Inc. to provide the County of Ocean with an Employee Assistance Program, in an amount not to exceed $36,075.00.
	Authorizing a€one (1) year contract extension to Election Graphics, Inc. to provide the County of Ocean with Election Ballot Design, Printing and other related services.
	Awarding a Competitive Contract to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to provide Home Delivered Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed $152,593.00.
	Awarding a Competitive Contract to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to provide Home Delivered Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed $1,501,443.00.
	Awarding a Competitive Contract to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to provide Home Delivered Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed $41,308.00.
	Awarding a Competitive Contract to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to provide Social Support Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed $40,895.00.
	Awarding a Competitive Contract to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to provide Congregate Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed $782,173.00.
	Awarding a Competitive Contract to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to provide Weekend/Holiday Home Delivered Meal Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed $124,173.00.
	Awarding a Competitive Contract to Community Services, Inc. of Ocean County to provide Social Support Services to the elderly of Ocean County, in an amount not to exceed $478,749.00.
	Awarding Professional Service Contracts€for Small Road and Bridge Design Services, Various Locations€throughout Ocean County, where and€as directed by the County Engineer, to the following:€ Bridges: Cherry, Weber & Associates, P.C.; AmerCom Corporation; Johnson, Mirmiran & Thompson, Inc.; NV5, Inc.; Dewberry Engineers, Inc.; Mott MacDonald, LLC; IH Engineers, Inc.; Maser Consulting, PA; Churchill Consulting Engineers, LLC; French & Parrello Associates, PA; CME Associates and Buchart Horn, Inc. Roads:€Owen, Little and Associates, Inc.; T&M Associates; Michael Baker International, Inc.; Stantec Consulting Services, Inc.; HAKS Engineers, Architects and Land Surveyors, PC; Remington, Vernick & Vena Engineers; Greenman-Pedersen, Inc.; DW Smith Associates, Inc.; KMA Consulting Engineers; Environment Resolutions, Inc.; Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc. and The Alaimo Group, Inc.

	APPOINTMENTS AND REAPPOINTMENTS
	Appointing Mark Villinger, OC Planning Board and reappointing Jeff Adams, Jackson; Alan Perry, Bayville; Mark C. Vodak, Plumsted; Christine R. Raabe, Soil Conservation District and Dr. Steven Yergeau, Rutger's Cooperative Extension to the OC AGRICULTURE DEVELOPMENT BOARD for a term of four (4) years, term to expire 12/31/2020.
	Appointing Channell Wilkins, O.C.E.A.N., Inc. and Reappointing Anthony M. Agliata, OC Planning Department; Linda Murtagh, OC Board of Social Services; Marshall J. Kern, Representative, Banking/Financial; Tracy Maksel, OC Department of Human Services; Faith Liguori, Ocean Housing Alliance, Inc.; Carol Wolfe, Homes Now, Inc.; Representative, Governing Body of Brick Township; Representative, Governing Body of Jackson Township; Representative, Governing Body of Lakewood Township; Representative, Governing Body of Toms River Township; Representative, Berkeley Housing Authority; Representative, Brick Housing Authority; and Representative, Lakewood Housing Authority to the COUNTY HOUSING ADVISORY COMMITTEE (CHAC) for a term of one (1) year, term to expire 12/31/2017.
	Appointing Steven J. Simone, Toms River to the OC TRANSPORTATION ADVISORY COMMITTEE FOR SENIOR CITIZENS AND PERSONS WITH DISABILITIES for an initial term to expire 10/23/2019.
	Reappointing Julie N. Tarrant to the position of Chief Financial Officer for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 12/31/2019.
	Reappointing Michael J. Fiure to the position of Director of Management and Budget for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 12/31/2019.
	Reappointing Sheriff Michael G. Mastronardy to the position of County Coordinator of Emergency Management, Department of Emergency Services for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 1/5/2020.
	Reappointing Anthony M. Agliata, OC Department of Planning and Keith J. Goetting, Director of OC Employee Relations to the COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT COMMITTEE€ for a term of one (1) year, term to expire 12/31/2017.
	Reappointing Henry J. Mancini, Stafford Township and Ruthanne Scaturro, Brick to the OC LIBRARY COMMISSION for a term of five (5) years, term to expire 12/31/2021.
	Reappointing Hilda Diaz, Toms River; Robert Martino, Berkeley Township; and Linwood McWilliams, Toms River to the OC OFFICE OF SENIOR SERVICES ADVISORY COUNCIL for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 12/31/2019.
	Reappointing Charlene Costaris, Barnegat as a member for a term of five (5) years, term to expire 1/1/2022; and John Reiser, Stafford Township as Alternate Member No. 1 for a term of two (2) years, term to expire 1/1/2019; both to the OC SHADE TREE ADVISORY€COMMISSION.
	Reappointing Jill Perez, Toms River to the OC BOARD OF SOCIAL SERVICES for a term of five (5) years, term to expire 12/31/2021.
	Reappointing Patrick Donnelly, Lakewood; David Most, Forked River; Suzanne M. Plesnarski, Manchester; and Angela Kacsur, Toms River to the OC SOLID WASTE ADVISORY COUNCIL for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 12/31/2019.
	Reappointing Susan Sedivec, Toms River; Barbara Lehman, Harvey Cedars; Dr. Theresa J. Kubiel, Toms River; Dana Ann O'Connor, Ship Bottom; Bonnie R. Peterson, Esq., Seaside Park; and April Yezzi, Toms River to the OC ADVISORY COMMISSION ON THE STATUS OF WOMEN for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 12/31/2019.

	RECEIVED ITEMS
	RESOLUTIONS FROM GOVERNING BODIES
	Plumsted Township supporting A-1707 prohibiting Municipal Ordinances to create Sanctuary City.
	OC Library Commission authorizing a Lease Agreement with Paramount Commons at Whiting, LLC, the County of Ocean and the Township of Manchester for operations of a Branch Library.
	OC Library Commission establishing the 2017 Meeting Schedule.
	Hudson County authorizing the NJ Association of Counties, on behalf of the County Executive and Board of Chosen Freeholders of Hudson County, to file a complaint with the NJ Council on Local Mandates.
	Mercer County recognizing November 2016 as "Pancreatic Cancer Awareness Month".
	Ocean Township proclaiming December 2016 as "3D National Drunk and Drugged Driving Prevention Month".
	Ocean Township recognizing November 2016 as "National Family Caregiver Month".
	Ocean Township proclaiming December 1, 2016 as "World AIDS Day".

	MINUTES AND MEETING NOTICES
	OC Planning Board Meeting Minutes of 11/16/2016.
	OC Library Commission Meeting Minutes of 11/15/2016 and 2017 Meeting Dates.
	OC Insurance Committee Meeting Minutes of 11/17/2016.
	OC Workforce Development Board Meeting Minutes of 9/13/2016.
	OC Transportation Advisory Committee for Senior Citizens and Persons with Disabilities Meeting Minutes of 11/30/2016.

	REPORTS
	OC Treasurer's Report for the period ending October 2016.
	Ocean County 2016 Abstract of Ratables.

	APPROVALS
	Division of Local Government Services approval of four (4) Items of Revenue.

	CORRESPONDENCE
	Surf City Borough Mayor's Winter Newsletter to residents.

	FREEHOLDER COMMENTS
	PUBLIC COMMENTS - Comments from members of the audience are invited at this time with a limit of five (5) minutes per speaker.
	ADJOURNMENT


