
Board Meeting Agenda

Date: April 17, 2024 - 4:00 PM

Location: Administration Building
Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

A. CALL TO ORDER

B. STATEMENT Compliance with the Open Public Meetings Act

C. ROLL CALL

D. THE PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE AND PRAYER

E. PROCLAMATIONS

1. Proclaiming the week of April 21-27, 2024 as "Crime Victims' Rights Week" in 
Ocean County.

F. ORDINANCE - INTRODUCTION

1. ORDINANCE #2024-5 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $5,000,000.00 from 
the Capital Improvement Fund for Various Engineering, Road, and Bridge 
Improvements, at Various Locations, all in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey.

2. ORDINANCE #2024-6 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $2,500,000.00 from 
the Capital Improvement Fund for the Construction of Stormwater Management 
Facilities at Various Locations, all in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey.

3. ORDINANCE #2024-7 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $2,500,000.00 from 
the Capital Improvement Fund for the Installation of New and Upgraded Traffic 
Control Devices at Various Locations, all in the County of Ocean, State of New 
Jersey.

Ocean County Board of Commissioners
OFFICE OF THE

OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Barbara Jo Crea

Deputy Director Gary Quinn

Commissioner Virginia E. Haines

Commissioner John P. Kelly

Commissioner Frank Sadeghi

101 Hooper Avenue

Toms River, New Jersey

08754-2191

(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

Page 1 of 10



4. ORDINANCE #2024-8 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $1,500,000.00 from 
the Capital Improvement Fund for the Rehabilitation and Repair of Various Bridges 
at Various Locations, all in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey.

5. ORDINANCE #2024-9 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $1,000,000.00 from 
the Capital Improvement Fund for the Upgrading of County Underground Storage 
Tanks to achieve compliance with State and Federal Underground Storage Tank 
Regulations including planning, upgrading, removal, replacement or remediation as 
necessary, all in the County of Ocean, State of New Jersey.

6. ORDINANCE #2024-10 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $1,000,000.00 
from the Capital Improvement Fund for the Construction of a Traffic Signal at Ocean 
Gate Drive and Mill Creek Road/Veeder Lane, in the Township of Berkeley, in the 
County of Ocean, State of New Jersey.

7. ORDINANCE #2024-11 - An Ordinance authorizing the Reconstruction and 
Resurfacing of Various County Roads all located in the County of Ocean, State of 
New Jersey, and appropriating $12,837,790.00 therefor and authorizing the issuance 
of $12,837,790.00 in Bonds or Bond Anticipation Notes of the County of Ocean to 
finance the same.

8. ORDINANCE #2024-12 - An Ordinance appropriating the sum of $3,000,000.00 
from the Capital Improvement Fund for the cost of the expansion of the Jackson 
Center, including furnishings, equipment, and other apparatus, Phase II, of the Ocean 
County Vocational Technical School, in the Township of Jackson, County of Ocean, 
State of New Jersey.

G. AUTHORIZING THE PAYMENT OF BILLS IN BILL COMMITTEE REPORT NO. 8.

H. RESOLUTIONS

1. Authorizing the Personnel Resolution.

2. Authorizing the cancellation of capital account balances that are no longer needed.

3. Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled AKC Reunite 
Adopt a K-9 Cop FY24, in the amount of $7,500.00, with matching funds in the 
amount of $2,500.00.

4. Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled National 
Crime Victims' Rights Week Community Awareness Project FY24, in the amount of 
$4,992.00.

5. Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled HUD: CDBG 
Program Income FY24, in the amount of $15,449.00.

6. Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled Law 
Enforcement Officers Training & Equipment, in the amount of $28,319.00.

7. Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled United States 
Marshals Service FY23/24, in the amount of $30,000.00.

8. Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled HUD: 
HOME Program Income FY24, in the amount of $43,737.00.

Page 2 of 10



9. Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled Schedule "C" 
Planning, Account No. 016-155-4636, in the amount of $70,000.00.

10. Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled Next 
Generation 9-1-1 Grant FY24, in the amount of $233,682.00.

11. Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled Insurance 
Fraud Program FY24, in the amount of $300,000.00.

12. Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled National 
Sexual Assault Kit Initiative FY23, in the amount of $500,000.00.

13. Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled Barnegat 
Branch Trail IX FY24, in the amount of $929,000.00.

14. Authorizing the execution of a Grant Application to the State of New Jersey, 
Department of Law and Public Safety, Office of the Attorney General for the STOP 
Violence Against Women Act (VAWA) Program, for the period of 7/1/2024 through 
6/30/2025.

15. Authorizing the OC Prosecutor to submit an electronic Grant Application to the 
United States Department of Justice, Office of Justice Programs, Bureau of Justice 
Assistance for the BJA FY24 Prosecuting Cold Cases Using DNA Initiative.

16. Authorizing the OC Prosecutor to submit an on-line Grant Application to the United 
States Department of Justice, Office of Community Oriented Policing Services for the 
FY24 Law Enforcement Mental Health and Wellness Act (LEMHWA) 
Implementation Projects.

17. Authorizing the OC Prosecutor to submit an on-line Grant Application to the United 
States Department of Justice, Office on Violence Against Women (OVW) for the 
OVW FY24 Local Law Enforcement Grants for Enforcement of Cybercrimes 
Program.

18. Authorizing the OC Prosecutor to submit an on-line Grant Application to the United 
States Department of Veterans Affairs for the FY24 Staff Sergeant Fox Suicide 
Prevention Program.

19. Authorizing the execution of a Memorandum of Agreement with a Forensic Nurse 
Examiner for the OC Prosecutor's Office Sexual Assault Response Team, the 
Domestic Violence Strangulation Response Team and the Forensic Nurse Examiner 
Program (S.A.R.T/D.V.S.R.T./F.N.E.), for the period of 5/15/2024 through 
9/30/2024.

20. Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Agreement under the CDBG Housing 
Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the OC Planning Director. (C2024-63)

21. Authorizing the execution of thirty-one (31) Shared Services Agreements with 
various municipalities through the Prosecutor's F.A.S.T. Program, for the period of 
1/1/2024 through 12/31/2024.

22. Authorizing the use of FY2021 and FY2022 HOME funds for the FY2024 OC First-
Time Homebuyer Activities. (CC2024-62)

23. Authorizing the use of competitive contracting procedures for Traumatic Loss 
Coalition Coordinator Services for the OC Department of Human Services.
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24. Authorizing the use of competitive contracting procedures for Acquisition for 
Innovations to Address Homelessness for the OC Department of Human Services.

25. Authorizing the use of competitive contracting procedures for Young Adult Bridge 
Housing for the OC Department of Human Services.

26. Authorizing a Mortgage and Mortgage Note Modification Agreement and a Deferred 
Loan Agreement Modification under CDBG Housing Rehabilitation Program, as 
recommended by the OC Planning Director. (C2024-40)

27. Authorizing a Mortgage and Mortgage Note Modification Agreement and a Deferred 
Loan Agreement Modification under CDBG Housing Rehabilitation Program, as 
recommended by the OC Planning Director. (C2024-45)

28. Authorizing an amendment to the OC First Time Homebuyer Program, to include 
new participants, as recommended by the OC Planning Director. (CC2022-85)

29. Authorizing an Amendment to the OC Water Quality Management Program 
(WQMP) to include Block 42, portion of Lot 4, Colts Neck Township.

30. Authorizing the Release of Bonds for Road Opening Permits.

I. MOTIONS

1. Authorizing the Clerk of the Board to accept and/or record legal instruments.

2. Approving the Board Meeting Minutes of 3/20/2024.

3. Approving the Pre-Board Meeting Minutes of 3/27/2024.

4. Approving the Master Payroll paid on 4/10/2024 for the payroll period of 3/14/2024 
through 3/27/2024, with Elected Officials paid to date, in the amount of 
$6,177,432.79.

5. Approving the distribution of Requests for Qualifications and/or Requests for 
Proposals, as follows: 1) New Jersey Government Law Books and Legal Products; 
and 2) Leasing of Vehicles for Use by the Ocean County Prosecutor's Office.

J. TRAFFIC SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS

1. Authorizing the establishment of Temporary Construction Speed Limits for all 
directions of traffic along County Road #24 (Route 527-Cedar Swamp Road) and 
County Road #9 (Route 526 - East and West Commodore Boulevard) at the 
intersection, Township of Jackson.

2. Authorizing the removal of all Weight Limit Restrictions on Bridge #1516009, 
known as Otis Bog Bridge (Otis Bog Road over Giffords Mill Branch of Tuckerton 
Creek), Township of Little Egg Harbor.

3. Authorizing the removal of all Weight Limit Restrictions on Bridge #1506013, 
known as Duck Farm Bridge (Hooper Avenue over Cedar Bridge Branch of the 
Metedeconk River), Township of Brick.
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4. Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #9 
(Route 526-East County Line Road-Lanes Mills Road) and County Road #24 (Route 
623-Ridge Avenue), Township of Lakewood. (LKWD-7)

5. Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #11 
(Route 549-Hooper Avenue) and County Road #94 (Oak Avenue), Township of 
Toms River. (DVR-17)

6. Authorizing an Agreement with the Township of Lakewood for the installation and 
operation of a traffic signal at the intersection of County Road #5 (Route 528 - 
Lakewood-New Egypt Road) and Gudz Road and Old Whitesville Road, Township 
of Lakewood. (LKWD-79)

7. Authorizing an Amended Agreement with the Township of Jackson for the 
installation of a battery backup system for the traffic signal at the intersection of 
County Road #9 (County Line Road) and County Road #10 (Bennetts Mills 
Road)/Shopping Plaza Drive, Township of Jackson. (JK-6)

8. Authorizing an Amended Agreement with the Township of Jackson for the 
installation of a battery backup system for the traffic signal at the intersection of 
County Road #9 (County Line Road) and County Road #12 (New Prospect Road), 
Township of Jackson. (JK-7)

9. Authorizing an Amended Agreement with the Township of Jackson for the 
installation of a battery backup system for the traffic signal at the intersection of 
County Road #9 (County Line Road) and Brewers Bridge Road, Township of 
Jackson. (JK-9)

10. Authorizing an Amended Agreement with the Township of Jackson for the 
installation of a battery backup system for the traffic signal at the intersection of 
County Road #9 (County Line Road) and Villanova Boulevard, Township of Jackson. 
(JK-10)

11. Authorizing an Amended Agreement with the Township of Jackson for the 
installation of a battery backup system for the traffic signal at the intersection of 
County Road #12 (New Prospect Road) and County Road #10 (Aldrich 
Road)/County Road #10 (Bennetts Mills Road), Township of Jackson. (JK-11)

12. Authorizing an Amended Agreement with the Township of Jackson for the 
installation of a battery backup system for the traffic signal at the intersection of 
County Road #12 (New Prospect Road) and Woodlane Road, Township of Jackson. 
(JK-12)

K. BID AWARDS

1. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of SUPPLEMENTARY 
VEHICLE TOWING AND ROADSIDE SERVICES to Priced Rite Auto Repair & 
Towing, Inc. and Thomas Makuch LLC, dba Accurate Towing Service, the lowest 
qualified bidders. (B2024-50)
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2. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of K9 DOG FOOD AND 
SUPPLIES to Plastic Express, Inc. and The Hungry Puppy, the lowest qualified 
bidders. No bids were received on Item Nos. 43, 44, 45, 46, 47, 48, 49, 50, 51, 52, 53, 
54, 57, 58, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74, 75, 76, 77, 78, 79, 
80, 81, 82, 83, 84, 85, 86, 90, 91, 92, 93, 94, 95, 96, 97, 98, 99, 100, 101, 102, 103, 
106, 107, 108, 109, 110, 111, 112, 113, 114, 115, 116, 117, 118, 122, 123, 125, 127, 
128, 129, 131, 132 and 133. All no bid items will be rebid. Item Nos. 141 will be 
rebid to obtain additional vendors. (B2024-54)

3. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MISCELLANEOUS 
GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS, AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES NO. II to Mivila 
Foods, the sole qualified bidder. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 23, 35, 
48, 51, 75, 76, 79, 80, 87, 219, 246, 252, 280 and 283. Recommendation is made to 
authorize the County Purchasing Agent to enter into a negotiated contract, in 
accordance with N.J.S.A. 40A:11-5(3) as no responsive bids were received for a 
second time on all rejected items. (B2024-60)

4. Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of SURVEILLANCE 
EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES to Crime Point Inc, the sole qualified bidder. (B2024
-72)

5. Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of REPAIR SERVICES FOR 
VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER TO 
A.T. Northern New Jersey, LLC; Bellmawr Truck Repair Co., Inc.; Campbell 
Freightliner, LLC; Cherry Valley Tractor; Foley, Incorporated; Groff Tractor Mid 
Atlantic, LLC DBA GT Mid Atlantic; H.A. Dehart & Son, Inc.; Johnson & Towers, 
LLC; On-Site Fleet Service, Inc.; and Thomas Makuch, LLC DBA Accurate Towing 
Service, the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were received on Item Nos. 3, 4, 8, 11, 
12, 17, 18, 19, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 29, 31, 34, 38, 41, 44, 45, 49, 50, 52, 53, 60, 66, 67, 
68, 72, 73, 74, 76, 77, 78 and 80. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 1, 5, 
15, 16, 28, 30, 33, 37, 47, 51 and 79. All no bid and rejected items will be rebid. Item 
Nos. 2, 6, 7, 9, 10, 20, 26, 27, 32, 35, 36, 39, 40, 42, 43, 46, 54, 58, 62, 63, 64, 65, 75, 
81, 82, 83, 85, 86, 87 and 88 will be rebid to obtain additional vendors. (B2024-48)

6. Rejecting the sole bid for the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS EQUIPMENT 
FOR THE ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT-TRAFFIC DIVISION NO. II as 
unresponsive. Recommendation is made to authorize the County Purchasing Agent to 
enter into negotiated contracts in accordance with N.J.S.A. 40A:11-5(3) for all no bid 
and rejected Item Nos. 33, 34, 35, 99, 100, 101, 102, 103, 104 105, 106, 107, 108, 
109, 110, 111, 112, 113, 114, 115, 116, 117, 118, 120, 121, 122, 123, 124, 125, 126, 
127, 128, 129, 130, 131, 132, 133, 134, 135, 136, 137, 138, 139, 140, 141, 142, 143, 
144, 145, 146, 147, 148, 149, 150, 151, 152, 153, 154, 155, 156, 157, 158, 159, 160, 
161, 162, 163, 164, 165, 166, 167, 168, 169, 170, 171, 172, 173, 174, 175, 176, 177, 
178, 181, 182, 184, 185, 211, 212, 213, 214, 215, 216, 217, 218, 219, 220, 221, 222, 
223, 224, 225, 226, 227, 228, 229, 233 ,236, 239, 245, 255, 256, 276, 280, 286, 287, 
290, 301, 311, 312, 313, 314, 315, 316, 317, 318, 319, 320, 321, 322, 323, 324, 325, 
326, 327, 363, 390, 393, 414, 415, 429, 430, 431, 432, 433, 434, 435, 436, 437, 438, 
439, 440, 441, 442, 443, 444, 445, 446, 447, 448, 449, 450, 451, 452, 453, 454, 455, 
456, 457, 458, 459, 460, 461, 462, 463, 464, 465, 466, 467, 468, 469, 470, 471, 472, 
473, 474, 475, 476, 477, 478, 479, 480, 481, 482, 483, 484, 485, 486, 487, 488, 489, 
490, 491, 492, 493, 494, 495, 496, 497, 498, 499, 500, 501, 502, 503, 504, 505, 506, 
507, 508, 509, 510, 511, 512, 513, 514, 515, 516, 517, 518, 519, 520, 521, 522, 523, 
524, 525, 526, 527, 528, 529, 530, 531, 532, 533, 534, 535, 536, 537, 538, 539, 551, 
as no responsive bids were received for a second time.

7. Awarding a Contract for the REPLACEMENT OF HURRICANE BRIDGE, 
STRUCTURE NO. 1518-012, WHITING-NEW EGYPT ROAD (C.R. 539) OVER 
OLD HURRICANE BROOK, MANCHESTER TOWNSHIP, to Marbro, Inc., the 
lowest qualified bidder, in an amount not to exceed $1,447,117.00. (B2024-69E)
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8. Awarding a Contract for the RECONSTRUCTION AND RESURFACING OF 
LACEY ROAD (C.R. 614) FROM THE GARDEN STATE PARKWAY TO 
ROUTE 9, TOWNSHIP OF LACEY, NO. II, to Earle Asphalt Company, the lowest 
qualified bidder, in an amount not to exceed $2,050,013.13. (B2024-73E)

L. CHANGE ORDERS

1. Awarding Change Order No. 1 to Wu & Associates, Inc. for the project entitled 
Outbuildings Rehabilitation & Exterior Repairs at the Mary Etta Cox House, 
Barnegat Township, NJ, an increase to the contract in the amount of $31,766.86. 
(B2023-129CE)

2. Awarding Change Order No. 16 to Epic Management, Inc. for the project entitled 
DEVELOPMENT & CONSTRUCTION OF THE SOCIAL SERVICES COMPLEX, 
an increase to the contract in the amount of $389,199.71. (B2021-33CE)

3. P & A CONSTRUCTION, INC. - Reconstruction of Cross Street, Route 626, from 
Augusta Boulevard to State Highway Route 9, Township of Lakewood - Change 
Order #3, E-$532,095.47, R-$28,245.00. (B2023-100E)

4. EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Construction of Traffic Signal at James Street 
(C.R. 32) and Williams Street, Township of Lakewood - Change Order #1, E-
$173,381.90, R-$48,245.79. (B2021-55E)

5. EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Replacement of Clubhouse Culvert, Structure No. 
1518-025, Morningside Street over Union Branch of Toms River, Manchester 
Township - Change Order #1, E-$29,789.70, R-$23,709.22. (B2023-85E)

M. CONTRACTS

1. Awarding a Competitive Contract to O.C.E.A.N., Inc. for Administration of the First-
Time Homebuyer Activities FY2024, in the amount not to exceed $96,000.00, for the 
period of two (2) years. (CC2024-62)

2. Awarding an Agreement to Facility Strategies, LLC to provide Move Management 
Consulting Services for the period of one (1) year or until services are complete, in an 
amount not to exceed $191,450.00 (PP2024-65).

3. Awarding a Contract to Miller Auto Leasing Company to provide Voting Machine 
Transportation Services, for the period of 5/1/2024 through 4/30/2026, in an amount 
not to exceed $90,000.00. (CP2024-64)

4. Awarding a Purchase Order to Owen, Little and Associates, Inc. to provide Land 
Surveying Services associated with the acquisition of Block 65, Lot 6 and 6Q, Little 
Egg Harbor Township, in an amount not to exceed $10,726.83. (QP2023-49)

5. Awarding a Purchase Order to Diversified Storage Solutions for warehouse storage of 
high-density filing systems for the Social Services Complex, for the period of 4/2024 
through 10/2024, in an amount not to exceed $42,000.00.

6. Awarding a Purchase Order to SHI International Corp. (NJ Cooperative Purchasing 
Alliance CK04, Sub Contract No. 22-24) to provide the Regroup Mass Notification 
Network for the OC Sheriff's Office, in an amount not to exceed $60,174.74.
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7. Amending the award of an Extraordinary, Unspecifiable Services Contract with V-
Comm, LLC to provide additional expert witness consultation and reporting for the 
Prosecutor's Office, an increase to the contract in the amount of $1,710.00. (P2023-
43)

8. Qualifying four (4) firms as eligible to provide Consultant Material Sampling, 
Inspection and Testing Services for Various Projects in Ocean County, on a project 
specific proposal basis, for the period of 4/22/2024 through 4/21/2025, as follows: 
French & Parrello Associates, P.A.; ATANE Engineers, Architects and Land 
Surveyors, P.C.; Colliers Engineering & Design, Inc.; and Keegan Technology & 
Testing Assoc., Inc. t/a Key-Tech. (QP2024-66)

9. Awarding a Purchase Order to Dewberry Engineers, Inc. to provide On-Call Traffic 
Engineering Professional Services for the Reconstruction of Double Trouble Road 
(Route 619) and Garden State Parkway Interchange 77, Berkeley Township, in an 
amount not to exceed $170,537.40. (QP2024-50)

10. Awarding a Purchase Order to Colliers Engineering & Design, Inc. to provide 
Consultant Material Sampling, Inspection and Testing Services for the Replacement 
of Dover Road Bridges (Structure No. 1512-006 and 1512-007), Dover Road (C.R. 
618) over Tributary to Middle Branch of Cedar Creek, Lacey Township, in an 
amount not to exceed $30,610.00. (QP2023-68)

11. Awarding a Purchase Order to Keegan Technology & Testing Associates, Inc. dba 
Key-Tech to provide Consultant Material Sampling, Inspection and Testing Services 
for the Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Dock Road (C.R. 602) from State Route 9 
to Barnegat Bay, Eagleswood Township, in an amount not to exceed $7,510.00. 
(QP2023-68)

N. APPOINTMENTS AND REAPPOINTMENTS

1. Appointing DiAnne C. Gove as a member of the OC College Board of Trustees, to 
fill the unexpired term of Carl Verner Thulin, Jr., term to expire 12/19/2024.

2. Reappointing Alan W. Avery, Jr., Toms River as a member of the New Jersey 
Pinelands Commission, for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 6/28/2027.

3. Reappointing Harry L. Larkin, Jr., M.D. to the position of Assistant OC Medical 
Examiner for a term of one (1) year, commencing 5/1/2024 through 4/30/2025.

O. RECEIVED ITEMS

P. RESOLUTIONS FROM GOVERNING BODIES

1. County of Monmouth, Resolution No. 2024-0262 authorizing the Director of the 
Monmouth County Board of County Commissioners to execute a New Jersey 
Department of Community Affairs Application for a Local Efficiency Achievement 
Program (LEAP) Grant.

2. OC Library Commission, Resolution dated 2/20/2024 approving the 2024-2028 
Strategic Plan for the OC Library System.

3. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 121(24) proclaiming May 5-11, 2024 as 
National Hurricane Preparedness Week.
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4. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 122(24) proclaiming May 6-12, 2024 as 
National Nurses Week.

5. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 123(24) proclaiming May 8, 2024 as National 
School Nurse Day.

6. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 124(24) proclaiming May 2024 as National 
Stroke Awareness Month.

7. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 125(24) proclaiming May 2024 as National 
Melanoma/Skin Cancer Detection and Prevention Month.

8. OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 126(24) proclaiming May 2024 as National 
High Blood Pressure Education Month.

9. County of Monmouth, Resolution No. 2024-0308 establishing the logo and "catch 
phrase" for the "America 250-MonmouthNJ Committee" and changing the name of 
the Committee to "MonmouthNJ 250 Committee."

10. Township of Little Egg Harbor, Resolution No. 2024-100 opposing Senate Bill 2347 
and 1106 regarding the development of accessory dwelling units.

11. Borough of South Toms River, Resolution No. 2024-80 proclaiming the week of 
April 21-27, 2024 as National Volunteer Week.

Q. MINUTES AND MEETING NOTICES

1. OC Cultural & Heritage Commission Meeting Minutes of 2/20/2024.

2. OC Planning Board Meeting Minutes of 3/20/2024.

3. OC Mental Health Board Meeting Minutes of 3/11/2024.

4. OC Tourism & Business Advisory Council Meeting Minutes of 3/11/2024.

5. OC Advisory Commission on the Status of Women Meeting Minutes of 3/12/2024.

6. OC Board of Health Meeting Minutes of 4/10/2024.

7. OC Utilities Authority Special Meeting Notice of 4/8/2024.

8. OC Mental Health Board Special Meeting Notice of 4/18/2024.

R. REPORTS

1. OC Supplemental Debt Statement dated 4/16/2024 for Ordinances to be introduced 
on 4/17/2024.

S. CORRESPONDENCE
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1. Notice of Filing and Public Hearing in the matter of the petition of Public Service 
Electric and Gas Company for approval of changes in its electric green programs 
recovery charge and its gas green programs recovery charge, BPU Docket Nos. 
ER23070423 & GR23070424.

2. Notice of Filing and Public Hearings in the matter of the petition of Public Service 
Electric and Gas Company's for approval of incremental COVID-19 costs for 
recovery through a new special-purpose clause, and for authorization to recover 
uncollectible costs for gas through the societal benefits charge, BPU Docket No. 
GR23070448.

T. COMMISSIONER COMMENTS

U. PUBLIC COMMENTS - "Comments from members of the audience are invited at this time 
with a limit of five (5) minutes per speaker."

V. ADJOURNMENT
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	RESOLUTIONS
	Authorizing the Personnel Resolution.
	Authorizing the cancellation of capital account balances that are no longer needed.
	Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled AKC Reunite Adopt a K-9 Cop FY24, in the amount of $7,500.00, with matching funds in the amount of $2,500.00.
	Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled National Crime Victims' Rights Week Community Awareness Project FY24, in the amount of $4,992.00.
	Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled HUD: CDBG Program Income FY24, in the amount of $15,449.00.
	Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled Law Enforcement Officers Training & Equipment, in the amount of $28,319.00.
	Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled United States Marshals Service FY23/24, in the amount of $30,000.00.
	Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled HUD: HOME Program Income FY24, in the amount of $43,737.00.
	Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled Schedule "C" Planning, Account No. 016-155-4636, in the amount of $70,000.00.
	Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled Next Generation 9-1-1 Grant FY24, in the amount of $233,682.00.
	Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled Insurance Fraud Program FY24, in the amount of $300,000.00.
	Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled National Sexual Assault Kit Initiative FY23, in the amount of $500,000.00.
	Authorizing an amendment to the 2024 Budget for the program entitled Barnegat Branch Trail IX FY24, in the amount of $929,000.00.
	Authorizing the execution of a Grant Application to the State of New Jersey, Department of Law and Public Safety, Office of the Attorney General for the STOP Violence Against Women Act (VAWA) Program, for the period of 7/1/2024 through 6/30/2025.
	Authorizing the OC Prosecutor to submit an electronic Grant Application to the United States Department of Justice, Office of Justice Programs, Bureau of Justice Assistance for the BJA FY24 Prosecuting Cold Cases Using DNA Initiative.
	Authorizing the OC Prosecutor to submit an on-line Grant Application to the United States Department of Justice, Office of Community Oriented Policing Services for the FY24 Law Enforcement Mental Health and Wellness Act (LEMHWA) Implementation Projects.
	Authorizing the OC Prosecutor to submit an on-line Grant Application to the United States Department of Justice, Office on Violence Against Women (OVW) for the OVW FY24 Local Law Enforcement Grants for Enforcement of Cybercrimes Program.
	Authorizing the OC Prosecutor to submit an on-line Grant Application to the United States Department of Veterans Affairs for the FY24 Staff Sergeant Fox Suicide Prevention Program.
	Authorizing the execution of a Memorandum of Agreement with a Forensic Nurse Examiner for the OC Prosecutor's Office Sexual Assault Response Team, the Domestic Violence Strangulation Response Team and the Forensic Nurse Examiner Program (S.A.R.T/D.V.S.R.T./F.N.E.), for the period of 5/15/2024 through 9/30/2024.
	Authorizing the execution of a Deferred Loan Agreement under the CDBG Housing Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the OC Planning Director. (C2024-63)
	Authorizing the execution of thirty-one (31) Shared Services Agreements with various municipalities through the Prosecutor's F.A.S.T. Program, for the period of 1/1/2024 through 12/31/2024.
	Authorizing the use of FY2021 and FY2022 HOME funds for the FY2024 OC First-Time Homebuyer Activities. (CC2024-62)
	Authorizing the use of competitive contracting procedures for Traumatic Loss Coalition Coordinator Services for the OC Department of Human Services.
	Authorizing the use of competitive contracting procedures for Acquisition for Innovations to Address Homelessness for the OC Department of Human Services.
	Authorizing the use of competitive contracting procedures for Young Adult Bridge Housing for the OC Department of Human Services.
	Authorizing a Mortgage and Mortgage Note Modification Agreement and a Deferred Loan Agreement Modification under CDBG Housing Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the OC Planning Director. (C2024-40)
	Authorizing a Mortgage and Mortgage Note Modification Agreement and a Deferred Loan Agreement Modification under CDBG Housing Rehabilitation Program, as recommended by the OC Planning Director. (C2024-45)
	Authorizing an amendment to the OC First Time Homebuyer Program, to include new participants, as recommended by the OC Planning Director. (CC2022-85)
	Authorizing an Amendment to the OC Water Quality Management Program (WQMP) to include Block 42, portion of Lot 4, Colts Neck Township.
	Authorizing the Release of Bonds for Road Opening Permits.

	MOTIONS
	Authorizing the Clerk of the Board to accept and/or record legal instruments.
	Approving the Board Meeting Minutes of 3/20/2024.
	Approving the Pre-Board Meeting Minutes of 3/27/2024.
	Approving the Master Payroll paid on 4/10/2024 for the payroll period of 3/14/2024 through 3/27/2024, with Elected Officials paid to date, in the amount of $6,177,432.79.
	Approving the distribution of Requests for Qualifications and/or Requests for Proposals, as follows: 1) New Jersey Government Law Books and Legal Products; and 2) Leasing of Vehicles for Use by the Ocean County Prosecutor's Office.

	TRAFFIC SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS
	Authorizing the establishment of Temporary Construction Speed Limits for all directions of traffic along County Road #24 (Route 527-Cedar Swamp Road) and County Road #9 (Route 526 - East and West Commodore Boulevard) at the intersection, Township of Jackson.
	Authorizing the removal of all Weight Limit Restrictions on Bridge #1516009, known as Otis Bog Bridge (Otis Bog Road over Giffords Mill Branch of Tuckerton Creek), Township of Little Egg Harbor.
	Authorizing the removal of all Weight Limit Restrictions on Bridge #1506013, known as Duck Farm Bridge (Hooper Avenue over Cedar Bridge Branch of the Metedeconk River), Township of Brick.
	Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #9 (Route 526-East County Line Road-Lanes Mills Road) and County Road #24 (Route 623-Ridge Avenue), Township of Lakewood. (LKWD-7)
	Authorizing the revision of a Traffic Signal at the intersection of County Road #11 (Route 549-Hooper Avenue) and County Road #94 (Oak Avenue), Township of Toms River. (DVR-17)
	Authorizing an Agreement with the Township of Lakewood for the installation and operation of a traffic signal at the intersection of County Road #5 (Route 528 - Lakewood-New Egypt Road) and Gudz Road and Old Whitesville Road, Township of Lakewood. (LKWD-79)
	Authorizing an Amended Agreement with the Township of Jackson for the installation of a battery backup system for the traffic signal at the intersection of County Road #9 (County Line Road) and County Road #10 (Bennetts Mills Road)/Shopping Plaza Drive, Township of Jackson. (JK-6)
	Authorizing an Amended Agreement with the Township of Jackson for the installation of a battery backup system for the traffic signal at the intersection of County Road #9 (County Line Road) and County Road #12 (New Prospect Road), Township of Jackson. (JK-7)
	Authorizing an Amended Agreement with the Township of Jackson for the installation of a battery backup system for the traffic signal at the intersection of County Road #9 (County Line Road) and Brewers Bridge Road, Township of Jackson. (JK-9)
	Authorizing an Amended Agreement with the Township of Jackson for the installation of a battery backup system for the traffic signal at the intersection of County Road #9 (County Line Road) and Villanova Boulevard, Township of Jackson. (JK-10)
	Authorizing an Amended Agreement with the Township of Jackson for the installation of a battery backup system for the traffic signal at the intersection of County Road #12 (New Prospect Road) and County Road #10 (Aldrich Road)/County Road #10 (Bennetts Mills Road), Township of Jackson. (JK-11)
	Authorizing an Amended Agreement with the Township of Jackson for the installation of a battery backup system for the traffic signal at the intersection of County Road #12 (New Prospect Road) and Woodlane Road, Township of Jackson. (JK-12)

	BID AWARDS
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of SUPPLEMENTARY VEHICLE TOWING AND ROADSIDE SERVICES to Priced Rite Auto Repair & Towing, Inc. and Thomas Makuch LLC, dba Accurate Towing Service, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2024-50)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES to Plastic Express, Inc. and The Hungry Puppy, the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were received on Item Nos. 43, 44, 45, 46, 47, 48, 49, 50, 51, 52, 53, 54, 57, 58, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74, 75, 76, 77, 78, 79, 80, 81, 82, 83, 84, 85, 86, 90, 91, 92, 93, 94, 95, 96, 97, 98, 99, 100, 101, 102, 103, 106, 107, 108, 109, 110, 111, 112, 113, 114, 115, 116, 117, 118, 122, 123, 125, 127, 128, 129, 131, 132 and 133. All no bid items will be rebid. Item Nos. 141 will be rebid to obtain additional vendors. (B2024-54)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS, AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES NO. II to Mivila Foods, the sole qualified bidder. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 23, 35, 48, 51, 75, 76, 79, 80, 87, 219, 246, 252, 280 and 283. Recommendation is made to authorize the County Purchasing Agent to enter into a negotiated contract, in accordance with N.J.S.A. 40A:11-5(3) as no responsive bids were received for a second time on all rejected items. (B2024-60)
	Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of SURVEILLANCE EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES to Crime Point Inc, the sole qualified bidder. (B2024-72)
	Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER TO A.T. Northern New Jersey, LLC; Bellmawr Truck Repair Co., Inc.; Campbell Freightliner, LLC; Cherry Valley Tractor; Foley, Incorporated; Groff Tractor Mid Atlantic, LLC DBA GT Mid Atlantic; H.A. Dehart & Son, Inc.; Johnson & Towers, LLC; On-Site Fleet Service, Inc.; and Thomas Makuch, LLC DBA Accurate Towing Service, the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were received on Item Nos. 3, 4, 8, 11, 12, 17, 18, 19, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 29, 31, 34, 38, 41, 44, 45, 49, 50, 52, 53, 60, 66, 67, 68, 72, 73, 74, 76, 77, 78 and 80. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 1, 5, 15, 16, 28, 30, 33, 37, 47, 51 and 79. All no bid and rejected items will be rebid. Item Nos. 2, 6, 7, 9, 10, 20, 26, 27, 32, 35, 36, 39, 40, 42, 43, 46, 54, 58, 62, 63, 64, 65, 75, 81, 82, 83, 85, 86, 87 and 88 will be rebid to obtain additional vendors. (B2024-48)
	Rejecting the sole bid for the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS EQUIPMENT FOR THE ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT-TRAFFIC DIVISION NO. II as unresponsive. Recommendation is made to authorize the County Purchasing Agent to enter into negotiated contracts in accordance with N.J.S.A. 40A:11-5(3) for all no bid and rejected Item Nos. 33, 34, 35, 99, 100, 101, 102, 103, 104 105, 106, 107, 108, 109, 110, 111, 112, 113, 114, 115, 116, 117, 118, 120, 121, 122, 123, 124, 125, 126, 127, 128, 129, 130, 131, 132, 133, 134, 135, 136, 137, 138, 139, 140, 141, 142, 143, 144, 145, 146, 147, 148, 149, 150, 151, 152, 153, 154, 155, 156, 157, 158, 159, 160, 161, 162, 163, 164, 165, 166, 167, 168, 169, 170, 171, 172, 173, 174, 175, 176, 177, 178, 181, 182, 184, 185, 211, 212, 213, 214, 215, 216, 217, 218, 219, 220, 221, 222, 223, 224, 225, 226, 227, 228, 229, 233 ,236, 239, 245, 255, 256, 276, 280, 286, 287, 290, 301, 311, 312, 313, 314, 315, 316, 317, 318, 319, 320, 321, 322, 323, 324, 325, 326, 327, 363, 390, 393, 414, 415, 429, 430, 431, 432, 433, 434, 435, 436, 437, 438, 439, 440, 441, 442, 443, 444, 445, 446, 447, 448, 449, 450, 451, 452, 453, 454, 455, 456, 457, 458, 459, 460, 461, 462, 463, 464, 465, 466, 467, 468, 469, 470, 471, 472, 473, 474, 475, 476, 477, 478, 479, 480, 481, 482, 483, 484, 485, 486, 487, 488, 489, 490, 491, 492, 493, 494, 495, 496, 497, 498, 499, 500, 501, 502, 503, 504, 505, 506, 507, 508, 509, 510, 511, 512, 513, 514, 515, 516, 517, 518, 519, 520, 521, 522, 523, 524, 525, 526, 527, 528, 529, 530, 531, 532, 533, 534, 535, 536, 537, 538, 539, 551, as no responsive bids were received for a second time.
	Awarding a Contract for the REPLACEMENT OF HURRICANE BRIDGE, STRUCTURE NO. 1518-012, WHITING-NEW EGYPT ROAD (C.R. 539) OVER OLD HURRICANE BROOK, MANCHESTER TOWNSHIP, to Marbro, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder, in an amount not to exceed $1,447,117.00. (B2024-69E)
	Awarding a Contract for the RECONSTRUCTION AND RESURFACING OF LACEY ROAD (C.R. 614) FROM THE GARDEN STATE PARKWAY TO ROUTE 9, TOWNSHIP OF LACEY, NO. II, to Earle Asphalt Company, the lowest qualified bidder, in an amount not to exceed $2,050,013.13. (B2024-73E)

	CHANGE ORDERS
	Awarding Change Order No. 1 to Wu & Associates, Inc. for the project entitled Outbuildings Rehabilitation & Exterior Repairs at the Mary Etta Cox House, Barnegat Township, NJ, an increase to the contract in the amount of $31,766.86. (B2023-129CE)
	Awarding Change Order No. 16 to Epic Management, Inc. for the project entitled DEVELOPMENT & CONSTRUCTION OF THE SOCIAL SERVICES COMPLEX, an increase to the contract in the amount of $389,199.71. (B2021-33CE)
	P & A CONSTRUCTION, INC. - Reconstruction of Cross Street, Route 626, from Augusta Boulevard to State Highway Route 9, Township of Lakewood - Change Order #3, E-$532,095.47, R-$28,245.00. (B2023-100E)
	EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Construction of Traffic Signal at James Street (C.R. 32) and Williams Street, Township of Lakewood - Change Order #1, E-$173,381.90, R-$48,245.79. (B2021-55E)
	EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY - Replacement of Clubhouse Culvert, Structure No. 1518-025, Morningside Street over Union Branch of Toms River, Manchester Township - Change Order #1, E-$29,789.70, R-$23,709.22. (B2023-85E)

	CONTRACTS
	Awarding a Competitive Contract to O.C.E.A.N., Inc. for Administration of the First-Time Homebuyer Activities FY2024, in the amount not to exceed $96,000.00, for the period of two (2) years. (CC2024-62)
	Awarding an Agreement to Facility Strategies, LLC to provide Move Management Consulting Services for the period of one (1) year or until services are complete, in an amount not to exceed $191,450.00 (PP2024-65).
	Awarding a Contract to Miller Auto Leasing Company to provide Voting Machine Transportation Services, for the period of 5/1/2024 through 4/30/2026, in an amount not to exceed $90,000.00. (CP2024-64)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to Owen, Little and Associates, Inc. to provide Land Surveying Services associated with the acquisition of Block 65, Lot 6 and 6Q, Little Egg Harbor Township, in an amount not to exceed $10,726.83. (QP2023-49)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to Diversified Storage Solutions for warehouse storage of high-density filing systems for the Social Services Complex, for the period of 4/2024 through 10/2024, in an amount not to exceed $42,000.00.
	Awarding a Purchase Order to SHI International Corp. (NJ Cooperative Purchasing Alliance CK04, Sub Contract No. 22-24) to provide the Regroup Mass Notification Network for the OC Sheriff's Office, in an amount not to exceed $60,174.74.
	Amending the award of an Extraordinary, Unspecifiable Services Contract with V-Comm, LLC to provide additional expert witness consultation and reporting for the Prosecutor's Office, an increase to the contract in the amount of $1,710.00. (P2023-43)
	Qualifying four (4) firms as eligible to provide Consultant Material Sampling, Inspection and Testing Services for Various Projects in Ocean County, on a project specific proposal basis, for the period of 4/22/2024 through 4/21/2025, as follows: French & Parrello Associates, P.A.; ATANE Engineers, Architects and Land Surveyors, P.C.; Colliers Engineering & Design, Inc.; and Keegan Technology & Testing Assoc., Inc. t/a Key-Tech. (QP2024-66)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to Dewberry Engineers, Inc. to provide On-Call Traffic Engineering Professional Services for the Reconstruction of Double Trouble Road (Route 619) and Garden State Parkway Interchange 77, Berkeley Township, in an amount not to exceed $170,537.40. (QP2024-50)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to Colliers Engineering & Design, Inc. to provide Consultant Material Sampling, Inspection and Testing Services for the Replacement of Dover Road Bridges (Structure No. 1512-006 and 1512-007), Dover Road (C.R. 618) over Tributary to Middle Branch of Cedar Creek, Lacey Township, in an amount not to exceed $30,610.00. (QP2023-68)
	Awarding a Purchase Order to Keegan Technology & Testing Associates, Inc. dba Key-Tech to provide Consultant Material Sampling, Inspection and Testing Services for the Reconstruction and Resurfacing of Dock Road (C.R. 602) from State Route 9 to Barnegat Bay, Eagleswood Township, in an amount not to exceed $7,510.00. (QP2023-68)

	APPOINTMENTS AND REAPPOINTMENTS
	Appointing DiAnne C. Gove as a member of the OC College Board of Trustees, to fill the unexpired term of Carl Verner Thulin, Jr., term to expire 12/19/2024.
	Reappointing Alan W. Avery, Jr., Toms River as a member of the New Jersey Pinelands Commission, for a term of three (3) years, term to expire 6/28/2027.
	Reappointing Harry L. Larkin, Jr., M.D. to the position of Assistant OC Medical Examiner for a term of one (1) year, commencing 5/1/2024 through 4/30/2025.

	RECEIVED ITEMS
	RESOLUTIONS FROM GOVERNING BODIES
	County of Monmouth, Resolution No. 2024-0262 authorizing the Director of the Monmouth County Board of County Commissioners to execute a New Jersey Department of Community Affairs Application for a Local Efficiency Achievement Program (LEAP) Grant.
	OC Library Commission, Resolution dated 2/20/2024 approving the 2024-2028 Strategic Plan for the OC Library System.
	OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 121(24) proclaiming May 5-11, 2024 as National Hurricane Preparedness Week.
	OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 122(24) proclaiming May 6-12, 2024 as National Nurses Week.
	OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 123(24) proclaiming May 8, 2024 as National School Nurse Day.
	OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 124(24) proclaiming May 2024 as National Stroke Awareness Month.
	OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 125(24) proclaiming May 2024 as National Melanoma/Skin Cancer Detection and Prevention Month.
	OC Board of Health, Resolution No. 126(24) proclaiming May 2024 as National High Blood Pressure Education Month.
	County of Monmouth, Resolution No. 2024-0308 establishing the logo and "catch phrase" for the "America 250-MonmouthNJ Committee" and changing the name of the Committee to "MonmouthNJ 250 Committee."
	Township of Little Egg Harbor, Resolution No. 2024-100 opposing Senate Bill 2347 and 1106 regarding the development of accessory dwelling units.
	Borough of South Toms River, Resolution No. 2024-80 proclaiming the week of April 21-27, 2024 as National Volunteer Week.

	MINUTES AND MEETING NOTICES
	OC Cultural & Heritage Commission Meeting Minutes of 2/20/2024.
	OC Planning Board Meeting Minutes of 3/20/2024.
	OC Mental Health Board Meeting Minutes of 3/11/2024.
	OC Tourism & Business Advisory Council Meeting Minutes of 3/11/2024.
	OC Advisory Commission on the Status of Women Meeting Minutes of 3/12/2024.
	OC Board of Health Meeting Minutes of 4/10/2024.
	OC Utilities Authority Special Meeting Notice of 4/8/2024.
	OC Mental Health Board Special Meeting Notice of 4/18/2024.

	REPORTS
	OC Supplemental Debt Statement dated 4/16/2024 for Ordinances to be introduced on 4/17/2024.

	CORRESPONDENCE
	Notice of Filing and Public Hearing in the matter of the petition of Public Service Electric and Gas Company for approval of changes in its electric green programs recovery charge and its gas green programs recovery charge, BPU Docket Nos. ER23070423 & GR23070424.
	Notice of Filing and Public Hearings in the matter of the petition of Public Service Electric and Gas Company's for approval of incremental COVID-19 costs for recovery through a new special-purpose clause, and for authorization to recover uncollectible costs for gas through the societal benefits charge, BPU Docket No. GR23070448.

	COMMISSIONER COMMENTS
	PUBLIC COMMENTS - "Comments from members of the audience are invited at this time with a limit of five (5) minutes per speaker."
	ADJOURNMENT


